
IN THE SUPREME COURT OF VICTORIA AT MELBOURNE 
COMMON LAW DIVISION

No. 4538 of 2012

BETWEEN:

KATHERINE ROWE Plaintiff

and

AUSNET ELECTRICITY SERVICES PTY LTD 
(ACN 064 651 118)
& ORS (according to the schedule of parties) Defendants

(by original proceeding)

AND BETWEEN:

AUSNET ELECTRICITY SERVICES PTY LTD
(ACN 064 651 118) Plaintiff by Counterclaim

And

(ACN 060 674 580)
& ORS (according to the schedule of parties) Defendants by Counterclaim

(by counterclaim)

AFFIDAVIT OF ANDREW JOHN WATSON

Date of Document: 2 May 2023
Filed on behalf of: The Plaintiff
Prepared by:
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne Vic 3000

Solicitor’s Code: 564
Tel: (03) 9605 2700
DX: 466 Melbourne
Ref: AW/3052534
E: kadey@mauriceblackburn.com.au

I, Andrew John Watson, Solicitor, of Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street, Melbourne in the State 

of Victoria, make oath and say as follows:

1. I am a Principal in the firm of Maurice Blackburn Pty Ltd (Maurice Blackburn), the 

solicitors for the Plaintiff in this proceeding and pursuant to the Orders of this Court 

dated 27 May 2015 I am the Scheme Administrator in this proceeding.
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2. I make this affidavit from my own knowledge unless otherwise stated. Where 

statements are not made from my own knowledge, they are made to the best of my 

information and belief after due enquiry and I have set out the source of my 

information.

3. Exhibited and marked “AJW-1” is a bundle of documents referred to in this affidavit. 

Exhibited and marked “AJW-2” is a confidential exhibit. Any reference to material 

exhibited to this affidavit will be by reference to the page number.

4. I make this affidavit for the purpose of providing the Court with an update on:

(a) the progress made in relation to the personal injury and dependency (“l-D”) 
settlement distribution;

(b) the progress made in relation to the economic loss and property damage 

(“ELPD”) settlement distribution;

(c) communications with claimants;

(d) amounts set aside for contingency;

(e) residual distribution sum amounts;

(f) taxation issues affecting the Distribution Sum; and

(g) the settlement administration costs.

5. The team of lawyers, paralegals and legal assistants employed by Maurice Blackburn 

who are working on the administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme 

(Scheme) are referred to in this affidavit as the SDS Team.

6. All references to the affidavit of Andrew J Watson sworn on 1 March 2018 will be 

marked as the March 2018 affidavit.

PROGRESS IN RELATION TO l-D SETTLEMENT DISTRIBUTION

7. All l-D claimants have received their compensation and presented their cheques.
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PROGRESS IN RELATION TO ELPD SETTLEMENT DISTRIBUTION

Remaining distributions

8. There are 872 above-insurance claimants entitled to receive compensation in the 

ELPD settlement distribution. At the time of swearing the March 2018 affidavit, there 

were 5 ELPD payments which remained to be processed by the SDS Team and the 

total combined value of the claims not yet paid was $313,010.02.

9. Since then, all those claimants have received their compensation and presented their 

cheques.

COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLAIMANTS

Correspondence

10. Since the March 2018 affidavit, the only substantive aspect of the Scheme which has 

progressed has been the dispute with the Australian Taxation Office (ATO). The SDS 

Team have sent correspondence to group members who received compensation in 

the proceeding to keep them updated on the taxation dispute on the following dates:

(a) 13 April 2018;

(b) 29 June 2018;

(c) 3 December 2018;

(d) 1 March 2019;

(e) 18 March 2019;

(f) 29 May 2020;

(g) 7 August 2020; and

(h) 30 October 2020.

The template correspondence sent to group members since the March 2018 affidavit 

is at pages 13 to 26 of this affidavit.
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Final Report

11. I caused to be prepared a document referred to as the Final Report into the Kilmore- 

East Kinglake and Murrindindi-Marysville Black Saturday Class Action Settlement 

Administrations (Final Report) and filed that document with the Court by my 

affidavit dated 23 November 2018.

12. Costs reports prepared by the Australian Law Cost Group (ALCG) referred to in the 

Final Report were also provided to the Court by the following affidavits filed in this 

matter:

(a) Affidavit of Fiona Elizabeth Mullen dated 7 September 2017; and

(b) Affidavit of Catherine Mary Dealehr dated 7 September 2017.

13. A description of the Final Report and directions as to where it can be accessed were 

provided to group members in the group member update letter dated 3 December 

2018.

14. The costs of the preparation of the Final Report, including the costs of the Deloitte 

Report and the ALCG Report, were borne entirely by Maurice Blackburn and have 

not been passed on to group members in either of the Kilmore-East Kinglake or 

Murrindindi bushfire class actions.

Enquiries from group members

15. The SDS Team is continuing to respond to written and telephone enquiries from 

group members regarding various aspects of the settlement distribution process, 

their compensation and the ongoing taxation dispute.

CONTINGENCY FUNDS

16. I refer paragraph 50 of my affidavit dated 28 February 2017. The amount of 

$750,000.00 was set aside from the distribution sum in contingency of any errors in 

the pro-rata calculation.

17. Given that the settlement distribution process was completed a number of years ago 

and there has been no call on the amount set aside, I propose that it be absorbed 

back into the distribution sum.
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RESIDUAL DISTRIBUTION SUM AMOUNTS

18. In my March 2018 affidavit at paragraphs 26 to 35, I deposed that a residual sum of

$775,696.72 existed in the distribution sum which comprised of:

(a) $750,000.00 set aside in contingency referred to in paragraph 15 of this 

affidavit;

(b) $23,172.41 of interest which was not distributed;

(c) An amount of $2,200 for l-D review costs that were not accounted for in the l-D 

or ELPD distribution sum calculations; and

(d) An amount of $324.31 which was paid to a group member who requested that 

the SDS Team cancel their cheque because they did not wish to receive the 

amount.

TAXATION ISSUES

19. I refer to paragraphs 38 to 42 of the March 2018 affidavit and to Confidential Exhibit 

AJW-6 to that affidavit. I and other members of the SDS Team continued to work 

closely with our legal advisors PricewaterhouseCoopers (PwC) and counsel on the 

taxation issues relating to the settlement administration until the matter was concluded 

on 14 October 2020.

20. Now produced and shown to me marked “Confidential Exhibit AJW-2” is a 

confidential note regarding the taxation issues and the steps taken since the March 

2018 affidavit. I make an application for this exhibit to be confidential to ensure the 

maintenance of privilege in information and material relevant to the taxation 

proceeding.

21. Without waiving privilege, I can state:

(a) The dispute with the taxation office was heard before Justice Middleton of the 

Federal Court of Australia on 13 November 2018.

(b) His Honour handed down a decision dismissing the application of the Scheme 

Administrator on 28 February 2019.

(c) The Scheme Administrator filed a Notice of Appeal in respect of the decision on 

18 March 2018. The proceeding number for the appeal is VID243/2019.
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(d) The appeal was heard before Justices Kenny, Davies and Thawley of the Full 

Federal Court on 22 August 2019. Their Honours handed down a decision 

dismissing the appeal of the Scheme Administrator on 27 May 2020. The 

Scheme Administrator lodged an application for special leave to appeal to the 

High Court of Australia on 24 June 2020. On 14 October 2020 the High Court 

handed down its decision and denied the application for special leave to appeal.

22. The overwhelming proportion of recent costs were expended on the legal work 

regarding the Scheme’s taxation, including litigation outlined above.

23. Following the decision of the Full Federal Court, I instructed PwC to approach the 

ATO regarding the Scheme’s ability to register for GST and claim credits (I had 

previously been advised by PwC to wait until the outcome of the income tax litigation 

before making such an approach). Initial discussions with the ATO indicated that 

they had the view the Scheme was not eligible to register for and claim GST credits. 

In those circumstances and in light of the reasoning of the Federal Court in the 

judgments regarding income tax issues I instructed PwC to take no further steps 

regarding GST liability.

24. I have lodged tax returns for the Scheme up to and including FY2020 and tax has 

been paid. The ATO has remitted general interest charge and penalties in full.

25. PwC has advised that the Scheme Administrator will be required to lodge tax returns 

for FY2021 and 2022, which are outstanding. PwC estimates that tax of 

approximately $24,000 in total will need to be paid across both years.

SETTLEMENT ADMINISTRATION COSTS

Currently outstanding fees and disbursements

26. Finalised itemised invoices for settlement administration fees and disbursements for 

work carried out between 1 December 2017 and 28 February 2023 are at pages 27 

to 526 of this affidavit.

27. In previous affidavits, I have set out extensive details regarding the nature of the work 

performed by the SDS Team and the disbursements incurred by the Scheme.

28. Naturally, the majority of the previous work undertaken by the SDS Team has not 

been required during the current period because assessments have been completed 

and all compensation monies has been distributed to group members. The
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outstanding work which has been undertaken since the March 2018 affidavit 

includes as follows:

(a) General work:

i) Liaising with and instructing PwC on the conduct and progress of the 

taxation litigation, including substantive work to assist PwC and 

reviewing PwC’s billing of the matter;

ii) Drafting affidavit material to update the Supreme Court of Victoria on 

progress of the Settlement Administration and the taxation dispute;

iii) Preparation for the Case Management Conference on 20 March 2018;

iv) Preparing bulk correspondence to group members regarding the 

ongoing taxation dispute and updating Maurice Blackburn website to 

reflect progress;

v) Responding to specific group member enquiries regarding the ongoing 

taxation dispute and other non-claim-specific matters;

vi) Ongoing liaison with KPMG regarding the auditing requirements of the 

Scheme;

vii) Ongoing liaison with John White, Special Referee for Costs, regarding 

the preparation of costs reports;

viii) Managing the investment of the distribution funds in term deposits, as 

required under the terms of the Scheme;

ix) Reconciling accounts, including the preparation and review of 

summaries of unpresented cheques and outstanding distributions;

x) Reviewing and managing the costs and billing of the Scheme including 

preparing material to update the Scheme Administrator about progress 

versus budgets;

xi) Taking preparatory steps to ensure that the Scheme could affect a 

potential second distribution in the event that we succeeded in the 

taxation dispute litigation at first instance; and
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xii) Correspondence with the Supreme Court of Victoria regarding 

publication of material on the Supreme Court of Victoria website, 

communication with group members, case management hearings and 

the filing of materials.

(b) l-D work:

i) Dealing with enquiries from claimants on matters including the 

following:

1. The interplay between l-D compensation and other statutory 

entitlements including Department of Veteran Affairs 

payments; and

2. General enquiries about l-D assessments and 
compensation amounts.

(c) ELPD work:

i) Attending to outstanding payments where probate issues or allocation 

disputes prevented distribution, including the drafting of documents to 

facilitate distribution agreements;

ii) Reviewing information on claimants who had failed to present their 

cheques in a timely manner and directing communications to those 

claimants;

iii) Effecting payments of compensation where it had been previously 

withheld and became payable, including the necessary trust 

accounting;

iv) Communications with claimants and their solicitors regarding their 

entitlement to compensation and the terms of distribution; and

v) Responding to various claimant enquiries.

29. Subject to the Court receiving a satisfactory report from Mr White, I now seek 

approval for Maurice Blackburn to be paid $1,332,855.20 for settlement 

administration fees and disbursements incurred for the period 1 December 2017 

until 28 February 2023, composed of:

402328074.5
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(a) $721,474.96 for the settlement administration fees and disbursements 

incurred for the period 1 December 2017 to 31 March 2019; and

(b) $611,380.32 for the settlement administration fees and disbursements 

incurred for the period 1 April 2019 to 28 February 2023.

30. Plus $40,150 for the Fifth Costs report of independent costs referee John White.

Future costs

31. I consider that the Scheme will continue to incur liabilities until it is finalised. The 

overwhelming proportion of any future costs will be the costs expended on a second 

distribution if such a course is required.

32. I estimate future costs to be incurred in finalising the Scheme, excluding costs of a 

second distribution, to consist of the following:

(a) $6,050 in fees from PwC for preparation and lodgement of outstanding tax 

returns as per paragraph 25 above; and

(b) $25,000 for General Costs incurred by lawyers overseeing the remaining 

settlement administration processes until finalisation of the Scheme by June 

2023. This estimate assumes that there is no further distribution to Group 

Members.

33. I seek approval for the payment of up to $31,050 in future settlement administration 

costs.

BALANCE IN SETTLEMENT FUND

34. The current balance of the Settlement Account is $2,079,695.73. I estimate that 

after the deduction of outstanding fees and disbursements as well as the estimated 

costs for a potential further distribution and conclusion of the Administration, there 

will be approximately $523,815.50 left in the fund.

35. This amount is calculated as follows:

Current Balance in Settlement Account $2,079,695.73

less

Unbilled fees and disbursements (1 Dec
2017 to 28 February 2023)

$1,332,855.28
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Balance remaining after payment of 
unbilled costs to 28 February 2023

$746,840.45

Less

Report of John White, Special
Referee for Costs referred to in 
paragraph 31(c) above

$40,150

PwC disbursements referred to in 
paragraph 33(a) above $6,050

Estimated costs to conclude
Administration referred to in 
paragraph 33(b) above

$25,000

Payment of Tax liability referred to in 
paragraph 24 above $24,000

Residual Sum $651,640.45

36. There are two options for dealing with the balance of the fund (Residual Sum):

(a) A second distribution to group members; or

(b) Donation of the Residual Sum to an appropriate charitable institution.

37. If a second distribution is made, further costs will necessarily be incurred in that 

distribution. The original distribution was made by cheque mailed to group member 

addresses. The costs associated with this mechanism of distribution would likely be 

disproportionate to the amount distributed. If any further distribution was made the 

Scheme Administrator would recommend the residual sum is shared equally 

amongst the group members, avoiding the need for complicated assessments and 

calculations.

38. To deliver this outcome, the Scheme Administrator would conduct a simplified 

process, to minimise associated costs and to deliver the maximum benefit to the 

group members. Nonetheless, I estimate the costs associated with a further 

distribution are likely to be approximately $127,825 (incl GST). The details of the 

proposed distribution process and estimated costs is at pages 527 to 530 of this 

affidavit.

39. If this approach is adopted, there would be approximately $523,815 to distribute to 

group members. I estimate each group member will receive approximately $250. If

402328074.5
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the Court agrees with this approach, I seek a direction under Clause J1 of the 

Scheme to proceed on this basis.

40. I note that:

(a) a second distribution is likely to consume approximately 20% of the Residual 

Sum in further costs of distribution;

(b) group members were advised in the correspondence of 30 October 2020 that 

it was unlikely a further distribution would be made; and

(c) no express power exists under the Scheme to consider alternatives to making 

a second distribution to group members.

41. In these circumstances, the Court may wish to consider making a direction under 

Clause J1 of the Scheme to donate the residual sum to one or more appropriate 

charitable institutions. If the Court were inclined to consider this approach, the Court 

may wish to consider donating the residual sum to the Australian Red Cross and/or 

Foundation Murrindindi. Foundation Murrindindi is a registered charity formed in 

2012 by the local residents to help the communities recover from the Black Saturday 

Bushfires. The Foundation provides grants for various community initiatives. The 

SDS team has spoken to Lead Applicant, Kathy Rowe who supports the proposal for 

a donation to Foundation Murrindindi. Information regarding Foundation Murrindindi 

is at pages 531 to 551 of this affidavit.

SWORN by the deponent at 

Melbourne in the State of Victoria 
this ^ day of May 2023

FILED on behalf of the Plaintiff

Before me:

of 380 La Trobe Street, Melbourne 
an Australian Legal Practitioner 

within the meaning of the 
Legal Profession Uniform Law (Victoria)
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IN THE SUPREME COURT OF VICTORIA AT MELBOURNE 
COMMON LAW DIVISION

BETWEEN:

KATHERINE ROWE

and

AUSNET ELECTRICITY SERVICES PTY LTD 
(ACN 064 651 118)
& ORS (according to the schedule of parties)

(by original proceeding)

No. 4538 of 2012

Plaintiff

Defendants

AND BETWEEN:

AUSNET ELECTRICITY SERVICES PTY LTD
(ACN 064 651 118) Plaintiff by Counterclaim

And

(ACN 060 674 580)
& ORS (according to the schedule of parties) Defendants by Counterclaim

(by counterclaim)

CERTIFICATE IDENTIFYING EXHIBIT

Date of Document:
Filed on behalf of:
Prepared by:
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne Vic 3000

2 May 2023 
The Plaintiff

Solicitor’s Code: 564 
Tel: (03) 9605 2700
DX: 466 Melbourne
Ref: AW/3052534
E: kadey@mauriceblackburn.com.au

This is the exhibit marked 'Exhibit AJW-T 

at thp timg of swearing his affidavit on ,

produced and shown to Andrew John Watson 

May 2023 before me:

Exhibit ‘AJW-1’
Correspondence sent to group members since the March 2018

Finalised itemised invoices for settlement administration fees and disbursements for work carried out between
1 December 2017 and 28 February 2023

of 380 La Trobe Street, Melbourne 
an Australian Legal Practitioner 

meaning of the
Legal Profession Uniform Law (Victoria)

details of the proposed distribution process and estimated costs 

Information about Foundation Murrindindi
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Our Ref: AJW/3052534 
T:  1800 18 26 45 
F:  (03) 9258 9610 
E: murrindindica@mauriceblackburn.com.au 
 
13 April 2018 
 
«Contact_First_Name» «Contact_Last_Name» 
«Contact_Street_Address_1» 
«Contact_Street_Address_2» 
«Contact_Suburb» «Contact_State» «Contact_Post_Code» 
 
By email – «Contact_Email» 
 
Dear «Contact_First_Name», 
 
Murrindindi Bushfire Class Action Settlement Administration 
Update on taxation dispute 
 
We refer to previous correspondence in regards to the Settlement Administration and write 
to provide you with an update on the ongoing taxation dispute with the Australian Taxation 
Office (ATO). 
 
We have previously advised regarding a dispute between the Scheme Administrator and the 
ATO about the taxation treatment of interest earned on the settlement monies.  
 
In that advice we noted that the Scheme Administrator was working closely with our tax 
lawyers and the ATO to resolve the issue, but that litigation might be necessary.   
 
Litigation commenced 
 
There has been no resolution with the ATO and so on 27 March 2018, the Scheme 
Administrator filed proceedings in the Federal Court of Australia against the ATO. The 
Federal Court proceedings use one tax year in the Murrindindi Bushfire Class Action as a 
test case to resolve and clarify the issues in dispute. 
 
The Court has listed the proceedings for a case management hearing in early June and our 
tax lawyers are presently preparing our case. You will not be required to be directly involved 
in the case. 
 
In the event of a successful result there will be a second distribution to group members.   
 
Until the Court has made a decision, it is impossible to calculate how much you might 
receive if there is a further distribution but you should be aware that because the amount in 
dispute is a very small proportion of the total settlement sum, the amounts involved in any 

Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
 
DX 466 Melbourne 
 
T (03) 9605 2700 
F (03) 9258 9600 

 
 

 
Maurice Blackburn Offices in New South Wales, Victoria, Queensland and Australian Capital Territory 
www.mauriceblackburn.com.au  
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potential second distribution are likely to be comparatively small (probably less than 3% of 
amounts previously distributed). 
 
Timeframe and progress 
 
Due to the uncertain nature of litigation, we cannot estimate with any precision how long the 
case might take. We have been working with our tax lawyers to have these issues resolved 
as quickly as possible and will continue to do so. 
 
We will also continue to keep group members updated as this issue progresses to 
resolution. 
 
Contact details 
 
You should advise us of any changes to your contact details so that we can continue to 
update you about the resolution of the taxation dispute and ensure that we have accurate 
contact details in the event that there is a second settlement distribution. 
 
Further questions 
 
Please contact the Bushfire Class Action Info-line on 1800 18 26 45 if you have any further 
questions about this issue. 
 
Yours faithfully, 

 
 
 
 

Andrew Watson  
Scheme Administrator 
MAURICE BLACKBURN LAWYERS 
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Our Ref: AJW/3052534
T:  1800 99 55 70
F:  (03) 9258 9610
E: Murrindindica@mauriceblackburn.com.au

Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949

Level 21
380 LaTrobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000

PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001

DX 466 Melbourne

T (03) 9605 2700
F (03) 9258 9600

29 June 2018
«Contact_First_Name» «Contact_Last_Name»
«Contact_Street_Address_1»
«Contact_Street_Address_2»
«Contact_Suburb» «Contact_State» «Contact_Post_Code»
 

Dear A«Contact_First_Name»,

Murrindindi Bushfire Class Action Settlement Administration
Update on taxation dispute

We refer to previous correspondence in regards to the Settlement Administration and write 
to provide you with an update on the ongoing taxation dispute with the Australian Taxation 
Office (ATO).

Hearing date for the tax dispute

We previously advised that we had commenced proceedings in the Federal Court of 
Australia against the ATO and that the matter was listed for case management in early June.

The case management hearing occurred on 8 June 2018. The hearing was of a procedural 
nature and the Court made orders relating to the timetable of the proceeding, including that 
the trial of the substantive issues be scheduled for 13 November 2018.

As previously advised, the outcome of the proceeding may result in a further distribution of 
compensation to Group Members if the Court finds in favour of the Scheme Administrator, 
but it is impossible to calculate at this point how much you might receive if there is a further 
distribution.

Again, you should be aware that because the amount in dispute is a very small proportion of 
the total settlement sum, the amounts involved in any potential second distribution are likely 
to be comparatively small (probably less than 3% of amounts previously distributed).

Contact details

You should advise us of any changes to your contact details so that we can continue to 
update you about the resolution of the taxation dispute and ensure that we have accurate 
contact details in the event that there is a second settlement distribution.

Maurice Blackburn Offices in New South Wales, Victoria, Queensland and Australian Capital Territory
www.mauriceblackburn.com.au 

By email – «Contact_Email»
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Further questions

We will continue to work with our lawyers to prepare the matter for trial but it is unlikely that 
there will be any meaningful developments in this matter until the Judge decides the 
outcome.

On that basis, we do not propose to provide any further update until the trial has concluded 
and we can advise you of the outcome. Of course should something occur which warrants 
an update prior to that time, we will keep you informed.

In the meantime, if you have any further questions about this issue, please contact the 
Bushfire Class Action Info-line on 1800 99 55 70.

Yours faithfully,

Andrew Watson 
Scheme Administrator
MAURICE BLACKBURN LAWYERS
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Our Ref: AJW/3052534 
T:  1800 99 55 70 
F:  (03) 9258 9610 
E: Murrindindica@mauriceblackburn.com.au 
 
3 December 2018 
 
«Contact_First_Name» «Contact_Last_Name» 
«Contact_Street_Address_1» 
«Contact_Street_Address_2» 
«Contact_Suburb» «Contact_State» «Contact_Post_Code» 
 
By email – «Contact_Email» 
 
Dear «Contact_First_Name», 
 
Murrindindi Bushfire Class Action Settlement Administration 
Update on taxation dispute 
 
We refer to previous correspondence in regards to the Settlement Administration and write 
to provide you with an update on the ongoing taxation dispute with the Australian Taxation 
Office (ATO). 
 
Hearing of the tax dispute 
 
The hearing of the dispute between the Scheme Administrator and the ATO occurred in the 
Federal Court of Australia on 13 November 2018.  
 
It was a one-day hearing and the Judge will now make a ruling on the taxation of the Kilmore 
and Murrindindi class action distribution funds. 
 
Once the Judge has made a decision, we will need to consider the implications for group 
members in both the Kilmore and Murrindindi matters.  
 
However, at the conclusion of the hearing, the Judge indicated that a decision was unlikely 
to be handed down this year. Depending on the result, it is also possible that either side 
might seek to appeal the decision of the trial Judge. 
 
As previously advised, the outcome of the proceeding may result in a further distribution of 
compensation to Group Members if the Court finds in favour of the Scheme Administrator, 
but it is impossible to calculate at this point how much you might receive if there is a further 
distribution. 
 
Again, you should be aware that because the amount in dispute is a very small proportion of 
the total settlement sum, the amounts involved in any potential second distribution are likely 
to be comparatively small (probably less than 3% of amounts previously distributed). 
 

Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
 
DX 466 Melbourne 
 
T (03) 9605 2700 
F (03) 9258 9600 

 
 

 
Maurice Blackburn Offices in New South Wales, Victoria, Queensland and Australian Capital Territory 
www.mauriceblackburn.com.au  
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Final Report into the Black Saturday Bushfire Class Actions Settlement 
Administration 
 
The Settlement Administration has been overseen by the Supreme Court of Victoria and the 
Scheme Administrator has provided regular updates to the Court by attending case 
management hearings and filing written materials containing information about the 
Settlement Administration and its progress. 
 
So that group members have access to a single, comprehensive analysis as to the operation 
of the Settlement Administration, Maurice Blackburn has prepared a Final Report into the 
Black Saturday Bushfire Class Actions Settlement Administration. 
 
That Report has been filed in the Supreme Court and has been published on Maurice 
Blackburn’s website. 
  
The costs of the preparation of the Final Report were borne entirely by Maurice Blackburn 
and have not been passed on to group members in either of the Kilmore-East Kinglake or 
Murrindindi Bushfire class actions. 
 
Contact details 
 
You should advise us of any changes to your contact details so that we can continue to 
update you about the resolution of the taxation dispute and ensure that we have accurate 
contact details in the event that there is a second settlement distribution. 
 
Further questions 
 
We will write to you with a further update once the Judge has made a decision in the taxation 
dispute. 
 
Given the timeframe identified by the Judge, we do not consider it likely that the case will be 
decided before the end of the year. 
 
In the meantime, if you have any further questions about this issue, please contact the 
Bushfire Class Action Info-line on 1800 99 55 70. 
 
Yours faithfully, 

 
 
 
 

Andrew Watson  
Scheme Administrator 
MAURICE BLACKBURN LAWYERS 
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Our Ref: AJW/3052534 
T:  1800 18 26 45 
F:  (03) 9258 9610 
E: Murrindindica@mauriceblackburn.com.au 
 
1 March 2019 
 
«Contact_First_Name» «Contact_Last_Name» 
«Contact_Street_Address_1» 
«Contact_Street_Address_2» 
«Contact_Suburb» «Contact_State» «Contact_Post_Code» 
 
By post only 
 
Dear «Contact_First_Name», 
 
Murrindindi Bushfire Class Action Settlement Administration 
Update on taxation dispute 
 
We refer to previous correspondence in regards to the Settlement Administration and write to 
provide you with an update on the taxation dispute with the Australian Taxation Office (ATO) 
which was heard by the Federal Court on 13 November 2018.  
 
Outcome of the hearing in the tax dispute 
 
On 28 February 2019, the Court handed down a decision which held that the Scheme 
Administrator is not entitled to deduct the costs incurred by the Settlement Distribution 
Scheme (Scheme) from the interest which was earned on the settlement monies, in 
calculating the taxable income of the Scheme. 
 
This result means that the amount which was previously withheld from distribution to meet 
our potential taxation liability must be paid to the taxation office. 
 
We are obviously disappointed with the outcome and we will be discussing the possibility of 
appealing the decision of the Federal Court with our legal advisers in the coming days. 
 
For further information on the tax dispute and the decision of the Federal Court please go to 
https://www.mauriceblackburn.com.au/class-actions/current-class-actions/bushfire-class-
actions/murrindindi-marysville-bushfire-class-action/ 
 
Next steps 
 
Under the Federal Court Rules, the Scheme Administrator has 21 days from the date of the 
judgment to seek leave to bring an appeal. 
 
As noted above, we are reviewing the Court’s decision carefully and considering if any 
ground of appeal might exist. We will inform you of the outcome of this review, and any steps 
we propose to take, as soon as practicable. 

Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 

ABN 21 105 657 949 

Level 21 

380 La Trobe Street 

Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
PO Box 523 

Melbourne VIC 3001 
 
DX 466 Melbourne 
 
T (03) 9605 2700 

F (03) 9258 9600 
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In the event that we do not seek to appeal the decision, we will take the necessary steps to 
disburse the Scheme’s taxation liability and finalise the operation of the Scheme. 
 
Contact details 
 
You should advise us of any changes to your contact details so that we can continue to 
update you about the resolution of the taxation dispute and the potential finalisation of the 
Scheme. 
 
Further questions 
 
We will write to you with a further update once we have more information to provide to you. 
 
In the meantime, if you have any further questions about this issue, please contact the 
Bushfire Class Action Info-line on 1800 18 26 45. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 

 
 
 
 

Andrew Watson  
Scheme Administrator 
MAURICE BLACKBURN LAWYERS 
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Our Ref: AJW/3052534 
T:  1800 18 26 45 
F:  (03) 9258 9610 
E: Murrindindica@mauriceblackburn.com.au 
 
[DATE] 
 
[CONTACT]«FIRSTNAME» [CONTACT]«LASTNAME» 
«STREET» 
«ADDITIONAL1» 
«CITY» «STATE» «ZIPCODE» 
 
 
Dear «Contact_First_Name», 
 
Murrindindi Bushfire Class Action Settlement Administration  
Update on Taxation Dispute 
             
We refer to previous correspondence regarding the taxation dispute in the Murrindindi 
Bushfire Class Action which impacts upon the Settlement Administrations in both the 
Murrindindi and Kilmore East-Kinglake matters.  
 
Tax Appeal Judgment 
 
The Full Court of the Federal Court heard the appeal of the dispute with the ATO about the 
amount of tax payable on interest earned on settlement funds on 22 August 2019.   
 
On 27 May 2020, the Full Court handed down its decision on the appeal in favour of the 
ATO. The Full Court found that certain deductions that would reduce the amount of tax 
payable by the Scheme Administrators were not allowed.  
 
Following the ruling of the Full Court 
 
The Scheme Administrator will need to carefully consider the implications of the judgement 
for claimants in both the Murrindindi and Kilmore Kinglake-East matters.  
 
This will require the Scheme Administrator to take advice from our tax lawyers as to whether 
an appeal to the High Court is in the best interests of claimants.   
 
If, based on the advice of the tax lawyers, no further appeal is lodged, there is unlikely to be 
any further distribution to claimants. If an appeal is lodged, it will be some time before the 
matter is finally resolved.  
 
 
 
 

Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 

ABN 21 105 657 949 

Level 21 

380 La Trobe Street 

Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
PO Box 523 

Melbourne VIC 3001 
 
DX 466 Melbourne 
 
T (03) 9605 2700 

F (03) 9258 9600 

 
 

 
Maurice Blackburn Offices in New South Wales, Victoria, Queensland and Australian Capital Territory 
www.mauriceblackburn.com.au  
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Contact details 
 
Please note that it is your responsibility to update your contact details with Maurice 
Blackburn.  
 
The current contact details we have are:  
 
[CONTACT]«FIRSTNAME» [CONTACT]«LASTNAME» 
«STREET» 
«ADDITIONAL1» 
«CITY» «STATE» «ZIPCODE» 
 
Further questions and next steps 
 
We will provide you with a further update once the Scheme Administrator has had an 
opportunity to receive and consider advice from our tax lawyers.  
 
For further information on the tax dispute and the decision of the Full Court of the Federal 
Court please go to: https://www.mauriceblackburn.com.au/class-actions/current-class-
actions/bushfire-class-actions/murrindindi-marysville-bushfire-class-action/ 
 
If you have any further questions about this issue, please contact the Bushfire Class Action 
Info-line on 1800 18 26 45. 
 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 

 
 
 
 

Andrew Watson  
Scheme Administrator 
MAURICE BLACKBURN LAWYERS 
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Our Ref: AJW/3052534 
T:  1800 18 26 45 
F:  (03) 9258 9610 
E: Murrindindica@mauriceblackburn.com.au 
 

Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
 
DX 466 Melbourne 
 
T (03) 9605 2700 
F (03) 9258 9600 

27 August 2020 
 

Update on Taxation Dispute 
             

Murrindindi Bushfire Class Action Settlement Administration 

We refer to previous correspondence regarding the taxation dispute in the Murrindindi 
Bushfire Class Action which impacts upon the Settlement Administrations in both the 
Murrindindi and Kilmore East-Kinglake matters.  
 
Tax Appeal Judgment 
 
The Full Court of the Federal Court heard the appeal of the dispute with the ATO about the 
amount of tax payable on interest earned on settlement funds on 22 August 2019.   
 
On 27 May 2020, the Full Court handed down its decision on the appeal in favour of the 
ATO. The Full Court found that certain deductions that would reduce the amount of tax 
payable by the Scheme Administrators were not allowed.  
 
Following the ruling of the Full Court 
 
Following the decision of the Full Court, the Scheme Administrator received advice from our 
independent tax lawyers including an eminent Queen’s Counsel who specialises in tax 
matters. Having carefully considered this advice and the implications of the decision for 
claimants in both the Murrindindi and Kilmore Kinglake-East matters, the Scheme 
Administrator lodged an application for special leave to appeal to the High Court of Australia 
on 24 June 2020. 
 
We are currently waiting to hear if the High Court of Australia will grant our application for 
special leave. If our application is not granted, there is unlikely to be any further distribution 
to claimants. If our application is granted, the High Court will hear our appeal at a later date 
and it will be some considerable time before the matter is finally resolved.  
 

 
Maurice Blackburn Offices in New South Wales, Victoria, Queensland and Australian Capital Territory 
www.mauriceblackburn.com.au  

[CONTACT]«FIRSTNAME» [CONTACT]«LASTNAME»
«STREET»
«ADDITIONAL1»
«CITY» «STATE» «ZIPCODE»
 

Dear «Contact_First_Name»,
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Contact details 
 
Please note that it is your responsibility to update your contact details with Maurice 
Blackburn.  
 

 
The current contact details we have are: 

 
Further questions and next steps 
 
We will provide you with a further update once we know whether our application for special 
leave to appeal to the High Court of Australia has been successful.  
 
For further information on the tax dispute and the decision of the Full Court of the Federal 
Court please go to: https://www.mauriceblackburn.com.au/class-actions/current-class-
actions/bushfire-class-actions/murrindindi-marysville-bushfire-class-action/ 
 
If you have any further questions about this issue, please contact the Bushfire Class Action 
Info-line on 1800 18 26 45. 
 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 

Andrew Watson  
Scheme Administrator 
MAURICE BLACKBURN LAWYERS 
 

[CONTACT]«FIRSTNAME» [CONTACT]«LASTNAME»
«STREET»
«ADDITIONAL1»
«CITY» «STATE» «ZIPCODE»
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Our Ref: AJW/3052534 
T:  1800 18 26 45 
F:  (03) 9258 9610 
E: Murrindindica@mauriceblackburn.com.au 
 

Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
 
DX 466 Melbourne 
 
T (03) 9605 2700 
F (03) 9258 9600 

30 October 2020 
 

Dear «Contact_First_Name»,
 

Update on Taxation Dispute 
             

Murrindindi Bushfire Class Action Settlement Administration 

We refer to previous correspondence regarding the taxation dispute in the Murrindindi 
Bushfire Class Action which impacts upon the Settlement Administrations in both the 
Murrindindi and Kilmore East-Kinglake matters.  
 

 

In particular we refer to our most recent update to group members in August 2020 when we 
advised that we were awaiting the outcome of the special leave application to the High Court. 

On 14 October 2020 the High Court handed down its decision and unfortunately denied the 
application for special leave to appeal. This application to the High Court was the final 
avenue of appeal. The consequence of the High Court’s decision is that the Australian Tax 
Office’s (ATO) assessment of the tax payable by the Scheme Administrator is upheld.  
 
There are no further steps that can be taken to challenge the ATO’s assessment of the tax 
payable.  
 

 

Throughout the appeal process, we have taken advice from tax specialists who have 
consistently maintained that there were grounds upon which to challenge the ATO’s 
assessment of the tax payable and reasonable prospects that an appeal could be successful. 

While we are disappointed by the High Court’s decision to deny the application for special 
leave to appeal, we were advised that it was appropriate to pursue the issue to the High 
Court because had the Scheme Administrator ultimately been successful the result would 
have been a reduced amount of tax payable to the ATO and a further distribution of 
settlement funds to group members.  
 

 

Given the High Court’s decision there will be no further distribution to group members, and 
the Scheme Administrator will now take the necessary steps to conclude the Administration. 

Page 1 of 2 

 
Maurice Blackburn Offices in New South Wales, Victoria, Queensland and Australian Capital Territory 
www.mauriceblackburn.com.au  

[CONTACT]«FIRSTNAME» [CONTACT]«LASTNAME»
«STREET»
«ADDITIONAL1»
«CITY» «STATE» «ZIPCODE»
 

2525



Page 2 of 2 
 

For further information on the tax dispute please go to: 
https://www.mauriceblackburn.com.au/class-actions/current-class-actions/bushfire-class-
actions/murrindindi-marysville-bushfire-class-action/ 
 
If you have any further questions about this issue, please contact the Bushfire Class Action 
Info-line on 1800 18 26 45. 
 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 

 
 
 
 

Andrew Watson  
Scheme Administrator 
MAURICE BLACKBURN LAWYERS 
 
 

2626



 
 
 

402359276.1 

Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited      
ABN 21 105 657 949      
 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000     
 
PO Box 523, Melbourne VIC 3001 
 
DX 466 Melbourne 
 
 T (03) 9605 2700 
 F (03) 9258 9600 
 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
 

 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Western Australia,  
Northern Territory and South Australia. 

 

 

 

Murrindindi Injury and Dependency Settlement 
Administration invoices 

1 December 2017 to 31 March 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
21-08-2020 
Matter Ref 3052535 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: PI 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 December 2017 to 31 December 

2017 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,298.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $129.80 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $1,427.80 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
04-Dec-17 Telephone call to J Malcolm re DVA pension 

advice and instructions re same 
PMC 0.20 $540.00 $108.00

04-Dec-17 Email to DVA re obtaining updated pension and 
repayment information re J Malcolm personal re 
injury claim 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

04-Dec-17 Email to J Malcolm re DVA advice and further 
action re obtaining updated pension and 
repayment information re personal injury claim 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

04-Dec-17 Reviewing documents, updating matter centre re 
The Estate of J Nelson and email to finance and 
D Christoforou re cheque presentation dates re 
PI claim 

SUC 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

04-Dec-17 Reviewing file re J Nelson re final personal injury 
distribution and email to S Camilleri re same 

DSH 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

05-Dec-17 Telephone call from C Zheng re cheque 
presentation date for Estate of J Nelson's PI 
settlement payment 

SUC 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

07-Dec-17 Telephone call from J Malcolm re DVA election 
decision re personal injury claim 

PMC 0.20 $540.00 $108.00

08-Dec-17 Email to DVA re request for updating pension 
offsetting advice re J Malcolm re personal injury 
claim 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

11-Dec-17 Reviewing email from J Olthof, DVA re J Malcolm 
re personal injury claim 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

11-Dec-17 Telephone conference with D Christoforou re J 
Malcolm re in-hand figure required re final 
personal injury distribution 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

11-Dec-17 Email to Devenish Lawyers re payment and 
presentation of cheque re Estate of J Nelson re 
PI claim 

SUC 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

11-Dec-17 Telephone conference with P McMullan re J 
Malcolm re in-hand figure required re final 
personal injury distribution 

DSH 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

11-Dec-17 Reviewing payment schedule re J Malcolm re in-
hand amount re final personal injury distribution 
and email to M Greaves re same 

DSH 0.30 $320.00 $96.00

12-Dec-17 Email to M Greaves re final payment figure for 
DVA repayment re J Malcolm re personal injury 
claim 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

12-Dec-17 Reviewing email from M Greaves re in hand 
payment and email to J Olthof, DVA re same 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

12-Dec-17 Reviewing emails from D Christoforou and P 
McMullan re confirmation re J Malcolm re group 
member's in-hand amount re final personal injury 
compensation, reviewing schedule of payments 
approved by KPMG and replied re same 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00

12-Dec-17 Conference with D Christoforou re J Malcolm re 
in-hand figure re final personal injury distribution 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

12-Dec-17 Conference with M Greaves re J Malcolm re in-
hand figure re final personal injury distribution 

DSH 0.10 $320.00 $32.00
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
15-Dec-17 Telephone call and email to contact for the Estate 

of S Prien re outstanding payment re PI claim 
and email to M Greaves re same 

SUC 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

18-Dec-17 Email to J Olthof, DVA re request for DVA 
repayment and pension advice re J Malcolm re 
personal injury claim 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

 2.80  $1,298.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Danielle Christoforou $320.00 0.70 $224.00

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.30 $162.00

 Patricia McMullan $540.00 1.20 $648.00

 Samantha Camilleri $440.00 0.60 $264.00

  2.80 $1,298.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,298.00

 $1,298.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052535    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: PI 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $1,427.80 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 21 August 2020     Due Date: 04 September 2020 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
21-08-2020 
Matter Ref 3052535 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: PI 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 January 2018 to 31 March 2019 

by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $4,228.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $422.80 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $4,650.80 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
03-Jan-18 Email to J Olthof, DVA re request for updating 

repayment and pension advice re J Malcolm re 
personal injury claim 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

15-Jan-18 Email to J Olthof, DVA re request for pension 
advice re J Malcolm re personal injury claim 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

17-Jan-18 Reviewing email from DVA re updating 
repayment figures and emails to E Mukherji, M 
Greaves and J Malcolm re same 

PMC 0.20 $540.00 $108.00

17-Jan-18 Conference with M Greaves re J Malcolm re final 
in-hand amount and processing final personal 
injury compensation 

PMC 0.20 $540.00 $108.00

17-Jan-18 Reviewing email from P McMullan re J Malcolm 
re confirmation re repayment to DVA, reviewing 
and amending in-hand schedule re compensation 
amount, multiple emails to M Dougall and J Kaye, 
KPMG re approval of in-hand amount and 
deductions, email to J Malcolm re bank account 
details and email to P McMullan and E Mukherji 
re same 

MYG 0.90 $540.00 $486.00

17-Jan-18 Conference with P McMullan re J Malcolm re final 
in-hand amount and processing final personal 
injury compensation 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00

22-Jan-18 Reviewing email from M Dougall, KPMG, re 
review and approval of payment data re J 
Malcolm re final personal injury compensation 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

23-Jan-18 Email to M Greaves re payment to J Malcolm and 
Department of Veterans Affairs 

LKE 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

23-Jan-18 Conference with M Greaves re personal injury 
payment to J Malcolm and Department of 
Veterans Affairs 

LKE 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

23-Jan-18 Preparing payment forms for J Malcolm and 
Department of Veterans Affairs 

LKE 0.50 $320.00 $160.00

23-Jan-18 Preparing signed controlled money withdrawal 
forms re payment to J Malcolm and Department 
of Veterans Affairs and email to Controlled 
Monies re same 

LKE 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

23-Jan-18 Telephone call from J Malcolm re payment 
authority re personal injury claim and email to M 
Greaves re same 

PMC 0.20 $540.00 $108.00

23-Jan-18 Conference with L Keating re personal injury 
payment to J Malcolm and Department of 
Veterans Affairs 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

23-Jan-18 Reviewing controlled money withdrawal and trust 
payment forms re J Malcolm re final personal 
injury compensation and email to L Keating re 
same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

23-Jan-18 Reviewing email from P McMullan re J Malcolm 
re final personal injury compensation and 
reviewing file and preparing payment re same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00

24-Jan-18 Drafting letter to Department of Veterans Affairs 
re repayment re claim of J Malcolm 

LKE 0.20 $320.00 $64.00
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
24-Jan-18 Conference with M Greaves re drafting letter to 

Department of Veterans Affairs re repayment of J 
Malcolm 

LKE 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

24-Jan-18 Conference with L Keating re drafting letter to 
Department of Veterans Affairs re repayment of J 
Malcolm 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

24-Jan-18 Reviewing and settling draft correspondence to 
DVA confirming repayment of funds re J Malcolm

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00

25-Jan-18 Drafting letter to J Malcolm re final payment 
correspondence and email to M Greaves re same

LKE 0.30 $320.00 $96.00

25-Jan-18 Amending letter to J Malcolm re final payment LKE 0.30 $320.00 $96.00

25-Jan-18 Multiple emails to and from L Keating and C 
Zheng re processing final personal injury 
payment re J Malcolm and reviewing and settling 
final letter to group member re same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00

29-Jan-18 Multiple emails to and from C Zheng re J Malcolm 
re cheque re final personal injury compensation 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

30-Jan-18 Preparing cheque and final letter for J Malcolm LKE 0.30 $320.00 $96.00

30-Jan-18 Multiple emails to and from L Keating re J 
Malcolm re sending final letter and cheque re 
final personal injury compensation 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

31-Jan-18 Email to M Greaves re letter to Department of 
Veterans Affairs confirming payment to J Malcolm

LKE 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

31-Jan-18 Email to Department of Veterans Affairs re final 
payment re claim of J Malcolm 

LKE 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

06-Feb-18 Conference with M Greaves re group member 
request for documents 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

06-Feb-18 Reviewing group member request for information, 
documents re same, drafting reply email to group 
member re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

06-Feb-18 Telephone call to S Pearson re request for 
material, draft file note, draft email re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

06-Feb-18 Conference with M Greaves re group member 
request for documents 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

06-Feb-18 Reviewing email from group member re request 
for documents and email to J Peck re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

06-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re group member 
request for documents 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

14-Feb-18 Email to E Mukherji and M Greaves re status of 
grant of representation for Estate of Suzanne 
Prien 

SUC 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

14-Feb-18 Reviewing email from S Camilleri re update re 
Estate of S Prien re outstanding probate re 
personal injury distribution and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

29-Aug-18 Reviewing correspondence from Slater & Gordon 
re client file, drafting response and collating and 
reviewing material in respect of same 

JSP 1.20 $440.00 $528.00
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
06-Sep-18 Telephone call to B Malcolm re request for 

information on claim, reviewing material, drafting 
email to P McMullan 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

07-Sep-18 Conference with P McMullan and J Peck re PI 
payment to J Malcolm 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

07-Sep-18 Conference with P McMullan and J Peck re PI 
payment to J Malcolm 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

07-Sep-18 Reviewing material and settling email to B 
Malcolm re payment of claims 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

23-Oct-18 Telephone call to E Davis re distribution of 
compensation and to confirm banking details, 
drafting email re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

14-Nov-18 Reviewing I-D distribution to Estate of Prien and 
drafting email enclosing various documents 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

 9.40  $4,228.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Jonathan Peck $440.00 3.10 $1,364.00

 Lydia Keating $320.00 2.40 $768.00

 Megan Greaves $540.00 2.90 $1,566.00

 Patricia McMullan $540.00 0.90 $486.00

 Samantha Camilleri $440.00 0.10 $44.00

  9.40 $4,228.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $4,228.00

 $4,228.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052535    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: PI 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $4,650.80 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 21 August 2020     Due Date: 04 September 2020 
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Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited      
ABN 21 105 657 949      
 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000     
 
PO Box 523, Melbourne VIC 3001 
 
DX 466 Melbourne 
 
 T (03) 9605 2700 
 F (03) 9258 9600 
 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
 

 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Western Australia,  
Northern Territory and South Australia. 

 

 

 

Murrindindi Economic Loss and Property Damage 
Settlement Administration invoices 

1 December 2017 to 31 March 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
06-08-2018 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 June 2018 to 30 June 2018 by 

the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $3,769.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $376.90 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $4,145.90 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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4545



 

Page 3 of 7 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
04-Jun-18 Drafting reply email to enquiry from J Barton re 

outstanding allocation dispute 
JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

12-Jun-18 Conference with J Peck re Barton allocation 
dispute and next steps re same 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00

12-Jun-18 Reviewing group member correspondence re 
allocation dispute, reviewing previous 
correspondence re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

12-Jun-18 Reviewing advice from counsel, drafting emails to 
A Watson re allocation dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

12-Jun-18 Conference with A Watson re Barton allocation 
dispute and next steps re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

18-Jun-18 Telephone call to J Barton re allocation dispute, 
drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00

18-Jun-18 Conference with A Watson re correspondence 
from group member re allocation dispute, 
proposal for resolution 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

18-Jun-18 Drafting reply correspondence to D Barton re 
allocation dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

18-Jun-18 Conference with J Peck re correspondence from 
group member re allocation dispute, proposal for 
resolution 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00

18-Jun-18 Perusing and considering correspondence from D 
Barton re dispute 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00

22-Jun-18 Preparing spreadsheet of recently deceased 
estates 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

22-Jun-18 Drafting email re outstanding distribution re 
Estate of Prien 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

23-Jun-18 Reviewing correspondence from D Barton re 
allocation dispute, drafting response to same 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00

24-Jun-18 Reviewing correspondence from D Barton re 
allocation dispute, drafting response to same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

25-Jun-18 Reviewing file and various materials, settling 
reply correspondence to D Barton re allocation 
dispute, drafting email to A Watson re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

25-Jun-18 Perusing and considering draft response to D 
Barton re disputed distribution 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00

26-Jun-18 Reviewing email from D Barton re allocation 
dispute, drafting email to A Watson re: same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

27-Jun-18 Reviewing file re 16 Murchison St allocation 
dispute, considering group member request for 
provision of certain details 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

29-Jun-18 Conference with A Watson re settling 
correspondence to D Barton 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

29-Jun-18 Reviewing proposed amendments to D Barton 
correspondence, settling same, and drafting 
enclosing email 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00

4747
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
29-Jun-18 Telephone call to D Barton re correspondence 

and voicemail messages, dictating file note re 
same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

29-Jun-18 Conference with J Peck re settling 
correspondence to D Barton 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00

29-Jun-18 Settling letter to D Barton re dispute re payment AJW 0.60 $790.00 $474.00

 7.40  $3,769.00

4848
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 1.50 $1,185.00

 Jesse Jin $320.00 0.10 $32.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 5.80 $2,552.00

  7.40 $3,769.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $3,769.00

 $3,769.00

4949
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $4,145.90 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 06 August 2018     Due Date: 20 August 2018 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-04-2019 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 March 2018 to 31 March 2018 by 

the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $3,325.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $1,054.88 AUD 

Total GST Applied $437.99 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $4,817.87 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
01-Mar-18 Reviewing correspondence, drafting email to M 

Telford re L Jowett claim 
JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

08-Mar-18 Drafting email to H Singer re L Jowett allocation 
dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

15-Mar-18 Telephone call to H Singer re unresolved L 
Jowett claim 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

15-Mar-18 Reviewing outstanding estate claims, drafting 
correspondence and file note re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

16-Mar-18 Reviewing unpresented cheques and outstanding 
distributions, drafting correspondence and file 
note re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

16-Mar-18 Drafting controlled money withdrawal form re L 
Jowett 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00

19-Mar-18 Review distribution agreement received from 
solicitor re L Jowett dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

19-Mar-18 Telephone call from S Prien re Estate of S Prien 
re withheld ELPD distribution 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

20-Mar-18 Email to J Peck re controlled money withdrawal 
forms to be processed 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

20-Mar-18 Reviewing and settling controlled money 
withdrawal advice re proposed distribution re 
ELPD claim 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

20-Mar-18 Reviewing ELPD distribution proposal re 
allocation dispute, collating material and drafting 
email to KPMG 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

21-Mar-18 Telephone call from solicitor re Estate of S Prien, 
draft file note and email re same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00

22-Mar-18 Reviewing Estate of S Prien and entitlement to 
damages, drafting email to M Greaves re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

22-Mar-18 Reviewing various outstanding ELPD matters and 
preparing for conference with Scheme 
Administrator 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

22-Mar-18 Conference with A Watson re outstanding ELPD 
matters 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

22-Mar-18 Conference with J Peck re outstanding ELPD 
matters 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00

22-Mar-18 Reviewing email from J Peck re the Estate of S 
Prien re assessment amount and location of files 
and response email re same 

JST 0.30 $320.00 $96.00

22-Mar-18 Reviewing email from J Peck re the Estate of S 
Prien re spreadsheet re final distrubtion and 
response email re same 

JST 0.30 $320.00 $96.00

23-Mar-18 Drafting controlled money withdrawals re L 
Jowett 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00

27-Mar-18 Reviewing material and drafting reply email to the 
solicitor for the Estate of S Prien 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

27-Mar-18 Reviewing payment receipt, draftng email to 
solicitor re L Jowett allocation dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

5454
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
28-Mar-18 Settling email to solicitor re L Jowett re payment 

of compensation 
JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

29-Mar-18 Reviewing correspondence and material in 
respect of Barton allocation dispute, drafting 
correspondence to both parties 

JSP 1.40 $440.00 $616.00

 7.70  $3,325.00

5555
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.30 $237.00

 Jesse Jin $320.00 0.80 $256.00

 Jessica Tavcar $320.00 0.60 $192.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 6.00 $2,640.00

  7.70 $3,325.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $3,325.00

 $3,325.00

5656
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
29-Oct-2017 SAI Global Property (Anstat Property Information) - Search Fees - SAI 

Global 
$26.80

05-Mar-2018 Expert Fees - KPMG - Invoice 821100191 $1,028.08

 $1,054.88

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $1,054.88

 $1,054.88

5757
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $4,817.87 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 April 2019     Due Date: 25 April 2019 
 

5858



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
29-11-2019 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 March 2019 to 31 March 2019 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $202.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $20.20 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $222.20 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
07-Mar-19 Perusing email chain J Peck and N Neagle re 

Estate of Prest 
AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00

08-Mar-19 Conference with K Nishimura re Estate of Prest 
and co-executor dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

08-Mar-19 Conference with J Peck re Estate of Prest and 
co-executor dispute 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00

 0.30  $202.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.10 $79.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 0.10 $44.00

 Kimi Nishimura $790.00 0.10 $79.00

  0.30 $202.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $202.00

 $202.00

6363
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $222.20 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 29 November 2019     Due Date: 13 December 2019 
 

6464



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
05-07-2018 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 May 2018 to 31 May 2018 by the 

Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in the 
matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,962.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $196.20 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $2,158.20 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
03-May-18 Reviewing correspondence with and assessment 

of H Cuthbertson, telephone call to same and 
drafting filenote to same 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

08-May-18 Telephone call to D Barton re distribution 
proposal, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00

08-May-18 Telephone call to J Barton re distribution 
proposal, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

08-May-18 Reviewing outstanding ELPD distributions, 
updating notes, drafting email to A Watson re 
same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

10-May-18 Telephone call to G Pope re Suzali compensation 
re tax question, drafting file note re same, drafting 
email re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

16-May-18 Peruse email from J Peck and attachment re 
outstanding payments issues, reply to same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00

29-May-18 Telephone call to D Barton re disputed 
assessment, draft file note re same, review 
materials and draft reply email re potential 
arbitration process 

JSP 1.30 $440.00 $572.00

30-May-18 Reviewing file of Estate of Harris, telephone call 
to solicitor for the Estate, draft file note re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

 4.30  $1,962.00

6868
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.20 $158.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 4.10 $1,804.00

  4.30 $1,962.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,962.00

 $1,962.00

6969
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $2,158.20 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 05 July 2018     Due Date: 19 July 2018 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-04-2019 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 November 2018 to 30 November 

2018 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $2,867.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $286.70 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $3,153.70 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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7272



 

Page 3 of 6 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
05-Nov-18 Reviewing correspondence from Gadens, 

solicitors for J Barton re allocation dispute, 
drafting reply to same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

07-Nov-18 Reviewing various material and preparing for 
distribution of ELPD compensation to the Estate 
of Prien 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

07-Nov-18 Reviewing various material and preparing for 
distribution of compensation to the Estate of 
Prien 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

08-Nov-18 Telephone call with L Weldon, solicitor for J 
Barton re outstanding distribution 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

08-Nov-18 Drafting correspondence to the Estate of Prien re 
distribution and terms of I-D assessments 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

08-Nov-18 Drafting correspondence to the Estate of Prien re 
distribution and terms of ELPD assessments 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

08-Nov-18 Settling email re distribution to the Estate of Prien ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00

09-Nov-18 Reviewing material and drafting email executing 
transfer instructions re PI distribution to Estate of 
Prien 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

09-Nov-18 Reviewing material and drafting email executing 
transfer instructions re ELPD distribution to 
Estate of Prien 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

09-Nov-18 Drafting email to N Neagle re distribution to 
related parties re outstanding distribution of 
Estate of Prest 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

14-Nov-18 Reviewing ELPD distribution to Estate of Prien 
and drafting email enclosing various documents 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

21-Nov-18 Telephone call with D Barton re outstanding 
ELPD distribution, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

28-Nov-18 Telephone call with solicitor for co-executor for 
the Estate of Prest, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

28-Nov-18 Reviewing Prest file and assessment, drafting 
statutory declaration, drafting enclosing 
correspondence to solicitor 

JSP 1.40 $440.00 $616.00

 6.40  $2,867.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.30 $183.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 6.10 $2,684.00

  6.40 $2,867.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $2,867.00

 $2,867.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $3,153.70 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 April 2019     Due Date: 25 April 2019 
 

7676



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
23-11-2018 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 September 2018 to 30 

September 2018 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $440.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $44.00 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $484.00 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
06-Sep-18 Telephone call with A Di Benedetto, AMS 

Lawyers re Estate of Prien, drafting file note re 
same, updating distribution agreement and 
drafting email enclosing same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

06-Sep-18 Telephone call to B Malcolm re request for 
information on claim, reviewing material, drafting 
email to P McMullan 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

17-Sep-18 Drafting email to A Di Benedetto, AMS Lawyers 
re Estate of Prien 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

17-Sep-18 Reviewing distribution agreement, drafting reply 
email to A Di Benedetto re Estate of Prien 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

 1.00  $440.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Jonathan Peck $440.00 1.00 $440.00

  1.00 $440.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $440.00

 $440.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $484.00 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 23 November 2018     Due Date: 07 December 2018 
 

8282



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-04-2019 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 October 2018 to 31 October 

2018 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,074.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $107.40 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $1,181.40 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

8383



 

Page 2 of 6 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
01-Oct-18 Updating D Allen contact email and mobile re 

Group member correspondence 
JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00

01-Oct-18 Email to D Allen re tax dispute update JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

19-Oct-18 Telephone call to D Barton re outstanding 
distribution, query re same, drafting file note re 
same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

20-Oct-18 Reviewing correspondence received from group 
member and various materials re outstanding 
allocation dispute re 16 Murchison St, Marysville, 
drafting reply 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

21-Oct-18 Reviewing materials and preparing controlled 
money withdrawal and enclosing correspondence 
re Estate of Prien claim 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

21-Oct-18 Reviewing materials and preparing controlled 
money withdrawal and enclosing correspondence 
re Estate of Prien ELPD claim 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

22-Oct-18 Settling reply correspondence to D Barton re 
ongoing allocation dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

22-Oct-18 Conference with E Mukherji re communication 
with A Inzitari and drafting correspondence re 
same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

22-Oct-18 Conference with J Peck re communication with A 
Inzitari and drafting correspondence re same 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00

23-Oct-18 Telephone call to E Davis re distribution of 
compensation and to confirm banking details, 
drafting email re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

 2.50  $1,074.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.20 $122.00

 Jesse Jin $320.00 0.50 $160.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 1.80 $792.00

  2.50 $1,074.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,074.00

 $1,074.00

8787



 

Page 6 of 6 

 
TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $1,181.40 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 April 2019     Due Date: 25 April 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
15-06-2018 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 April 2018 to 30 April 2018 by the

Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $3,799.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $379.90 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $4,178.90 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
03-Apr-18 Reviewing and settling correspondence to J and 

D Barton re allocation dispute 
JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

03-Apr-18 Reviewing terms of distribution, drafting and 
settling correspondence to L and L Jowett re 
distribution of compensation 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

03-Apr-18 Reviewing terms of distribution, drafting and 
settling correspondence to L and L Jowett re 
distribution of compensation 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00

03-Apr-18 Review proposed correspondence re payment of 
disputed compensation, email J Peck re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00

03-Apr-18 Drafiting correspondence to L and L Jowett re 
final distribution 

JSJ 0.80 $320.00 $256.00

04-Apr-18 Reviewing and replying to multiple emails from D 
Barton re allocation dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

05-Apr-18 Reviewing previous correspondence to D Barton 
re allocation dispute, drafting new 
correspondence re same 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

06-Apr-18 Updating Matter Centre and in-hand schedule to 
reflect EFT distribution to L and L Jowett 

JSJ 0.60 $320.00 $192.00

06-Apr-18 Reviewing family law orders provided by D 
Barton re allocation dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

09-Apr-18 Drafting email to D Barton re assessment and 
family law orders 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

10-Apr-18 Telephone call from D Barton, draft file note re 
same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

10-Apr-18 Telephpone call with M Yunan, Pitcher Partners 
re claim of Graham's Factree Pty Ltd, draft note 
re same, review file, collate material and draft 
email to M Yuan re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

10-Apr-18 Reviewing outstanding ELPD claims, considering 
further steps required 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

10-Apr-18 Perusing proposed distribution agreement, 
emailing J Peck re same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00

12-Apr-18 Drafting update correspondence to insurers, 
drafting email of instructions re same to J Jin 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

13-Apr-18 Drafting and settling reply correspondence to D 
Barton re disputed allocation 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

13-Apr-18 Perusing and settling draft email to client re 
disputed allocation 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00

18-Apr-18 Reviewing email and drafting reply 
correspondence to D Barton re allocation dispute

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

19-Apr-18 Reviewing assessment of Graham's Factree Pty 
Ltd, drafting email to M Yunan re assessment of 
specific assets for taxation purposes 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

19-Apr-18 Telephone call from M Yunan re assessment of 
Graham's Factree Pty Ltd, assessment of specific 
assets for taxation purposes 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
20-Apr-18 Updating contact address for multiple group 

members 
JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00

 8.70  $3,799.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.50 $395.00

 Jesse Jin $320.00 1.70 $544.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 6.50 $2,860.00

  8.70 $3,799.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $3,799.00

 $3,799.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $4,178.90 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 15 June 2018     Due Date: 29 June 2018 
 

9595



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-04-2019 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 August 2018 to 31 August 2018 

by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $2,190.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $219.00 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $2,409.00 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
01-Aug-18 Updating contact address for multiple group 

members 
JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

01-Aug-18 Multiple telephone calls to Y Jones re updated 
contact address 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

08-Aug-18 Conference J Peck re payment of compensation 
to solicitor re Estate of S Prien 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

08-Aug-18 Conference with M Greaves re payment of 
compensation to solicitor re Estate of Prien 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

08-Aug-18 Conference with A Watson and J Peck re GST 
issue and distribution to Estate of Prien 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

08-Aug-18 Reviewing correspondence and terms of 
distribution re Estate of Prien, drafting distribution 
agreement 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

08-Aug-18 Reviewing correspondence and terms of 
distribution re Estate of Prien, drafting distribution 
agreement 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

08-Aug-18 Conference with A Watson and J Peck re GST 
issue and distribution to Estate of Prien 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00

09-Aug-18 Settling distribution agreements re Estate of 
Prien, drafting email to solicitor for S Prien re 
same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

13-Aug-18 Telephone call with N Neagle re: progress re 
Estate of Prien, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

16-Aug-18 Reviewing note of J Jin re ELPD account 
reconciliation, replying to email re same 
considering further distributions 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

16-Aug-18 Reconciling ELPD Controlled Money account 
against unpresented cheques and outstanding 
distributions 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00

16-Aug-18 Email to J Peck re ELPD account reconciliation JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

16-Aug-18 Preparing spreadsheet re ELPD account 
reconciliation 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

22-Aug-18 Drafting email to C Zheng re unpresented cheque 
cancellation 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

23-Aug-18 Updating contact address re B Shiels, email to D 
Wood confirming same 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

30-Aug-18 Telephone call from E Davis, solicitor re Estate of 
Prien, drafting file note of same, making 
amendments to distribution agreement and 
replying to email re same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00

30-Aug-18 Conference with M Greaves re processing of 
payment to Estate of Prien 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

30-Aug-18 Reviewing email from Finance, drafting reply re 
unpresented cheques 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

30-Aug-18 Conference with J Peck re processing of payment 
to Estate of Prien 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

 5.10  $2,190.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.20 $158.00

 Jesse Jin $320.00 1.20 $384.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 3.50 $1,540.00

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.20 $108.00

  5.10 $2,190.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $2,190.00

 $2,190.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $2,409.00 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 April 2019     Due Date: 25 April 2019 
 

101101



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
14-03-2019 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 December 2018 to 31 December 

2018 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,840.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $184.00 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $2,024.00 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

102102



 

Page 2 of 6 

 

 
 
 

103103



 

Page 3 of 6 

 
 

104104



 

Page 4 of 6 

 

 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
04-Dec-18 Telephone call to J Barton re resolution of 

allocation dispute, drafting file note re same 
JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

04-Dec-18 Reviewing correspondence from multiple 
solicitors and statutory declarations completed re 
Barton allocation dispute, preparing for 
distribution of compensation to each party and 
preparation of cheques re same 

JSP 1.30 $440.00 $572.00

05-Dec-18 Preparing distribution documents for D Barton JSJ 0.80 $320.00 $256.00

10-Dec-18 Preparing payments of compensation to multiple 
claimants, telephone conference with and drafting 
and responding to emails from finance 
department re same 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00

11-Dec-18 Reviewing email from D Barton, telephone call to 
same and drafting file note of call 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

14-Dec-18 Confirming payment details and settling 
correspondence to multiple group members re 
payment of ELPD compensation 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00

 4.40  $1,840.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Jesse Jin $320.00 0.80 $256.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 3.60 $1,584.00

  4.40 $1,840.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,840.00

 $1,840.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $2,024.00 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 14 March 2019     Due Date: 28 March 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-04-2019 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 February 2018 to 28 February 

2018 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $6,582.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $658.20 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $7,240.20 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
05-Feb-18 Telephone call from Hall & Wilcox re claimant 

information, drafting note re same 
JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

05-Feb-18 Telephone call from solicitors of both parties in 
Jowett dispute, drafting notes re same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00

06-Feb-18 Responding to request re documentation from 
accountant of L Bennett 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

07-Feb-18 Reviewing outstanding disputes and contact with 
group members re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

08-Feb-18 Conference with M Greaves re outstanding ELPD 
distributions and unpresented cheques 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

08-Feb-18 Reviewing allocation disputes, preparing 
correspondence re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

08-Feb-18 Telephone call with D Barton re allocation 
dispute, draft file note re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

08-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re outstanding ELPD 
distributions and unpresented cheques 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00

08-Feb-18 Settling letter to claimants re unpresented 
cheques 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00

12-Feb-18 Reviewing correspondence from solicitor re L 
Jowett allocation dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

12-Feb-18 Drafting correspondence and arranging data for 
bulk correspondence re unpresentqed cheques 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

12-Feb-18 Return telephone call re J Nolan distribution, 
drafting file note and email re same 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00

12-Feb-18 Reviewing files and drafting file notes on 
unpresented cheques and outstanding 
distributions 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

13-Feb-18 Conference with S Camilleri re outstanding ELPD 
distributions and estate claims 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

13-Feb-18 Conference with A Watson re outstanding ELPD 
distribution 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

13-Feb-18 Drafting reply to email from J Nolan re provision 
of documents 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

13-Feb-18 Reviewing and drafting file note re unpresented 
cheques and outstanding distribution of 
compensation 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00

13-Feb-18 Telephone call to S Hider re unpresented 
cheque, drafting file note re same, cancelling 
cheque and preparing controlled money advice 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

13-Feb-18 Telephone call to the contact for the Estate of S 
Prien re outstanding grant of representation and 
payment, file note re same 

SUC 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

13-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re outstanding ELPD 
distributions and estate claims 

SUC 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

13-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re outstanding ELPD 
distribution 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
14-Feb-18 Conference with A Watson, M Greaves and J 

Peck re unpresented cheques and outstanding 
distributions 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

14-Feb-18 Drafting and preparing correspondence enclosing 
re-issued cheque, reviewing and updating data re 
controlled money withdrawal 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

14-Feb-18 Email to J Peck re Estate of S Prien re 
outstanding grant of representation and payment 
and file note re same 

SUC 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

14-Feb-18 Conference with A Watson, M Greaves and J 
Peck re unpresented cheques and outstanding 
distributions 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00

14-Feb-18 Conference with M Greaves, A Watson and J 
Peck re unpresented cheques and outstanding 
distributions 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00

15-Feb-18 Telephone call to H Singer, solicitor for L Jowett 
re allocation dispute, drafting note re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

15-Feb-18 Telephone call to I Zitars re disputed allocation, 
draft note re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

19-Feb-18 Conference with F Argus re processing allocation 
disputes and developer update to Matter Centre 
to facilitate resolution of disputes 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

19-Feb-18 Review outstanding allocation dispute, drafting 
notes re same, review process re resolving 
allocation disputes 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

19-Feb-18 Reviewing list of claimants with unpresented 
cheques, drafting notes re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

20-Feb-18 Telephone call to solicitor re L Jowett dispute, 
drafting correspondence re same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

21-Feb-18 Reivewing controlled monies account, contact 
with group members re unpresented cheques, 
drafting directives for further communication 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

22-Feb-18 Drafting reply correspondence re claim of L 
Jowett re taxation 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

22-Feb-18 Telephone call to contact re status of grant of 
representation for The Estate of Suzanne Prien 
and email to M Greaves and J Peck re same 

SUC 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

26-Feb-18 Conference with J Jin re Zitars distribution, 
update on Scheme progress 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

26-Feb-18 Conference with A Watson re distribution 
agreement re L Jowett allocation dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

26-Feb-18 Drafting solicitor undertaking re L Jowett 
allocation dispute 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

26-Feb-18 Drafting amendments to L Jowetts' solicitor 
undertaking re allocation dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

26-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re distribution agreement 
re L Jowett allocation dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00

26-Feb-18 Perusing draft correspondence re proposed 
distribution of ELPD funds to solicitors trust 
account, emailing J Peck re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
26-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re Zitars distribution, 

update on Scheme progress 
JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

27-Feb-18 Settling distribution agreement documents re 
Jowett allocation dispute, drafting emails to group 
members re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

27-Feb-18 Drafting filenote re unpresented cheque, contact 
chronology 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

27-Feb-18 Updating Matter Centre re correspondence re 
unpresented cheque 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

 14.50  $6,582.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.60 $474.00

 Jesse Jin $320.00 0.40 $128.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 12.50 $5,500.00

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.40 $216.00

 Samantha Camilleri $440.00 0.60 $264.00

  14.50 $6,582.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $6,582.00

 $6,582.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $7,240.20 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 April 2019     Due Date: 25 April 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
07-03-2018 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 January 2018 to 1 January 2018 

by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in the 
matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,388.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $138.80 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $1,526.80 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
08-Jan-18 Preparing data re outstanding distributions, email 

to M Greaves re same 
JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

08-Jan-18 Reviewing outstanding ELPD distribution list JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

09-Jan-18 Reviewing email from K Turan re ELPD enquiry 
and email to J Jin re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

12-Jan-18 Updating in-hand schedule for S Cox re amended 
split 

JSJ 0.70 $320.00 $224.00

12-Jan-18 Preparing documents re 10 Banbury Rd re 
amended split for KPMG review, email to J Kaye, 
KPMG re same 

JSJ 0.50 $320.00 $160.00

12-Jan-18 Loading updated NOA re 10 Banbury Rd with 
agreed split 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

15-Jan-18 Reviewing audited schedule, preparing CMA and 
correspondence re same 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00

16-Jan-18 Reviewing controlled money withdrawal authority 
re S Cox re ELPD compensation payment 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00

17-Jan-18 Conference with J Jin re unpresented cheques 
and outstanding distributions 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

17-Jan-18 Reviewing outstanding distributions and 
unpresented cheques 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

17-Jan-18 Conference with J Peck re unpresented cheques 
and outstanding distributions 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

17-Jan-18 Preparing unpresented cheque call-lists, email to 
J Peck re same 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

19-Jan-18 Drafting correspondence to solicitors re 
outstanding Jowett dispute 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

24-Jan-18 Conference with J Jin re outstanding distributions 
and unpresented cheques 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

24-Jan-18 Conference with J Peck re outstanding 
distributions and unpresented cheques 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

25-Jan-18 Updating unpresented cheque reconciliation list, 
email to J Peck re same 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

25-Jan-18 Updating Matter Centre with historical contact 
records re unpresented cheques 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

30-Jan-18 Drafting filenote re S Hider electoral roll search JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

30-Jan-18 Email to J Peck re S Hider electoral roll search JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

 3.90  $1,388.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Jesse Jin $320.00 2.90 $928.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 0.80 $352.00

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.20 $108.00

  3.90 $1,388.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,388.00

 $1,388.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $1,526.80 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 07 March 2018     Due Date: 21 March 2018 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-04-2019 
Matter Ref 3052536 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 

 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 July 2018 to 31 July 2018 by the 

Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $2,772.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $277.20 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $3,049.20 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
04-Jul-18 Reviewing correspondence from D Barton re 

outstanding allocation dispute 
JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

09-Jul-18 Drafting correspondence to J Barton re 
outstanding allocation dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

09-Jul-18 Reviewing correspondence from D Barton re 
outstanding allocation dispute and drafting reply 
correspondence 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

10-Jul-18 Conference with J Peck re modifying group 
member address details in Matter Centre and 
replying to group member emails re same 

ARU 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

10-Jul-18 Modifying group member address details in 
Matter Centre and replying to group member 
emails re same 

ARU 0.50 $320.00 $160.00

10-Jul-18 Conference with A Rutman re modifying group 
member address details in Matter Centre and 
replying to group member emails re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

10-Jul-18 Reviewing group member emails, drafting 
instructions for A Rutman to respond to same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00

10-Jul-18 Reviewing file note of A Rutman re replying to 
group member emails, drafting email to A 
Rutman re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

10-Jul-18 Responding to email from S Camilleri re Estate of 
Prien, outstanding distribution 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

11-Jul-18 Reviewing correspondence with group members 
and file note from A Rutman, setting aside 
correspondence for J Jin to action 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

12-Jul-18 Modifying group member address details in 
Matter Centre, drafting relevant file note and 
emailing J Peck re same 

ARU 0.70 $320.00 $224.00

12-Jul-18 Reviewing file note prepared by A Rutman re 
group member correspondence, drafting email to 
J Jin re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

17-Jul-18 Email to S Camilleri re response to enquiry of D 
Schwartz re ELPD claim 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

17-Jul-18 Reviewing enquiry from D Schwartz re ELPD 
claim, reviewing re various pieces of 
correspondence 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

20-Jul-18 Drafting email to E Davis, solicitor re Estate of 
Prien 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

23-Jul-18 Updating contact details for various group 
members 

JSJ 0.80 $320.00 $256.00

25-Jul-18 Drafting email to N Neagle re outstanding 
estates, advice re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

25-Jul-18 Drafting email to N Neagle re outstanding 
estates, advice re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

25-Jul-18 Updating contact details for multiple group 
members 

JSJ 0.70 $320.00 $224.00

26-Jul-18 Drafting reply email to E Davis, solicitor for Estate 
of Prien re outstanding distribution 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
26-Jul-18 Changing legal personality of D Hollyoak, drafting 

letter to confirm 
JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00

26-Jul-18 Updating various contact details per group 
member requests 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00

26-Jul-18 Multiple telephone calls to group members re 
confirm updated contact details 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00

26-Jul-18 Multiple emails to group members re confirming 
updated contact details 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00

30-Jul-18 Telephone calls to multiple group members re 
change of contact details 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00

30-Jul-18 Drafting email to J Jin re responding to advice re 
group member deaths 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

 7.50  $2,772.00

126126



 

Page 6 of 7 

 

Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Arielle Rutman $320.00 1.40 $448.00

 Jesse Jin $320.00 3.00 $960.00

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 3.10 $1,364.00

  7.50 $2,772.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $2,772.00

 $2,772.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052536    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: Property 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $3,049.20 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 April 2019     Due Date: 25 April 2019 
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402359279.1 

Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited      
ABN 21 105 657 949      
 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000     
 
PO Box 523, Melbourne VIC 3001 
 
DX 466 Melbourne 
 
 T (03) 9605 2700 
 F (03) 9258 9600 
 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
 

 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Western Australia,  
Northern Territory and South Australia. 

 

 

 

Murrindindi General Settlement Administration 
invoices 

1 December 2017 to 28 February 2023 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12-02-2018 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 December 2017 to 31 December 

2017 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $13,374.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $22,304.61 AUD 

Total GST Applied $3,567.86 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $39,246.47 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Dec-17 Multiple telephone calls and drafting and replying 

to correspondence from PwC re tax dispute 
JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

01-Dec-17 Review and amendment of material to be 
submitted to tax office re Notice of Objection 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

04-Dec-17 Perusing email S Rooke re Senior Counsel AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

05-Dec-17 Telephone conference with PwC and A Watson 
re replacing Senior Counsel re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

05-Dec-17 Preparation for telephone conference with PwC 
and drafting filenote re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

05-Dec-17 Conference with A Watson re various Scheme 
Administration issues 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

05-Dec-17 Preparing material re tax dispute JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

05-Dec-17 Telephone conference with PwC and J Peck re 
replacing Senior Counsel re tax dispute 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

05-Dec-17 Conference with J Peck re various Scheme 
Administration issues 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

05-Dec-17 Perusing email PWC re conference with senior 
counsel 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

05-Dec-17 Perusing email PWC re response to ATO 
requests 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

06-Dec-17 Reviewing email from PwC re tax dispute update, 
drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

06-Dec-17 Telephone call to J Boyagi, PwC re tax dispute, 
note re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

08-Dec-17 Conference with R Lyng re handover of various 
scheme administration tasks 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

08-Dec-17 Reviewing account reconciliation RWL 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

08-Dec-17 Conference with J Peck re handover of various 
scheme administration tasks 

RWL 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

11-Dec-17 Considering mechanism for resolving and 
auditing allocation disputes, executing same 
including collating documents for KPMG review 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

11-Dec-17 Drafting update letter to group members re 
taxation, drafting email to A Watson re same 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

11-Dec-17 Drafting and sending email to E Coombe Heath 
re update letter report 

RWL 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

11-Dec-17 Peruse email PWC re conference with new senior 
counsel 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

12-Dec-17 Telephone call from PwC, draftingfile note re 
same, considering questions set out by ATO 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

12-Dec-17 Reviewing fee estimates of PwC and other 
materials, drafting and responding to emails re 
costs set aside re same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

12-Dec-17 Conference with M Greaves re tax dispute and 
tasks re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
12-Dec-17 Amending letter to group members re tax update, 

drafting email to PwC re same 
JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

12-Dec-17 Drafting file note on tax dispute and progress, 
tasks re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

12-Dec-17 Reviewing email from R Lyng re PwC fee 
estimate for tax dispute, reviewing previous 
correspondence and replied re same 

MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

12-Dec-17 Conference with R Lyng re preparation of 
memorandum to J White, costs assessor 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Dec-17 Conference with A Watson and R Lyng re 
preparation of memorandum to J White, costs 
assessor 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Dec-17 Conference with J Peck re tax dispute and tasks 
re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Dec-17 Conference with M Greaves re preparation of 
memorandum to J White, costs assessor 

RWL 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Dec-17 Conference with A Watson and M Greaves re 
preparation of memorandum to J White, costs 
assessor 

RWL 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Dec-17 Drafting handover memorandum RWL 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

12-Dec-17 Conference with R Lyng and M Greaves re 
preparation of memorandum to J White, costs 
assessor 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

13-Dec-17 Preparing data for mass mail out re providing tax 
update 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

13-Dec-17 Collating information, documentation and drafting 
memorandum to PwC re reponding to ATO's 
request for further information 

JSP 1.70 $440.00 $748.00 

13-Dec-17 Reviewing billing by PwC and work completed, 
drafting email re processing invoice 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

13-Dec-17 Preparing notes on taxation dispute re provision 
to Special Cost Referee 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

13-Dec-17 Drafting file note to outline work completed re tax 
dispute to include in memorandum to Special 
Cost Referee 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

13-Dec-17 Responding to email from PwC re material re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

13-Dec-17 Drafting email to M Greaves re tax dispute JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

13-Dec-17 Drafting memorandum to J White, costs 
assessor, in preparation for Case Management 
Conference 

MYG 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

13-Dec-17 Drafting handover memorandum, communication 
task list memorandum and preparation for second 
potential distribution memorandum 

RWL 1.70 $540.00 $918.00 

13-Dec-17 Drafting afffidavit of A Watson re settlement 
distribution progress update 

RWL 0.80 $540.00 $432.00 

14-Dec-17 Conference with M Greaves and R Lyng re 
settlement administration tasks and next steps 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
14-Dec-17 Drafting affidavit re progress on tax dispute JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

14-Dec-17 Drafting email to M Greaves re tax dispute and 
tasks re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

14-Dec-17 Multiple telephone calls with PwC re status and 
progress re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

14-Dec-17 Preparing text and data for mass mail out to 
group members re tax dispute 

JSP 1.40 $440.00 $616.00 

14-Dec-17 Conference with J Peck and R Lyng re settlement 
administration tasks and next steps 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

14-Dec-17 Conference with M Greaves and J Peck re 
settlement administration tasks and next steps 

RWL 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

15-Dec-17 Reviewing multiple emails from J Peck re 
progress of tax dispute 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

15-Dec-17 Telephone call from N Dickson, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re provision of invoices re tax dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

18-Dec-17 Reviewing previous affidavits, court orders and 
material provided to J White, costs assessor re 
drafting memorandum to J White re seeking 
approval for costs 

MYG 0.70 $540.00 $378.00 

18-Dec-17 Reviewing proformas and updating bushfires 
matter costs summaries 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

19-Dec-17 Reviewing email from N Dickson, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers, re provision of 
affidavit material for notice of objection re tax 
dispute and replied re same, including uploading 
affidavit material to Collaborate 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

19-Dec-17 Telephone call from J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, provision of affidavit material for notice 
of objection re tax dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

19-Dec-17 Further email to J Boyagi and N Dickson re 
provision of further affidavit material for notice of 
objection re tax dispute, including uploading 
further material to Collaborate 

MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

19-Dec-17 Telephone call to N Dickson, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, update re provision of hard copy brief re 
notice of objection re tax dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

19-Dec-17 Email from and to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, provision of hard copy brief re notice of 
objection re tax dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

19-Dec-17 Reviewing hard copy brief from Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re Notice of Objection 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

19-Dec-17 Preparing update letter mailout re tax dispute 
including reviewing data extracts and sample 
merges 

RWL 2.00 $540.00 $1,080.00 

19-Dec-17 Reviewing merge data and letter text for 
December 2017 taxation mailout 

JSJ 1.00 $320.00 $320.00 

19-Dec-17 Email to F Argus re bulk mailout list, telephone 
calls re same 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
19-Dec-17 Preparing and reviewing merged letters for 

provision to LIO 
JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

20-Dec-17 Telephone call to N Dickson, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, re notice of objection re tax dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

20-Dec-17 Telephone conference with A Watson re notice of 
objection re tax dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

20-Dec-17 Telephone call from N Dickson, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, re provision of material in notice of 
objection re tax dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

20-Dec-17 Email to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse Coopers, re 
instructions to lodge notice of objection re tax 
dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

20-Dec-17 Telephone conference with A Watson re 
instructions to lodge notice of objection re tax 
dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

20-Dec-17 Drafting handover memorandum RWL 1.50 $540.00 $810.00 

20-Dec-17 Telephone conference with M Greaves re notice 
of objection re tax dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

20-Dec-17 Telephone conference with M Greaves re 
instructions to lodge notice of objection re tax 
dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

21-Dec-17 Further drafting of handover memorandum RWL 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

22-Dec-17 Finalising handover memorandum RWL 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

 27.30  $13,374.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 1.00 $790.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 1.90 $608.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 12.00 $5,280.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 4.20 $2,268.00 

 Roisin Lyng $540.00 8.20 $4,428.00 

  27.30 $13,374.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $13,374.00 

 $13,374.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
08-Dec-2017 Expert Fees - PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 37106275 (2of2) (MDI 

Portion) 
$22,304.61 

 $22,304.61 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $22,304.61 

 $22,304.61 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $39,246.47 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 12 February 2018     Due Date: 26 February 2018 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
07-03-2018 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 January 2018 to 31 January 

2018 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $9,882.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $113.48 AUD 

Total GST Applied $999.55 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $10,995.03 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
04-Jan-18 Drafting memorandum for J White, costs 

assessor, in preparation for Case Management 
Conference 

MYG 1.80 $540.00 $972.00 

08-Jan-18 Reviewing email from J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, re update from Tax Commissioner re 
taxation dispute and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

08-Jan-18 Drafting costs summaries for J White Report 
attachment A 

JSJ 1.10 $320.00 $352.00 

08-Jan-18 Reviewing J White Third Report and auditing 
costs approved by court 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

10-Jan-18 Drafting memorandum to J White, costs 
assessor, in preparation for Case Management 
Conference 

MYG 0.90 $540.00 $486.00 

10-Jan-18 Settling memorandum to independent costs 
expert re administration costs 

AJW 0.60 $790.00 $474.00 

11-Jan-18 Drafting memorandum to J White, costs 
assessor, in preparation for Case Management 
Conference 

MYG 2.60 $540.00 $1,404.00 

11-Jan-18 Further drafting and reviewing memorandum to J 
White, costs assessor, in preparation for Case 
Management Conference 

MYG 0.90 $540.00 $486.00 

12-Jan-18 Preparing and finalising various stack graphs re 
costs and email to J White, costs assessor re 
same 

MYG 1.40 $540.00 $756.00 

12-Jan-18 Email to J Jin to review draft memorandum to J 
White, costs assessor, in preparation for Case 
Management Conference 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Jan-18 Reviewing and amending memorandum for J 
White, costs assessor in preparation for Case 
Management Conference and email to A Watson 
re same 

MYG 1.20 $540.00 $648.00 

12-Jan-18 Preparing brief for J White, costs assessor MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

12-Jan-18 Conference with A Watson re memorandum to J 
White, costs assessor, in preparation of Case 
Management Conference 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Jan-18 Conference with M Greaves re memorandum to J 
White, costs assessor, in preparation of Case 
Management Conference 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

12-Jan-18 Review draft advice to court appointed expert, 
draft email to M Greaves re same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

15-Jan-18 Reviewing email from A Watson re amendments 
to memorandum to J White, costs assessor, 
replied re same, and reviewing and amending 
memorandum re same 

MYG 0.80 $540.00 $432.00 

15-Jan-18 Finalising brief to J White, costs assessor MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

15-Jan-18 Conducting mailout of taxation dispute 
bouncebacks 

JSJ 0.60 $320.00 $192.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
16-Jan-18 Reviewing Notice of Objection re tax dispute and 

material submitted, drafting notes re same, 
drafting correspondence to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re update 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

16-Jan-18 Reviewing handover note and considering 
outstanding tasks re settlement distribution 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

16-Jan-18 Finalising memorandum to J White, costs 
assessor, in preparation for Case Management 
Conference and email to J White re same 

MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

24-Jan-18 Drafting email to K Rowe re progress re tax 
dispute and potential proceeding 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

24-Jan-18 Collating and drafting notes re material to provide 
to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

25-Jan-18 Conference with A Watson re tax dispute and 
upcoming case management conference 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

25-Jan-18 Drafting and preparing material for witness 
statements re tax dispute 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

25-Jan-18 Conference with J Peck re tax dispute and 
upcoming case management conference 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

29-Jan-18 Conference with E Mukherji re next case 
conference, correspondence with Centrelink, 
further steps re finalising distribution process 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

29-Jan-18 Reviewing Supreme Court Forms re change of 
address, considering same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

29-Jan-18 Telephone call to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
tax, draft file note re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

29-Jan-18 Preparing material and drafting affidavit re tax 
dispute 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

29-Jan-18 Conference with J Peck re next case conference, 
correspondence with Centrelink, further steps re 
finalising distribution process 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

30-Jan-18 Preparing material and drafting affidavit re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

30-Jan-18 Reviewing email from E Tsalanidis, Supreme 
Court of Victoria, re upcoming case management 
conference 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

31-Jan-18 Preparing material and drafting affidavit re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

 19.50  $9,882.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 1.20 $948.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.20 $122.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 2.10 $672.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 5.00 $2,200.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 11.00 $5,940.00 

  19.50 $9,882.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $9,882.00 

 $9,882.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
15-Jan-2018 Photocopying Charges - Law In Order Pty Ltd - Invoice 392725 $113.48 

 $113.48 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $113.48 

 $113.48 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $10,995.03 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 07 March 2018     Due Date: 21 March 2018 
 

147147



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
09-05-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 February 2018 to 28 February 

2018 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $14,262.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $32,898.84 AUD 

Total GST Applied $4,716.08 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $51,876.92 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Feb-18 Drafting internal email re next case management 

conference 
JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

01-Feb-18 Reviewing correspondence and drafting email to 
Supreme Court of Victoria re next Case 
Management Conference 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

01-Feb-18 Conference with A Watson re ATO 
correspondence and instructing Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

01-Feb-18 Reviewing correspondence from 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re ATO 
correspondence, drafting reply email 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

01-Feb-18 Preparing material and drafting affidavits re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

01-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re ATO correspondence 
and instructing Pricewaterhouse Coopers 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

01-Feb-18 Perusing ATO correspondence and 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers email 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

01-Feb-18 Perusing email from J Peck to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, perusing Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
reply 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

02-Feb-18 Preparing material and drafting affidavit re tax 
dispute 

JSP 1.60 $440.00 $704.00 

05-Feb-18 Telephone call with Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
letter to ATO, draft file note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

05-Feb-18 Drafting multiple emails to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re ATO correspondence, drafting 
multiple emails to A Watson re ATO 
correspondence 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

05-Feb-18 Reviewing and drafting amendments to reply 
correspondence to ATO re tax dispute 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

05-Feb-18 Drafting correspondence to group members who 
have not presented cheques, drafting email to A 
Watson re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

05-Feb-18 Perusing proposed Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
correspondence and J Peck markups 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

06-Feb-18 Telephone call from Supreme Court of Victoria re 
Case Management Conference and updating 
group members, draft note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

06-Feb-18 Conference with M Greaves re material and steps 
for next Case Management Conference 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

06-Feb-18 Drafting email to Supreme Court of Victoria and 
group members re upcoming Case Management 
Conference 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

06-Feb-18 Conference with A Watson re upcoming case 
management conference and filing material re 
same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

06-Feb-18 Preparing material and drafting tax affidavit for 
upcoming Case Management Conference 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
06-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re material and steps for 

next Case Management Conference 
MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

06-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re upcoming case 
management conference and filing material re 
same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

07-Feb-18 Preparing material and drafting tax affidavit for 
upcoming Case Management Conference 

JSP 1.40 $440.00 $616.00 

07-Feb-18 Responding to email from gorup member's 
solicitor re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

08-Feb-18 Reviewing and amending draft witness affidavits 
re tax dispute 

JSP 1.10 $440.00 $484.00 

08-Feb-18 Reviewing email from J White, costs assessor, re 
access to system databases and replied re same 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

09-Feb-18 Reviewing email from Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
re tax dispute, telephone call to N Dickson, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers, drafting reply email 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

09-Feb-18 Collating material and preparing draft affidavits re 
tax dispute, drafting email to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re same 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

12-Feb-18 Reviewing correspondence from 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute and draft 
reply email 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

12-Feb-18 Reviewing invoice from Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, drafting notes re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

13-Feb-18 Conference with A Watson re tax dispute and 
instructing Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

13-Feb-18 Reviewing email from PwC, telephone call to J 
Boyagui, PwC, drafting instructions 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

13-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re tax dispute and 
instructing Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

13-Feb-18 Perusing email re tax issue AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

13-Feb-18 Perusing and considering memorandum re 
outstanding payments 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

14-Feb-18 Conference with Pricewaterhouse Coopers and A 
Watson re update on tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

14-Feb-18 Drafting file note of conference with 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

14-Feb-18 Conference with Pricewaterhouse Coopers and J 
Peck re update on tax dispute 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

14-Feb-18 Emailing Pricewaterhouse Coopers re taxation 
dispute 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

16-Feb-18 Reviewing draft affidavit material, drafting email 
to M Greaves re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

17-Feb-18 Preparing affidavit to be filed ahead of March 
Case Management Conference 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

18-Feb-18 Preparing affidavit to be filed ahead of March 
Case Management Conference 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
19-Feb-18 Drafting reply email to K Nishimura re upcoming 

Case Management Conference 
JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

19-Feb-18 Drafting affidavit material in preparation for 
upcoming Case Management Conference 

JSP 1.10 $440.00 $484.00 

20-Feb-18 Draft multiple emails to Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
re tax dispute, review notice of appeal and other 
correspondence 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

20-Feb-18 Preparing affidavit re progress on tax dispute JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

20-Feb-18 Reviewing email from J White, costs assessor, re 
request for disbursement samples for review in 
preparation for preparing report for Case 
Management Conference and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

21-Feb-18 Multiple conferences with A Watson re affidavit 
and preparing for case management conference 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

21-Feb-18 Preparing affidavit material ahead of Case 
Management Conference 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

21-Feb-18 Multiple conferences with J Peck re affidavit and 
preparing for Case Management Conference 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

21-Feb-18 Settling affidavit for Case Management 
Conference 

AJW 0.90 $790.00 $711.00 

22-Feb-18 Reviewing and drafting reply correspondence 
from Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

22-Feb-18 Preparing affidavit material ahead of Case 
Management Conference 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

23-Feb-18 Conferene with M Greaves re preparation of 
affidavit material ahead of Case Management 
Conference 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

23-Feb-18 Collating documents and preparing affidavit 
material, review same, draft multiple emails re 
same 

JSP 1.90 $440.00 $836.00 

23-Feb-18 Conference with J Peck re preparation of affidavit 
material ahead of Case Management Conference 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

23-Feb-18 Reviewing and updating affidavit in preparation 
for Case Management Conference 

MYG 0.70 $540.00 $378.00 

26-Feb-18 Further reviewing and updating affidavit in 
preparation for Case Management Conference 
and email to J White, costs assessor, re same 

MYG 0.80 $540.00 $432.00 

26-Feb-18 Multiple emails to and from J Peck re confidential 
exhibits re costs report by J White, costs 
assessor 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

26-Feb-18 Email to J White, costs assessor, re confidential 
exhibits 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-Feb-18 Preparing affidavit material in anticipation of Case 
Management Conference on 20 March 2018 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

27-Feb-18 Reviewing and finalising affidavit in preparation 
for Case Management Conference 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

27-Feb-18 Reviewing updated confidential exhibit re tax 
dispute in advance of Case Management 
Conference 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
27-Feb-18 Settling exhibit re tax issues for Case 

Management Conference affidavit 
AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

28-Feb-18 Multiple conferences with M Greaves re 
preparing affidavit material in advance of Case 
Management Conference 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

28-Feb-18 Telephone call and drafting and responding to 
multiple emails to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
tax dispute, draft note re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

28-Feb-18 Preparing affidavit material for affidavit ahead of 
Case Management Conference, including 
collating exhibits 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

28-Feb-18 Preparing affidavit material including collating and 
formatting exhibits 

JSP 1.70 $440.00 $748.00 

28-Feb-18 Reviewing and amending affidavit in preparation 
for Case Management Conference and email to A 
Watson to finalise re same 

MYG 1.10 $540.00 $594.00 

28-Feb-18 Multiple conferences with J Peck re preparing 
affidavit material in advance of Case 
Management Conference 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

28-Feb-18 Reviewing email and amendments to affidavit 
from A Watson and finalising affidavit re same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

28-Feb-18 Multiple emails to and from J White, costs 
assessor, re provision of finalised affidavit in 
preparation for Case Management Conference 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

28-Feb-18 Multiple emails to and from J Peck and D Wood 
re preparing exhibits for affidavit for filing in 
advance of Case Management Conference 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

28-Feb-18 Settling affidavit for Case Management 
Conference 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

28-Feb-18 Perusing draft amendments suggested by 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers to confidential tax 
exhibit, emailing J Peck re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

 28.80  $14,262.00 

154154



 

Page 8 of 10 

 

Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 3.20 $2,528.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 20.90 $9,196.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 4.70 $2,538.00 

  28.80 $14,262.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $14,262.00 

 $14,262.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
09-Feb-2018 Expert Fees - PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 38001717 (MDI 

Portion) (2of2) 
$32,898.84 

 $32,898.84 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $32,898.84 

 $32,898.84 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $51,876.92 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 09 May 2019     Due Date: 23 May 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-04-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 March 2018 to 31 March 2018 by 

the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $18,555.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $32,678.48 AUD 

Total GST Applied $5,123.35 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $56,356.83 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Mar-18 Reviewing finalised affidavit material in 

preparation for filing 
MYG 0.90 $540.00 $486.00 

01-Mar-18 Conference with A Watson re swearing affidavit 
in preparation for Case Management Conference 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

01-Mar-18 Multiple conferences with J Peck to discuss the 
filing of affidavit material and responses to court 
and group member correspondence re tax 
dispute and upcoming Case Management 
Conference 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

01-Mar-18 Conference with M Greaves re swearing affidavit 
in preparation for Case Management Conference 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

01-Mar-18 Review and consider Australlian Taxation Office 
decision re objection 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

01-Mar-18 Telephone call from Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
tax dispute, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

01-Mar-18 Multiple conferences with A Watson to discuss 
the filing of affidavit material and responses to 
court and group member correspondence re tax 
dispute and upcoming Case Management 
Conference 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

01-Mar-18 Reviewing and responding to group member 
correspondence and correspondence from the 
Court re tax dispute and filing of material 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

01-Mar-18 Preparing affidavit material including drafting 
amendments to material, collating documents 
and witnessing swearing 

JSP 1.30 $440.00 $572.00 

01-Mar-18 Reviewing objection decision by Australlian 
Taxation Office 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

02-Mar-18 Email from and to J White, costs assessor, re 
provision of disbursement invoices for costs 
report 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

02-Mar-18 Multiple emails to and from J White, costs 
assessor, re provision of further material for costs 
report 

MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

02-Mar-18 Multiple conferences with J Peck re affidavit 
material and the upcoming Case Management 
Conference 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

02-Mar-18 Multiple conferences with M Greaves re affidavit 
material and the upcoming Case Management 
Conference 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

02-Mar-18 Preparing material for physical filing of affidavit, 
travel to Registry of Supreme Court of Victoria, 
filing document 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

02-Mar-18 Drafting multiple emails to Supreme Court of 
Victoria re filing affidavit material 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

05-Mar-18 Reviewing draft report from J White, costs 
assessor, in preparation for Case Management 
Conference 

MYG 0.80 $540.00 $432.00 

161161



 

Page 5 of 11 

 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
05-Mar-18 Reviewing second draft report from J White, 

costs assessor, in preparation for Case 
Management Conference and email to J White re 
same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

05-Mar-18 Multiple emails to and from A Watson and J Peck 
re review of draft report of J White, costs 
assessor 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

05-Mar-18 Multiple emails to and from J White, costs 
assessor, re review of draft costs report 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

05-Mar-18 Review draft cost assessor's report and 
attachments 

AJW 0.70 $790.00 $553.00 

05-Mar-18 Review email from M Greaves re draft cost 
assessor's report, draft reply; review email from J 
Peck re contact with Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
and draft reply 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

05-Mar-18 Review draft email from J Peck to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers, draft email in reply, 
review response from J Peck 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

05-Mar-18 Reviewing Special Referee for Costs Fourth 
Report, drafting file notes and email 
correspondence re same, multiple telephone calls 
to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

06-Mar-18 Reviewing Pricewaterhouse Coopers outline of 
Australlian Taxation Office decision, drafting reply 
email to Pricewaterhouse Coopers 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

07-Mar-18 Reviewing affidavit material, uploading to 
Collaborate and drafting email to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

07-Mar-18 Reviewing interest figures re tax liability JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

08-Mar-18 Reviewing invoices of KPMG, drafting and 
replying to correspondence re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

08-Mar-18 Reviewing witness affidavits re tax dispute JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

09-Mar-18 Drafting amendments to affidavits re taxation 
dispute, drafting correspondence to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

13-Mar-18 Preparing material for Case Management 
Conference 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

14-Mar-18 Conference with M Greaves and J Peck re 
preparing for Case Management Conference 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

14-Mar-18 Conference with M Greaves and J Peck re 
preparing for Case Management Conference 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

14-Mar-18 Conference with A Watson re preparing for 
conference with Pricewaterhouse Coopers and 
counsel re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

14-Mar-18 Reviewing correspondence from Supreme Court 
of Victoria re upcoming Case Management 
Conference, drafting reply re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

14-Mar-18 Multiple telephone calls with J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re conference with 
counsel re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
14-Mar-18 Review of Notice of Appeal re Australlian 

Taxation Office decision, affidavit amendments re 
same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

14-Mar-18 Review draft affidavit, draft email J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re suggested 
additional materials 

AJW 0.40 $790.00 $316.00 

14-Mar-18 Conference with J Peck re preparing for 
conference with Pricewaterhouse Coopers and 
counsel 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

14-Mar-18 Conference with D Bloom, F Cameron and D 
McInerney of Counsel, S Rooke and N Dickson of 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and J Peck re tax 
dispute 

AJW 0.70 $790.00 $553.00 

15-Mar-18 Conference with D Bloom, F Cameron and D 
McInerney of counsel, S Rooke and N Dickson of 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and A Watson re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

15-Mar-18 Preparing for conference with Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers and counsel re tax dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

15-Mar-18 Conference with A Watson re instructing 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

15-Mar-18 Multiple telephone calls with Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

15-Mar-18 Settling amendments to correspondence to the 
Supreme Court of Victoria re Case Management 
Conference and affidavit material 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

15-Mar-18 Drafting email to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

15-Mar-18 Conference with J Peck re instructing 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

15-Mar-18 Settling response to Court re materials to be 
relied upon at Case Management Conference 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

16-Mar-18 Drafting email to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

16-Mar-18 Telephone call from N Dickson, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

16-Mar-18 Preparing for Case Management Conference 
including reviewing and updating distribution 
progress notes 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

16-Mar-18 Reviewing and replying to email correspondence 
from Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute, 
drafting correspondence to K Rowe re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

16-Mar-18 Preparation re Case Management Conference AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

19-Mar-18 Multiple conferences with J Peck re preparing for 
Case Management Conference 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

19-Mar-18 Preparation re Case Management Conference AJW 2.10 $790.00 $1,659.00 

19-Mar-18 Telephone call to K Rowe re tax dipsute, draft file 
note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
19-Mar-18 Multiple conferences with A Watson re preparing 

for Case Management Conference 
JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

19-Mar-18 Drafting orders in preparation for Case 
Management Conference 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

19-Mar-18 Drafting correspondence re preparing links to 
affidvaits filed with Court, reviewing same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

19-Mar-18 Telephone call to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
progress on filing of tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

19-Mar-18 Drafting correspondence to Supreme Court of 
Victoria re Case Management Conference 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

19-Mar-18 Drafting file notes and preparing material for 
Case Management Conference 

JSP 1.40 $440.00 $616.00 

20-Mar-18 Attendance at Case Management Conference AJW 0.50 $790.00 $395.00 

20-Mar-18 Settling proposed orders AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

20-Mar-18 Draft amendments to proposed Orders JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

20-Mar-18 Attendance at Case Management Conference JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

20-Mar-18 Preparation for Case Management Conference 
including collation and review of material 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

20-Mar-18 Draft email to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
witness conferences and Case Management 
Conference 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

20-Mar-18 Review transcript of Case Management 
Conference 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

20-Mar-18 Draft and settling amendments to proposed 
Orders, drafting correspondence re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

21-Mar-18 Perusing media request re Australlian Taxation 
Office dispute, conference with C Scott and J 
Peck re same, settling response 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

22-Mar-18 Drafting email to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
media article re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

22-Mar-18 Reviewing Orders of Court, drafting email to A 
Watson re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

22-Mar-18 Drafting email to Argenta re group member re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

22-Mar-18 Drafting email to K Rowe re conference re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

22-Mar-18 Perusing email J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, re materials for affidavit 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

26-Mar-18 Drafting summary of Murrindindi settlement 
administration costs orders 

JSJ 0.80 $320.00 $256.00 

26-Mar-18 Preparing file of correspondence sent to K Rowe 
for tax dispute, email to J Peck re same 

JSJ 1.60 $320.00 $512.00 

26-Mar-18 Preparing file of documents re K Rowe sent to 
RMCG, email to J Peck re same 

JSJ 0.70 $320.00 $224.00 

26-Mar-18 Preparing file of documents re K Rowe sent to A 
Keogh 

JSJ 0.90 $320.00 $288.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
26-Mar-18 Telephone call from K Nishimura re tax dispute re 

Case Management Conference and potential for 
further distribution 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

26-Mar-18 Conference with A Watson re material for witness 
packs re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

26-Mar-18 Reviewing further requests for material from 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers, collating same and 
drafting file note re same 

JSP 1.80 $440.00 $792.00 

26-Mar-18 Conference with J Peck re material for witness 
packs re tax dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

27-Mar-18 Further preparing file of documents re K Rowe 
sent to A Keogh, email to J Peck re same 

JSJ 0.80 $320.00 $256.00 

27-Mar-18 Reviewing and collating further material for 
counsel as per Pricewaterhouse Coopers's 
instructions, re tax dispute 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

27-Mar-18 Preparation for conference with Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re further material requested by counsel 
re tax dspute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

27-Mar-18 Multiple conferences with A Watson re filing the 
Notice of appeal and instructing Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

27-Mar-18 Multiple telephone calls to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, drafting and replying to emails from 
same, drafting file notes re communication 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

27-Mar-18 Review and collate documents, draft email to K 
Rowe re witness material re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

27-Mar-18 Multiple conferences with J Peck re filing the 
Notice of appeal and instructing Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

27-Mar-18 Peruse email J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
re lodgement of Tax appeal 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

28-Mar-18 Drafting update letter to group members re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

28-Mar-18 Perusing email from J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re Case Management Conference for 
tax appeal 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

29-Mar-18 Reviewing and settling update correspondence to 
group members re tax dispute 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

29-Mar-18 Perusing and settling draft correspondence with 
group members re proposed alternative dispute 
resolution 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

30-Mar-18 Drafting further file note for Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re material requested by counsel re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

30-Mar-18 Collating and reviewing material, drafting further 
file note to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re materials 
requested re tax dispute 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

 36.90  $18,555.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 7.30 $5,767.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 4.80 $1,536.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 21.40 $9,416.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 3.40 $1,836.00 

  36.90 $18,555.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $18,555.00 

 $18,555.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
05-Mar-2018 Expert Fees - KPMG - Invoice 821100186 $1,539.55 

08-Mar-2018 Expert Fees - PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 38012670 (MDI 
Portion) (2of2) 

$31,138.93 

 $32,678.48 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $32,678.48 

 $32,678.48 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $56,356.83 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 April 2019     Due Date: 25 April 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
15-06-2018 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 April 2018 to 30 April 2018 by the 

Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $13,684.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $53,585.55 AUD 

Total GST Applied $6,662.46 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $73,932.01 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
03-Apr-18 Reviewing request for further material re tax 

dispute by Pricewaterhouse Coopers, collating 
material and drafting correspondence re same 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

03-Apr-18 Telephone call from Pricewaterhouse Coopers, 
draft file note re same, draft email to A Watson re 
same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

03-Apr-18 Reviewing account summaries and drafting email 
to Controlled Money team re tax dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

03-Apr-18 Telephone conference with A Watson re 
materials requested by Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

03-Apr-18 Telephone conference with C Zheng re account 
summaries and materials requested by 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

03-Apr-18 Telephone conference with J Peck re materials 
requested by Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax 
dispute 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

03-Apr-18 Review email of J Peck re conference with 
counsel 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

03-Apr-18 Drafting filenote re correspondence history with K 
Rowe, preparing zip file of all correspondence 

JSJ 0.60 $320.00 $192.00 

03-Apr-18 Preparing and collating material re tax dispute JSJ 1.30 $320.00 $416.00 

04-Apr-18 Locating emails re establishing and maintaining 
investment of funds; emails re same 

BWD 0.50 $790.00 $395.00 

04-Apr-18 Preparing and collating material re tax dispute, 
drafting notes re same 

JSP 1.10 $440.00 $484.00 

04-Apr-18 Telephone call to K Rowe re conference with 
counsel re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

04-Apr-18 Preparing and collating material re tax dispute, 
drafting file note re same 

JSP 1.70 $440.00 $748.00 

05-Apr-18 Telephone conference with J Boyagi, N Dickson, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

05-Apr-18 Collating and drafting material for 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re previous 
settlements re tax dispute 

JSP 1.90 $440.00 $836.00 

05-Apr-18 Preparing and collating material for 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

05-Apr-18 Reviewing and settling memorandums to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

05-Apr-18 Perusing email from J Peck re settlement 
administration experience and drafting reply 

AJW 0.40 $790.00 $316.00 

06-Apr-18 Perusing filesite to locate materials re tax dispute, 
email to J Peck attaching same 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

06-Apr-18 Reviewing chronology of investment of 
Murrindindi Class Action settlement funds 

JSJ 0.70 $320.00 $224.00 

06-Apr-18 Reviewing data and preparing document on 
settlement information for Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
06-Apr-18 Drafting memorandum to Pricewaterhouse 

Coopers re-investment of funds re tax dispute 
JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

07-Apr-18 Reviewing and amending various material 
prepared for Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

09-Apr-18 Drafting email to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

09-Apr-18 Reviewing, amending memorandums to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re various information, 
drafting email to A Watson re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

10-Apr-18 Drafting reply email to D Wood re group member 
enquiry re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

10-Apr-18 Settling group member update AJW 0.50 $790.00 $395.00 

11-Apr-18 Reviewing and drafting amendments to group 
correspondence re tax dispute, drafting email to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

11-Apr-18 Reviewing various sources of data and drafting 
file note on sums re taxation dispute 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

12-Apr-18 Telephone call to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
update re tax dispute, drafting note re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

12-Apr-18 Reviewing and settling tax update letter, 
reviewing mail merge data, drafting instructions 
for IT 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

12-Apr-18 Preparing material for tax dispute to provide to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers including reviewing 
spreadsheet re: communications re: investment 
of settlement money 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

13-Apr-18 Reviewing and settling material to send 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 1.20 $440.00 $528.00 

13-Apr-18 Drafting parametres and liaising with F Argus re 
mass mail out re update to group members, 
executing and reviewing sample correspondence 

JSP 1.20 $440.00 $528.00 

13-Apr-18 Drafting and settling correspondence to insurer 
group members re tax dispute 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

13-Apr-18 Preparing taxation update letter physical mailout JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

13-Apr-18 Auditing taxation update letter electronic mailout JSJ 0.50 $320.00 $160.00 

13-Apr-18 Multiple emails to F Argus and J Peck re taxation 
update letter mail merge 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

13-Apr-18 Reviewing index of tax dispute relevant 
documents, email to J Peck re same 

JSJ 0.80 $320.00 $256.00 

13-Apr-18 Drafting letters to insurers re taxation update JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

13-Apr-18 Preparing zip file of relevant pro forma letters 
sent to K Rowe 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

13-Apr-18 Perusing and settling materials to counsel for 
preparation of affidavit materials 

AJW 0.50 $790.00 $395.00 

16-Apr-18 Conference with J Peck re group member 
correspondence re tax dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
16-Apr-18 Perusing email and website re group member 

complaints, conference with J Peck and C Scott 
re issues related to same, perusing materials re 
previous complaints 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

16-Apr-18 Filing correspondence to insurers re taxation 
dispute update 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

16-Apr-18 Reviewing Filesite to locate Murrindindi sample 
group member assessment guidelines, email to J 
Peck re same 

JSJ 0.50 $320.00 $160.00 

16-Apr-18 Conference with A Watson re group member 
correspondence re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

16-Apr-18 Multiple telephone calls with Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

16-Apr-18 Reviewing material on investment of settlement 
funds re tax dispute, drafting email to J Jin re 
same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

16-Apr-18 Reviewing bushfire group correspondence, 
drafting email to Y Iqbal re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

16-Apr-18 Reviewing material re bushfire complaint website, 
discussions with A Watson and C Scott re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

16-Apr-18 Drafting email to K Turan and D Wood re 
responding to group member enquiries 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

16-Apr-18 Reviewing further requests by Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers for further information, drafting response 
re same 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

16-Apr-18 Reviewing response questionnaire and test case 
funding application re tax dispute, drafting email 
to A Watson re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

16-Apr-18 Reviewing various material provided by 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute, drafting 
email to A Watson re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

17-Apr-18 Preparing material to send to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute, drafting and replying to 
multiple emails from Pricewaterhouse Coopers 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

17-Apr-18 Drafting email response to group member enquiry 
re tax update 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

18-Apr-18 Telephone call to N Dickson, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re test case funding 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

18-Apr-18 Drafting and responding to multiple emails to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

18-Apr-18 Reviewing tax questionnaire and test case 
funding material provided by Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, drafting file notes and amendments 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

19-Apr-18 Drafting and replying to multiple emails from 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

19-Apr-18 Telephone call with J Boyagi and N Dickson of 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re settling various 
documents, drafting note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
20-Apr-18 Reviewing Filesite for J White, Costs assessor, 

Third Report as published on Supreme Court 
website 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

20-Apr-18 Multiple emails to Y Iqbal re John White Third 
Report as published on Supreme Court website 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

20-Apr-18 Updating group member mailout lists JSJ 0.60 $320.00 $192.00 

20-Apr-18 Drafting multiple emails to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re conferences and trial re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

26-Apr-18 Reviewing documents filed in tax proceeding, 
drafting email to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

27-Apr-18 Reviewing responses to tax correspondence re 
tax dispute, drafting replies to same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

27-Apr-18 Reviewing Supreme Court Website re broken 
links, drafting internal email and email to the 
Court re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

27-Apr-18 Reviewing invoice of Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
re tax dispute, drafting internal email re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

30-Apr-18 Preparing for meeting with Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, counsel re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

 31.10  $13,684.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 1.90 $1,501.00 

 Brooke Dellavedova $790.00 0.50 $395.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 7.00 $2,240.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 21.70 $9,548.00 

  31.10 $13,684.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $13,684.00 

 $13,684.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
19-Mar-2018 Law In Order Pty Ltd - Photocopying Charges - Law In Order Pty Ltd - 

Invoice 401163 (MDI Portion) (2of2) 
$305.38 

16-Apr-2018 Expert Fees - John White Consultancy - Invoice SchemeAdmin290318b $20,362.50 

23-Apr-2018 Expert Fees - PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 38026810 (MDI 
Portion) (3of4) 

$32,272.67 

 $52,940.55 

 
Disbursements Not Subject to GST 
23-Apr-2018 Expert Fees - PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 38026810 (MDI 

Portion) (4of4) (GST Free) 
$645.00 

 $645.00 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $52,940.55 

 Disbursements Not Subject to GST $645.00 

 $53,585.55 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $73,932.01 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 15 June 2018     Due Date: 29 June 2018 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
05-07-2018 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 May 2018 to 31 May 2018 by the 

Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $10,887.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $1,088.70 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $11,975.70 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-May-18 Conference with D McInerney and F Cameron of 

counsel, J Boyagi and M Wyles, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers and A Watson re tax dispute 

JSP 1.70 $440.00 $748.00 

01-May-18 Conference with D McInerney and F Cameron of 
counsel, J Boyagi and M Wyles, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers and J Peck re tax dispute 

AJW 1.70 $790.00 $1,343.00 

01-May-18 Perusing materials in preparation for conference 
with counsel re tax issues 

AJW 0.50 $790.00 $395.00 

02-May-18 Reviewing filenote of conference with 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and counsel to review 
action items 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

02-May-18 Drafting email to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

04-May-18 Collating material and drafting filenote for 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

04-May-18 Perusing draft letter to Australian Taxation Office 
re sampling of expenses 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

07-May-18 Multiple conferences with A Watson re draft 
Appeal Statement re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

07-May-18 Multiple telephone conferences with J Boyagi and 
S Rooke re draft Appeal Statement re tax 
dispute, drafting file filenote re same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

07-May-18 Reviewing and drafting amendments to Appeal 
Statement, drafting and responding to emails 
from Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 1.80 $440.00 $792.00 

07-May-18 Preparing supplementary bulk mailout for April 
2018 tax update email bouncebacks 

JSJ 0.70 $320.00 $224.00 

07-May-18 Email to J Peck re update letters resent to 
bouncebacks 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

07-May-18 Multiple conferences with J Peck re draft Appeal 
Statement re tax dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

07-May-18 Reviewing draft appeal statement AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

08-May-18 Reviewing draft correspondence to the Australian 
Taxation Office re tax dispute, drafting email to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

08-May-18 Telephone call to J Kaye, KPMG, re further work 
required, drafting email re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

08-May-18 Telephone calls and email to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute, reviewing and settling 
various documents 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

08-May-18 Reviewing test case funding application re tax 
dispute, drafting multiple emails re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

08-May-18 Reviewing email of J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, re filed Appeal statement 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

08-May-18 Reviewing application for test case funding, email 
J Peck re same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

09-May-18 Collating material and drafting filenote to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 2.20 $440.00 $968.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
10-May-18 Collating material and drafting filenote to 

Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 
JSP 1.90 $440.00 $836.00 

11-May-18 Conference with J Peck and J Jin re taxation 
dispute and correspondence with group members 
re tax liability 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

11-May-18 Collating material, drafting and settling filenote to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute, drafting 
email to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

11-May-18 Drafting email to K Rowe re tax dispute re next 
steps 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

11-May-18 Conference with J Peck and J Jin re taxation 
dispute and correspondence with group members 
re tax liability 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

11-May-18 Reviewing Orders and Rulings re approval of 
settlement administration costs 

JSJ 0.60 $320.00 $192.00 

11-May-18 Email to J Peck re summary of settlement 
administration costs approved 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

17-May-18 Telephone call to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
update and next steps, drafting filenote re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

17-May-18 Drafting filenote to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
question raised by counsel on orders of 19 April 
2016 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

18-May-18 Settling filenote to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
April orders and further materials, drafting email 
to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

18-May-18 Telephone call from Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
update on various aspects of tax dispute, drafting 
filenote re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

22-May-18 Reviewing email from Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
re correspondence with Australian Government 
Solicitors re tax dispute, drafting email to A 
Watson re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

22-May-18 Preparing further mailout of return-to-sender 
taxation mailout letters 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

23-May-18 Reviewing material and replying to email from J 
Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
correspondence with Australian Government 
Solicitors re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

24-May-18 Telephone call with J Boyagi of Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re correspondence with Australian 
Government Solicitors, drafting file filenote re 
same, reviewing materials re Australian 
Government Solicitors request 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

24-May-18 Drafting email in response to enquiry of D Allen 
re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

25-May-18 Drafting emails to A Watson and J Jin re 
correspondence with Australian Government 
Solicitors re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
25-May-18 Reviewing correspondence from Australian 

Government Solicitors, drafting email to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re provision of 
documents re tax dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

28-May-18 Telephone call with J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re response to Australian Government 
Solicitors correspondence, drafting filenote re 
same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

28-May-18 Reviewing material collated by J Jin re Australian 
Government Solicitors correspondence re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

28-May-18 Retrieving relevant affidavits, orders and special 
reports for provision to Australian Government 
Solicitors 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

28-May-18 Preparing index and documents for provision to 
Australian Government Solicitors 

JSJ 1.80 $320.00 $576.00 

28-May-18 Email to J Peck re documents to provide 
Australian Government Solicitors, Mimecast 
attaching documents re same 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

28-May-18 Multiple emails to K Turan re Murrindindi John 
White Special Referee Report 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

30-May-18 Reviewing material collated by J Jin re Australian 
Government Solicitors request re tax dispute, 
drafting notes re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

31-May-18 Reviewing correspondence from 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re queries on affidavit 
material re tax dispute, drafting notes re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

31-May-18 Drafting filenote on confidential exhibits in 
material requested by Australian Government 
Solicitors re tax dispute 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

31-May-18 Reviewing material, marking up letter by 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers, drafting email to A 
Watson re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

 23.80  $10,887.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 2.90 $2,291.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 5.00 $1,600.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 15.90 $6,996.00 

  23.80 $10,887.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $10,887.00 

 $10,887.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $11,975.70 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 05 July 2018     Due Date: 19 July 2018 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
06-08-2018 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 June 2018 to 30 June 2018 by 

the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $14,317.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $38,694.69 AUD 

Total GST Applied $5,301.17 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $58,312.86 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Jun-18 Telephone call from N Dickson, Pricewaterhouse 

Coopers re provision of materials re tax dispute, 
collating same, drafting email to S Feng re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

01-Jun-18 Reviewing various materials requested by 
Australian Government Solicitors re tax dispute, 
drafting instructions for redaction 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

01-Jun-18 Reviewing information and material requested by 
counsel in preparation of affidavit material for tax 
dispute, drafting responses 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

01-Jun-18 Drafting and responding to emails from Y Iqbal re 
redaction of material requested by Australian 
Government Solicitors in tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

03-Jun-18 Drafting memorandum of instructions to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers, counsel re various 
aspects of witness affidavit for tax dispute 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

04-Jun-18 Conference with A Watson re upcoming hearing 
for tax dispute, instructing Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

04-Jun-18 Preparing for conference with A Watson on 
various aspects re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

04-Jun-18 Drafting memorandum of instructions to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers, counsel re various 
aspects of witness affidavit for tax dispute 

JSP 2.10 $440.00 $924.00 

04-Jun-18 Telephone call to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute and upcoming hearings, 
drafting and replying to emails from 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

04-Jun-18 Conference with J Peck re upcoming hearing for 
tax dispute, instructing Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
re same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

05-Jun-18 Conference with A Watson re instructing 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute and 
responding to correspondence to the Supreme 
Court of Victoria from group member 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

05-Jun-18 Review draft affidavit of A Watson prepared by 
counsel, drafting amendments and taking rough 
notes 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

05-Jun-18 Drafting response to correspondence to the 
Supreme Court of Victoria from group member 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

05-Jun-18 Drafting multiple emails to A Watson and J 
Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse Coopers re instructions 
re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

05-Jun-18 Preparing material requested by Australian 
Government Solicitors re tax dispute including 
reviewing redactions, drafting and responding to 
emails from Y Iqbal 

JSP 1.10 $440.00 $484.00 

05-Jun-18 Amending memorandum to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re further material requested re 
affidavits for tax dispute 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
05-Jun-18 Conference with J Peck re instructing 

Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute and 
responding to correspondence to the Supreme 
Court of Victoria from group member 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

06-Jun-18 Reviewing bundle of documents to provide to 
Australian Government Solicitors re tax dispute 
and redactions to same 

JSP 1.40 $440.00 $616.00 

06-Jun-18 Conference with D Bloom, D Mcinerney and F 
Cameron of counsel, J Boyagi and S Rooke, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and A Watson re 
preparing for case management conference and 
preparing material for trial 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

06-Jun-18 Multiple conferences with A Watson re tax 
dispute re material requested by counsel and 
preparing for case management conference 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

06-Jun-18 Multiple telephone calls to J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers, drafting and replying 
to emails from J Boyagi re preparing material, 
provision of material to Australian Government 
Solicitors and preparing for case management 
hearing re tax dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

06-Jun-18 Reviewing proposed amendments to draft 
witness affidavit re tax dispute, drafting notes re 
same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

06-Jun-18 Conference with D Bloom, D Mcinerney and F 
Cameron of counsel, J Boyagi and S Rooke, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and J Peck re 
preparing for case management conference and 
preparing material for trial 

AJW 0.70 $790.00 $553.00 

06-Jun-18 Multiple conferences with J Peck re tax dispute re 
material requested by counsel and preparing for 
case management conference 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

06-Jun-18 Settling Affidavit for tax proceeding AJW 0.50 $790.00 $395.00 

07-Jun-18 Multiple telephone calls to J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re preparing for case 
management hearing and preparing material for 
filing, draft file notes re same, drafting and 
replying to emails from J Boyagi re same 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

07-Jun-18 Reviewing various material including proposed 
affidavit amendments and further documents 
requested and drafting note to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

08-Jun-18 Preparation for attendance at directions hearing 
re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

08-Jun-18 Travel to and attendance at directions hearing re 
tax dispute 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

08-Jun-18 Preparation for conference with counsel, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and witness re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

08-Jun-18 Conference with counsel, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers and witness re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
08-Jun-18 Review witness material prepared re tax dispute, 

drafting notes and email to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

13-Jun-18 Drafting update letter to group members re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

14-Jun-18 Reviewing account summaries and reconciling 
bushfire distribution accounts, draft notes re 
same, drafting email to Finance re transfer of 
funds 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

18-Jun-18 Reviewing bushfire distribution accounts 
including confirming correct interest received and 
that amounts balance, settling instructions re 
account closure, draft email re same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

18-Jun-18 Telephone call to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re various matters re tax dispute, draft 
file note re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

18-Jun-18 Drafting notes re reporting affidavit to Supreme 
Court of Victoria re progress on tax dispute 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

19-Jun-18 Drafting email to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re various matters re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

20-Jun-18 Reviewing and settling tax update letter to group 
members, including drafting multiple emails re 
same including instructions for mass mail out 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

20-Jun-18 Drafting and responding to emails from J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re bank transfer, 
telephone call to same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

21-Jun-18 Drafting email re instructions for mass mail out to 
group members re tax update 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

22-Jun-18 Reviewing taxation update mailout JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

22-Jun-18 Drafting updated taxation update letter sample JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

22-Jun-18 Reviewing, amending and settling mass 
correspondence to bushfire group members re 
tax dispute, including drafting and replying to 
multiple emails from F Argus 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

22-Jun-18 Drafting notes for affidavit to update Supreme 
Court of Victoria on tax dispute 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

23-Jun-18 Review invoice and fee-tracking table from 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re costs for the tax 
dispute, reviewing previous estimates, drafting 
emails to T Peluso and A Watson re same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

25-Jun-18 Reviewing sample correspondence and settling 
amendments re same, drafting multiple emails re 
same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

25-Jun-18 Preparing notes and collating material for 
bushfire tax update affidavit, dictating affidavit 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

25-Jun-18 Conference with A Watson re various settlement 
administration matters including distribution fund 
accounts and correspondence with group 
members 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
25-Jun-18 Drafting note on settlement distribution accounts, 

drafting email to A Watson re same 
JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

25-Jun-18 Conference with J Peck re various settlement 
administration matters including distribution fund 
accounts and correspondence with group 
members 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

26-Jun-18 Telephone call to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re documents requested by counsel 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

26-Jun-18 Reviewing documents collated by counsel re 
witness affidavits for tax dispute, reviewing email 
from J Boyagi , Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
further requests of counsel, collating material and 
drafting emails to J boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers and S Feng 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

27-Jun-18 Conference with J Peck re investment of 
distribution fund, mass mail out of 
correspondence to group members, and reply 
correspondence to group member re: allocation 
dispute 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

27-Jun-18 Conference with A Watson re investment of 
distribution fund, mass mail out of 
correspondence to group members, and reply 
correspondence to group member re: allocation 
dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

27-Jun-18 Reviewing accounts, drafting email to C Zheng re 
investment of distribution sum in term deposits 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

27-Jun-18 Reviewing and amending bushfire mass 
correspondence template, drafting further email 
of instructions to F Argus re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

27-Jun-18 Perusing email re balance of distribution sum, 
email J Peck re obtaining term deposit rates 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

28-Jun-18 Conference with J Peck re preparing and 
collating invoice bundles for Counsel 

ARU 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

28-Jun-18 Preparing and collating invoice bundles for 
Counsel 

ARU 1.10 $320.00 $352.00 

28-Jun-18 Reviewing material and drafting email to A 
Rutman re counsel request for disbursement 
invoices 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

28-Jun-18 Conference with A Rutman re preparing and 
collating invoice bundles for Counsel 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

28-Jun-18 Drafting reply email to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re: provision of material to counsel 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

28-Jun-18 Reviewing file, collating and analysing 
disbursement invoices, drafting file note to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and counsel re same 

JSP 1.40 $440.00 $616.00 

28-Jun-18 Reviewing sample letters from mass 
correspondence to group members re tax 
dispute, drafting further directions to F Argus, 
drafting email to K Turan and D Wood re further 
enquiries 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

29-Jun-18 Preparing and collating invoice bundles for 
Counsel 

ARU 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
29-Jun-18 Reviewing and amending correspondence 

template for physical mail out of group member 
tax update, drafting and replying to emails from Y 
Iqbal re same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

29-Jun-18 Reviewing sample email mass correspondence to 
group members re tax update, email 
correspondence with F Argus re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

29-Jun-18 Reviewing file note of A Rutman re material 
requested by counsel, drafting note re same, 
drafting email to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re same 

JSP 1.40 $440.00 $616.00 

30-Jun-18 Reviewing and amending correspondence 
template for physical mail out of group member 
tax update, drafting email to Y Iqbal re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

 31.20  $14,317.00 

194194



 

Page 9 of 11 

 

Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 2.30 $1,817.00 

 Arielle Rutman $320.00 1.50 $480.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 0.30 $96.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 27.10 $11,924.00 

  31.20 $14,317.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $14,317.00 

 $14,317.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
07-Jun-2018 Expert Fees - PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 38031594 (MDI 

Portion) (2of2) 
$38,694.69 

 $38,694.69 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $38,694.69 

 $38,694.69 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $58,312.86 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 06 August 2018     Due Date: 20 August 2018 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-04-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 July 2018 to 31 July 2018 by the 

Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $9,528.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $948.38 AUD 

Total GST Applied $1,047.64 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $11,524.02 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
02-Jul-18 Reviewing physical mail out letter template re tax 

update to group members, drafting email to Y 
Iqbal re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

02-Jul-18 Telephone call with D Mullen and S Feng re 
provision of invoices in spreadsheet form, coding 
of same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

02-Jul-18 Drafting text to A Geelan re enquiry re tax dispute 
and case management hearing 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

02-Jul-18 Email to Law In Order re mailout YAI 0.10 $240.00 $24.00 

02-Jul-18 Running mail merge scripts for letters to be sent 
out to group members 

YAI 0.50 $240.00 $120.00 

09-Jul-18 Conference with P McMullan re complaint of L 
Nelson re assessment 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

09-Jul-18 Reviewing correspondence of L Nelson re 
complaint re assessment, reviewing file including 
previous correspondence, drafting reply to L 
Sanger 

JSP 1.20 $440.00 $528.00 

09-Jul-18 Reviewing correspondence of L Nelson re 
complaint re assessment, reviewing file including 
previous correspondence, drafting reply to L 
Sanger 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

09-Jul-18 Conference with J Peck re complaint of L Nelson 
re assessment 

PMC 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

10-Jul-18 Reviewing draft email to L Sanger re complaint 
from L Nelson and email to J Peck re same 

PMC 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

10-Jul-18 Settling email to L Sanger re complaint of L 
Nelson re claim 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

10-Jul-18 Drafting reply emails to group member enquiries JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

11-Jul-18 Replying to email correspondence of J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute, test 
case funding 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

13-Jul-18 Reviewing material and drafting multiple emails to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re request for further 
material 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

13-Jul-18 Reviewing emails and previous correspondence 
re term deposits, calculating investment sums, 
and replying same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

16-Jul-18 Reviewing email from C Zheng re term deposit, 
telephone call to C Zheng re same, drafting email 
to A Watson re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

16-Jul-18 Telephone call from Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
tax dispute and GST issues, drafting file note re 
same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

16-Jul-18 Telephone call from N Dickson, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
17-Jul-18 Conference with A Watson re various issues 

including GST advice from Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, instructing Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
witness affidavit, investment of settlement funds 
in term deposit 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

17-Jul-18 Reviewing term deposit rates, calculating sums to 
be invested, drafting controlled money deposit 
authority, drafting emails to finance re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

17-Jul-18 Preparing for conference with Scheme 
Administrator re various outstanding matters 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

17-Jul-18 Drafting reply email to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re test case funding update 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

17-Jul-18 Reviewing various materials including 
requirements for controlled money accounts 
under the Legal Profession Act, drafting email to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re witness affidavit for 
tax dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

17-Jul-18 Reviewing Scheme Administrator invoices and 
previous advice from Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
re GST, drafting email to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

17-Jul-18 Conference with J Peck re various issues 
including GST advice from Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, instructing Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
witness affidavit, investment of settlement funds 
in term deposit 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

18-Jul-18 Reviewing various material and settling email to 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re GST issue 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

18-Jul-18 Telephone call to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re term deposits, drafting file note re 
same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

18-Jul-18 Reviewing email from Finance, preparing and 
reviewing controlled money advice forms re term 
deposits 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

19-Jul-18 Telephone conference with J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and D McInerney of 
counsel re witness affidavits for tax dispute 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

19-Jul-18 Telephone call from C Zheng re term deposits, 
drafting further controlled money advice 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

19-Jul-18 Reviewing witness affidavits prepared by counsel 
for tax dispute, drafting amendments and making 
file notes re same, drafting email to J Boyagi re 
same 

JSP 1.80 $440.00 $792.00 

19-Jul-18 Multiple telephone conferences with J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re settling witness 
affidavits 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

20-Jul-18 Reviewing document, drafting email to C Zheng 
re term deposit 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

20-Jul-18 Telephone conference with J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and D McInerney of 
counsel re finalising witness affidavits re tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
20-Jul-18 Reviewing and drafting amendments to affidavit 

material re tax dispute, drafting and replying to 
emails from J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

23-Jul-18 Reviewing affidavit material of K Rowe re tax 
dispute, drafting email to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

23-Jul-18 Reviewing invoices and setting out note not GST, 
drafting email to J Jin re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

24-Jul-18 Telephone call with J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re witness affidavits and preparation of 
same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

24-Jul-18 Updating Collaborate and drafting and 
responding to multiple emails to Law in Order re 
access to affidavit 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

24-Jul-18 Conference with A Watson re preparation of 
affidavit re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

24-Jul-18 Reviewing and settling affidavit material re tax 
dispute, drafting multiple emails to A Watson and 
J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same 

JSP 1.90 $440.00 $836.00 

24-Jul-18 Conference with J Peck re preparation of affidavit 
re tax dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

25-Jul-18 Reviewing various emails regarding tax dispute 
affidavits, drafting email to A Watson re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

25-Jul-18 Settling file note of previous telephone call with J 
Boyagi re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

25-Jul-18 Conference with A Watson re finalising affidavit 
re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

25-Jul-18 Telephone call to C Downes, Ligeti Partners re 
tax dispute and unpresented cheque, drafting file 
note re same, drafting email re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

25-Jul-18 Reviewing and amending affidavit material re tax 
dispute, preparing copy to be sworn 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

25-Jul-18 Conference with J Boyagi, N Dickson, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute affidavit 
and swearing of same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

25-Jul-18 Reviewing email and spreadsheet prepared by J 
Jin re cost expenditure re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

25-Jul-18 Auditing Matter Centre amendments made during 
June-July period 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

25-Jul-18 Preparing updated Murrindindi mailout list JSJ 0.80 $320.00 $256.00 

25-Jul-18 Drafting billing file note spreadsheet for 
GST/input tax credit dispute 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

25-Jul-18 Conference with J Peck re finalising affidavit re 
tax dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

25-Jul-18 Conference with J Boyagi, N Dickson, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute affidavit 
and swearing of same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
25-Jul-18 Perusing draft affidavit re tax dispute email J 

Peck re same 
AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

26-Jul-18 Conference with R Alstergren and J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and A Watson (part) re 
swearing affidavit 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

26-Jul-18 Reviewing and updating file note on cost 
expenditure re GST 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

26-Jul-18 Drafting email to K Rowe re affidavit in tax 
dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

26-Jul-18 Review updated version of affidavit, multiple 
telephone calls with J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re same, drafting multiple emails to J 
Boyagi and A Watson re same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

26-Jul-18 Reviewing website of the Supreme Court re 
unpublished materials, drafting email to Class 
Actions Coordinator re same, drafting email to A 
Watson re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

26-Jul-18 Drafting affidavit to update the Supreme Court on 
the taxation dispute litigation 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

26-Jul-18 Conference with R Alstergren and J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers and J Peck re 
swearing affidavit 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

27-Jul-18 Telephone call from J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re filing of affidavit in tax proceeding 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

27-Jul-18 Drafting affidavit updating Supreme Court of 
Victoria re progress of tax proceeding 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

27-Jul-18 Drafting and replying to email from J Boyagi re 
filing of affidavit material in tax proceeding 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

30-Jul-18 Reviewing and responding to multiple emails 
from J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse Coopers, 
reviewing filings in the tax proceeding 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

31-Jul-18 Telephone call with J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re communication with Australian 
Government Solicitors re provision of documents 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

31-Jul-18 Reviewing email from J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re Australian Government Solicitors 
request, reviewing documents re same, drafting 
email to A Watson re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

 21.50  $9,528.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 1.00 $790.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 1.60 $512.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 18.00 $7,920.00 

 Patricia McMullan $540.00 0.30 $162.00 

 Yaseen Iqbal $240.00 0.60 $144.00 

  21.50 $9,528.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $9,528.00 

 $9,528.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
12-Apr-2018 Electronic Doc Processing - Law In Order Pty Ltd - Invoice 404627 $270.00 

01-May-2018 Photocopying Charges - Law In Order Pty Ltd - Invoice 407079 $372.52 

02-Jul-2018 Law In Order Pty Ltd - Photocopying Charges - Law In Order Pty Ltd - 
Invoice 416081 

$305.86 

 $948.38 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $948.38 

 $948.38 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $11,524.02 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 April 2019     Due Date: 25 April 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
19-10-2018 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 August 2018 to 31 August 2018 

by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $3,543.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $64,558.46 AUD 

Total GST Applied $6,810.15 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $74,911.61 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Aug-18 Telephone call to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 

Coopers re billing on the tax dispute 
JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

01-Aug-18 Reviewing multiple email correspondence and 
other documents re providing material to 
Australian Government Solicitors, drafting 
instructions to Pricewaterhouse Coopers and 
responding to correspondence re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

02-Aug-18 Reviewing Pricewaterhouse Coopers invoices for 
work completed, drafting notes re same and 
comparing against budget, drafting reply email to 
J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse Coopers 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

03-Aug-18 Reviewing ATO's reasons re test case funding, 
drafting email to A Watson re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

06-Aug-18 Conference with J Peck and J Jin re outstanding 
liabilities on bank account and correspondence 
with the Supreme Court of Victoria re publication 
of material 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

06-Aug-18 Telephone conference with J Boyagi, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re test case funding 
reasons and next steps re GST 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

06-Aug-18 Drafting and responding to multiple emails to and 
from Finance team re unpresented cheques, 
bank account balances, and reconciling same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

06-Aug-18 Reviewing previous correspondence and drafting 
email to Pricewaterhouse Coopers re GST issue 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

06-Aug-18 Conference with J Peck and J Jin re outstanding 
liabilities on bank account and correspondence 
with the Supreme Court of Victoria re publication 
of material 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

07-Aug-18 Preparing for telephone call to Class Actions 
Coordinator of Supreme Court of Victoria, 
telephone call to same, collating material and 
drafting email re same 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

07-Aug-18 Reviewing documents re GST issue, test case 
funding application 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

08-Aug-18 Preparing correspondence to group members re 
tax dispute progress, drafting and replying to 
emails re same 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

08-Aug-18 Reviewing advice from Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
and data on GST expenditure, drafting email to A 
Watson re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

08-Aug-18 Drafting email of instructions to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re test case funding 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

08-Aug-18 Perusing email J Peck re issues related to GST AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

09-Aug-18 Telephone call from G Ioannidis, Hall & Wilcox re 
tax dispute, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

09-Aug-18 Reviewing correspondence to insurers re tax 
update, drafting further copies of correspondence 
and drafting emails re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
10-Aug-18 Reviewing various bank accounts and distribution 

data, drafting and responding to internal 
correspondence re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

10-Aug-18 Drafting and responding to emails from 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

10-Aug-18 Drafting reply email to Supreme Court of Victoria 
re publication of materials on website 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

12-Aug-18 Reviewing invoice of Pricewaterhouse Coopers 
re tax dispute, drafting file notes and email re 
same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

13-Aug-18 Telephone call to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re GST issue, recent bill and test case 
funding application, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

15-Aug-18 Drafting email to J Jin re directions for 
reconciliation of ELPD bank accounts and 
outstanding liabilities 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

16-Aug-18 Collating requested material re GST issue and 
drafting multiple emails to Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

16-Aug-18 Telephone call with M Barnett, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re GST issue, drafting file note re same, 
drafting email to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

17-Aug-18 Review email from Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
brief to counsel, consider position re same, 
drafting reply, telephone call from J Boyagi re 
same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

21-Aug-18 Reviewing application for test case funding in tax 
dispute, drafting notes re same, drafting email to 
J Boyagi of Pricewaterhouse Coopers re same, 
telephone call with J Boyagi re same 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

23-Aug-18 Review test case funding documents and email 
from J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse Coopers, 
drafting reply email re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

 8.00  $3,543.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.10 $79.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 0.10 $32.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 7.80 $3,432.00 

  8.00 $3,543.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $3,543.00 

 $3,543.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
31-Jul-2018 Expert Fees - PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 38069688 (MDI 

Portion) (2of2) 
$64,558.46 

 $64,558.46 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $64,558.46 

 $64,558.46 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $74,911.61 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 19 October 2018     Due Date: 02 November 2018 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
23-11-2018 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 September 2018 to 30 

September 2018 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,294.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $129.40 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $1,423.40 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
05-Sep-18 Reviewing correspondence from group member 

and drafting reply re tax dispute 
JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

05-Sep-18 Email to D Wood and J Peck re B Malcolm 
cheque amounts 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

05-Sep-18 Reviewing B Malcolm cheque amounts and 
correspondence 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

06-Sep-18 Email to J Peck re B Malcolm payments JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

10-Sep-18 Drafting reply email to J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re test case funding decision 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

11-Sep-18 Telephone call with J Boyagi, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re GST point and preparation for trial, 
drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

17-Sep-18 Reviewing email of M Barnett, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re GST on settlement administration 
costs, drafting reply, drafting email to A Wagon re 
same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

17-Sep-18 Reviewing various materials and drafting reply to 
D Mullen re closure of ELPD accounts 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

18-Sep-18 Preparing for conference with Scheme 
Administrator to discuss tax, residual 
distributions, closure of bank accounts and trust 
reporting 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

18-Sep-18 Conference with A Watson and J Peck re tax, 
residual distributions, closure of bank accounts 
and trust reporting 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

18-Sep-18 Conference with J Peck and A Watson re tax, 
residual distributions, closure of bank accounts 
and trust reporting 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

19-Sep-18 Telephone call with S Corrigan re closure of 
ELPD accounts, drafting email re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

19-Sep-18 Reviewing email of M Barnett, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers and drafting reply instructing on GST 
advice 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

 3.00  $1,294.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.20 $158.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 0.80 $256.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 2.00 $880.00 

  3.00 $1,294.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,294.00 

 $1,294.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $1,423.40 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 23 November 2018     Due Date: 07 December 2018 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12-03-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 October 2018 to 31 October 

2018 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $6,191.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $619.10 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $6,810.10 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
04-Oct-18 Teleconference with S Corrigan re bushfire bank 

accounts closure and required transfers 
JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

04-Oct-18 Review and respond to email of S Corrigan re 
bushfire bank accounts closure and required 
transfers 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

05-Oct-18 Drafting email response to finance team re 
bushfire account closure and transfers 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

08-Oct-18 Email to J Peck re PricewaterhouseCoopers 
requested orders, compiling documents re same 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

09-Oct-18 Drafting email to PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
submissions re tax dispute and receiving copy of 
same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

09-Oct-18 Reviewing orders from the initial trial collated by J 
Jin and requested by counsel re tax dispute, 
drafting email to PricewaterhouseCoopers 
enclosing same, uploading those documents to 
Collaborate 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

10-Oct-18 Updating contact details for D Bradshaw JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

11-Oct-18 Reviewing enquiries from group members re tax 
dispute and drafting reply correspondence 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

15-Oct-18 Drafting and responding to email form J Boyagi, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

15-Oct-18 Perusing draft submission re Australian Taxation 
Office tax dispute 

AJW 1.30 $790.00 $1,027.00 

16-Oct-18 Telephone call to J Boyagi, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers and drafting file note re 
same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

16-Oct-18 Reviewing submissions in the tax dispute and 
drafting instructions to PricewaterhouseCoopers 
to file same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

16-Oct-18 Perusing revised submission, email to J Peck re 
same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

17-Oct-18 Conference with E Mukherji and J Peck re tax 
dispute hearing and potential further distribution 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

17-Oct-18 Reviewing email from A Williams re document 
sharing platform and drafting response re 
requirements for upcoming tax hearing 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

17-Oct-18 Reviewing invoice from PricewaterhouseCoopers 
for tax litigation and advice work, drafting email to 
A Watson re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

17-Oct-18 Conference with J Peck and J Jin re potential 
further distribution and tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

17-Oct-18 Conference with J Peck and J Jin re potential 
further distribution and tax dispute 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

18-Oct-18 Drafting email to A Watson re proposed further 
distribution of compensation 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
19-Oct-18 Telephone call with S Reed, 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re tax dispute, drafting 
file note re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

23-Oct-18 Telephone call with S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re preparing for hearing 
of tax dispute, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

23-Oct-18 Drafting email to K Rowe re upcoming hearing of 
the tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

30-Oct-18 Reviewing updated fee schedule and invoice 
previously provided by PricewaterhouseCoopers 
re work on tax dispute, drafting reply email to S 
Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

30-Oct-18 Drafting email to S Rooke and S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re reply submissions 
and conference with K Rowe, witness 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

30-Oct-18 Reviewing submissions of the Respondent in the 
tax dispute, drafting short notes re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

30-Oct-18 Perusing respondents submissions AJW 0.50 $790.00 $395.00 

31-Oct-18 Drafting email to J Peck re ELPD review 
assessors 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

31-Oct-18 Reviewing submission of respondent in tax 
dispute 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

31-Oct-18 Researching taxation of Supreme Court held 
funds for response to submission of respondent 
in tax dispute 

JSJ 0.60 $320.00 $192.00 

31-Oct-18 Conference with J Peck and J Jin re submissions 
of the Respondent in the tax dispute and 
research re same 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

31-Oct-18 Updating contact addresses for multiple group 
members 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

31-Oct-18 Drafting email to J Peck re taxation of Supreme 
Court funds 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

31-Oct-18 Teleconference with A Watson and J Peck re 
submissions of the respondent in the tax dispute 
and preparing reply submissions 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

31-Oct-18 Review submissions of the respondent in the tax 
dispute and drafting notes re same 

JSP 2.20 $440.00 $968.00 

31-Oct-18 Telephone conference with S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re submissions of the 
respondent in the tax dispute and preparing reply 
submissions 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

31-Oct-18 Conference with J Peck and J Jin re submissions 
of the Respondent in the tax dispute and 
research re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

31-Oct-18 Reviewing various materials and drafting 
memorandum on the submissions of the 
respondent in the tax dispute and email to A 
Watson enclosing same 

JSP 1.90 $440.00 $836.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
31-Oct-18 Teleconference with A Watson and J Peck re 

submissions of the respondent in the tax dispute 
and preparing reply submissions 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

 13.00  $6,191.00 

227227



 

Page 7 of 8 

 

Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 2.10 $1,659.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 2.20 $704.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 8.70 $3,828.00 

  13.00 $6,191.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $6,191.00 

 $6,191.00 

228228



 

Page 8 of 8 

 
TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $6,810.10 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 12 March 2019     Due Date: 26 March 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12-03-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 November 2018 to 30 November 

2018 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $13,385.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $62,884.89 AUD 

Total GST Applied $7,626.99 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $83,896.88 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Nov-18 Multiple telephone call with S Reed, 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re submissions of the 
respondent and preparing reply submissions re 
tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

02-Nov-18 Telephone call with S Reed and S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re submissions of the 
respondent and preparing reply submissions 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

02-Nov-18 Drafting file note of telephone call with S Reed 
and S Rooke, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
submissions of the respondent and preparing 
reply submissions 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

02-Nov-18 Drafting multiple emails to S Reed and S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re submissions of the 
respondent and preparing reply submissions, 
including a memorandum re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

02-Nov-18 Reviewing email of A Watson re respondent 
submissions in tax dispute, drafting reply to same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

02-Nov-18 Reviewing email of S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers and enclosed draft 
submissions in reply, drafting email to A Watson 
re same, drafting email to S Reed re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

05-Nov-18 Reviewing draft reply submissions re bushfires 
tax hearing and related material, drafting email to 
S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

05-Nov-18 Perusing email to J Peck and reply submissions, 
drafting email to J Peck re same 

AJW 0.40 $790.00 $316.00 

05-Nov-18 Perusing email J Peck re filing of reply 
submissions, drafting reply 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

05-Nov-18 Perusing further revised reply submissions, email 
to S Reed PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

05-Nov-18 Updating contact details for multiple group 
members 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

06-Nov-18 Drafting letter to A Inzitari re phone call re terms 
of claim and amount of compensation 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

07-Nov-18 Multiple telephone calls with S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers and drafting and 
replying to emails from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re upcoming hearing of 
tax dispute 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

07-Nov-18 Telephone call with Counsel, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers and K Rowe re 
upcoming hearing of tax dispute, drafting file note 
re same, drafting multiple emails to K Rowe re 
same 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

07-Nov-18 Updating contact details for multiple group 
members 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

08-Nov-18 Reviewing email of S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers and drafting reply, 
telephone call with S Reed and F Cameron of 
counsel re tax dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
08-Nov-18 Reviewing Settlement Distribution Scheme and 

drafting email to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers and F Cameron of 
counsel re same re tax dispute 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

08-Nov-18 Reviewing material and drafting email to A 
Watson re upcoming tax dispute hearing 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

08-Nov-18 Collating and preparing a folder of materials for 
the upcoming tax dispute hearing, drafting email 
to Y Iqbal re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

08-Nov-18 Reviewing various materials and drafting 
response emails to questions from F Cameron of 
counsel re tax dispute re reconciliation of interim 
distributions against interest and calculation 
employed re same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

09-Nov-18 Reviewing various materials and considering 
requirements for potential further distribution as 
may be required at the conclusion of the taxation 
dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

09-Nov-18 Conference with K Nishimura and J Peck re tax 
dispute and impact upon potential further 
distribution 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

09-Nov-18 Reviewing multiple emails from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re upcoming tax 
dispute, drafting replies to same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

09-Nov-18 Conference with K Nishimura and J Peck re tax 
dispute and impact upon potential further 
distribution 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

12-Nov-18 Reviewing affidavit of A Watson and preparing 
copy of same for review by A Watson prior to 
hearing 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

12-Nov-18 Conference with A Watson and J Peck re 
upcoming tax hearing, affidavit re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

12-Nov-18 Multiple calls with S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers and drafting and 
responding to emails from same re preparing for 
hearing of taxation dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

12-Nov-18 Updating contact details for various group 
members 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

12-Nov-18 Conference with J Peck re upcoming tax hearing, 
affidavit re same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

12-Nov-18 Perusing affidavit in Australian Taxation Office 
matter re preparation for hearing 

AJW 1.50 $790.00 $1,185.00 

12-Nov-18 Considering affidavit material and submissions in 
preparation for taxation dispute hearing 

ELM 0.70 $610.00 $427.00 

13-Nov-18 Attendance at Federal Court of Australia for 
hearing of the taxation dispute re interest earned 
on settlement money, including travel to and from 

JSP 2.30 $440.00 $1,012.00 

13-Nov-18 Preparing for hearing of the tax dispute JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

13-Nov-18 Drafting template email to group members re tax 
hearing and next steps 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
13-Nov-18 Attendance at Federal Court of Australia for 

hearing of the taxation dispute re interest earned 
on settlement money, including travel to and from 

ELM 2.30 $610.00 $1,403.00 

13-Nov-18 Email to K Turan re media enquiries following 
taxation hearing 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

13-Nov-18 Attendance at Federal Court of Australia for 
hearing of the taxation dispute re interest earned 
on settlement money, including travel to and from 

AJW 2.30 $790.00 $1,817.00 

13-Nov-18 Perusing materials re Australian Taxation Office 
matter 

AJW 0.60 $790.00 $474.00 

14-Nov-18 Updating contact details for various group 
members 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

14-Nov-18 Settling response to group members re tax 
hearing, email to J Peck re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

21-Nov-18 Conference with K Turan and D Wood re group 
member enquiries re taxation dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

21-Nov-18 Preparing and drafting correspondence to group 
members re outcome of taxation dispute hearing 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

21-Nov-18 Updating multiple group member contact details JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

21-Nov-18 Perusing proposed group member update re ATO 
matter, drafting email to J Peck re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

21-Nov-18 Perusing draft affidavit re final report AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

22-Nov-18 Reviewing and amending draft correspondence 
to group members 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

26-Nov-18 Reviewing various material and drafting 
instructions for finance team re investment of 
term deposits 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

26-Nov-18 Conference with J Peck re preparing for potential 
second distribution of compensation at 
conclusion of taxation dispute 

ELM 0.60 $610.00 $366.00 

26-Nov-18 Email to D Allen re tax dispute status JSJ 0.50 $320.00 $160.00 

28-Nov-18 Conference, K Nishimura and E Mukherji re 
further distribution 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

28-Nov-18 Conference, K Nishimura and E Mukherji re 
further distribution 

KZN 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

28-Nov-18 Email from and instructions to J Peck re upload of 
information to Supreme Court of Victoria website 
and re update letter to group members 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

28-Nov-18 Conference with J Peck re potential second 
distribution and proposed steps re same 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

28-Nov-18 Conference with J Peck re C Mircevski re claim of 
fraud by his legal representative 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

28-Nov-18 Conference with K Nishimura re potential second 
distribution and proposed steps re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

28-Nov-18 Conference with E Mukherji re potential for 
further distribution, steps to advance re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
28-Nov-18 Conference with E Mukherji re C Mircevski re 

claim of fraud by his legal representative 
JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

28-Nov-18 Conference with J Jin re C Mircevski re claim of 
fraud by his legal representative 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

28-Nov-18 Drafting and settling update letter to group 
members 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

29-Nov-18 Reviewing correspondence between group 
member and Federal Court re taxation dispute, 
drafting and replying to emails from 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

30-Nov-18 Reviewing template group member 
correspondence and preparing for mail out, 
drafting emails to F Argus and Y Iqbal re same 

JSP 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

 24.50  $13,385.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 5.70 $4,503.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 3.90 $2,379.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 1.90 $608.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 12.50 $5,500.00 

 Kimi Nishimura $790.00 0.50 $395.00 

  24.50 $13,385.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $13,385.00 

 $13,385.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
30-Sep-2018 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Counsel Fees Counsel Fees - 

PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 38087929 
$61,426.50 

16-Nov-2018 Auscript - Transcript Fees Transcript Fees - Auscript - Invoice 
300419039 

$1,458.39 

 $62,884.89 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $62,884.89 

 $62,884.89 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $83,896.88 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 12 March 2019     Due Date: 26 March 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
14-03-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 December 2018 to 31 December 

2018 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $4,185.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $418.50 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $4,603.50 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
03-Dec-18 Reviewing and finalising mail out of 

correspondence re tax dispute update 
JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

03-Dec-18 Drafting amendments to Maurice Blackburn 
website, conference with IT re allocation of 
hotline access between team members 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

03-Dec-18 Multiple conferences with S Spencer re mass 
mail out of correspondence re tax dispute update 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

03-Dec-18 Preparing correspondence to be circulated to 
insurer group members re tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

03-Dec-18 Considering multiple enquiries from group 
members re issue of attachment to mass email 
correspondence, drafting replies re same 

JSP 1.10 $440.00 $484.00 

03-Dec-18 Preparing tax update mailout to insurers, email to 
J Peck re same 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

03-Dec-18 Auditing tax update mailout samples JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

04-Dec-18 Drafting replies to multiple group members 
experiencing issues accessing the attachment to 
mass correspondence re tax update 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

04-Dec-18 Conference with D Wood re responding to group 
member enquiries 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

04-Dec-18 Conference with S Spencer re multiple group 
members experiencing issues accessing the 
attachment to mass correspondence re tax 
update 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

04-Dec-18 Reviewing issue re multiple group members 
experiencing issues accessing the attachment to 
mass correspondence re tax update, drafting and 
replying to internal emails re same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

04-Dec-18 Finalising correspondence to insurer group 
members and drafting enclosing emails 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

04-Dec-18 Preparing physical mail out of mass 
correspondence to group members including 
drafting and replying to emails from Y Iqbal, 
conferences with Y Iqbal and reviewing draft 
forms of documents 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

04-Dec-18 Preparing mail merge on mail outs YAI 0.20 $240.00 $48.00 

05-Dec-18 Drafting and responding to emails from J Jin re 
communication with group members 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

05-Dec-18 Updating contact details for various group 
members 

JSJ 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

05-Dec-18 Amending contact details from bouncebacks JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

12-Dec-18 Reviewing correspondence received from group 
members subsequent to recent mail out, drafting 
replies and drafting instructions to members of 
settlement distribution team re: responses to 
same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

12-Dec-18 Preparing mail merge enclosing final report to 
counsel 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
12-Dec-18 Updating contact details for M Morrison and A 

Morrison, updating A Morrison legal personality 
JSJ 0.50 $320.00 $160.00 

12-Dec-18 Telephone call from M Morrison re change of 
address and A Morrison change of legal 
personality 

JSJ 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

13-Dec-18 Updating contact details for multiple group 
members, emails to group members confirming 
same 

JSJ 0.80 $320.00 $256.00 

13-Dec-18 Telephone call to L Johnston re claim of The 
Estate of R Philpott 

JSJ 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

14-Dec-18 Reviewing correspondence from group member 
and drafting email to J Jin re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

19-Dec-18 Considering tasks to prepare for further potential 
distribution to ensure no delay, detailed email to J 
Peck re same 

KZN 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

19-Dec-18 Email from M Greaves re preparation for potential 
further distribution 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

20-Dec-18 Multiple telephone calls to group members re 
change of address 

JSJ 0.60 $320.00 $192.00 

21-Dec-18 Conference with K Nishimura and E Mukherji re 
preparation for potential further distribution 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

21-Dec-18 Conference with K Nishimura and E Mukherji re 
preparation for potential further distribution 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

 10.20  $4,185.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.10 $61.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 3.50 $1,120.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 6.00 $2,640.00 

 Kimi Nishimura $790.00 0.40 $316.00 

 Yaseen Iqbal $240.00 0.20 $48.00 

  10.20 $4,185.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $4,185.00 

 $4,185.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $4,603.50 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 14 March 2019     Due Date: 28 March 2019 
 

246246



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
05-04-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 January 2019 to 31 January 

2019 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $6,248.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $484.46 AUD 

Total GST Applied $673.25 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $7,405.71 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
07-Jan-19 Conference with J Peck re potential second 

distribution and steps required re same 
MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

07-Jan-19 Conference with M Greaves re potential second 
distribution and steps required re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

07-Jan-19 Updating contact details for various group 
members 

JSJ 0.20 $320.00 $64.00 

16-Jan-19 Drafting email to L Menheere re preparing for 
potential second distribution 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

16-Jan-19 Reviewing billing and collating information for the 
purposes of preparing taxation returns 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

18-Jan-19 Reviewing various materials and drafting file note 
re steps required after judgment in the tax dispute 

JSP 1.30 $440.00 $572.00 

18-Jan-19 Reviewing profit and loss statements re quantum 
in tax dispute 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

21-Jan-19 Drafting file note on steps required for potential 
second distribution after tax judgment 

JSP 1.80 $440.00 $792.00 

22-Jan-19 Conference with K Nishimura, E Mukherji, R 
Lyng, M Greaves and J Peck re preparation for 
judgment in taxation dispute including possibility 
of second distribution 

ELM 0.60 $610.00 $366.00 

22-Jan-19 Conference with E Mukherji, R Lyng, M Greaves 
and J Peck re preparation for judgment in 
taxation dispute including possibility of second 
distribution 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

22-Jan-19 Conference with K Nishimura, E Mukherji, R 
Lyng, M Greaves and J Peck re preparation for 
judgment in taxation dispute including possibility 
of second distribution 

KZN 0.60 $790.00 $474.00 

22-Jan-19 Conference with K Nishimura, E Mukherji, R 
Lyng, M Greaves and J Peck re preparation for 
judgement in taxation dispute including possibility 
of second distribution 

MYG 0.60 $540.00 $324.00 

22-Jan-19 Conference with E Mukherji, R Lyng, M Greaves 
and J Peck re preparation for judgement in 
taxation dispute including possibility of second 
distribution 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

22-Jan-19 Conference with K Nishimura, E Mukherji, R 
Lyng, M Greaves and J Peck re preparation for 
judgment in taxation dispute including possibility 
of second distribution 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

22-Jan-19 Conference with E Mukherji, R Lyng, M Greaves 
and J Peck re preparation for judgment in 
taxation dispute including possibility of second 
distribution 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

22-Jan-19 Conference with K Nishimura, E Mukherji, R 
Lyng, M Greaves and J Peck re preparation for 
judgment in taxation dispute including possibility 
of second distribution 

RWL 0.60 $540.00 $324.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
22-Jan-19 Conference with E Mukherji, R Lyng, M Greaves 

and J Peck re preparation for judgment in 
taxation dispute including possibility of second 
distribution 

RWL 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

24-Jan-19 Telephone call to S Reed, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re tax dispute outcome, drafting and 
settling file note re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

25-Jan-19 Telephone call from S Reed, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers and replying to emails from same re tax 
dispute and filing tax returns 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

25-Jan-19 Drafting file note setting out requirements for 
potential appeal from tax judgment, 
communication with group members, preparation 
for potential second distribution 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

25-Jan-19 Reviewing account reconciliation's in preparation 
for further distribution 

RWL 0.70 $540.00 $378.00 

29-Jan-19 Conference with F Argus and L Menheere re 
required steps for a potential second distribution, 
including preparing for conference 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

29-Jan-19 Conference with A Watson re preparation for 
outcome of tax judgment 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

29-Jan-19 Conference with J Peck re preparation for 
outcome of tax judgement 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

30-Jan-19 Preparing file note on updates to Matter Centre 
and reporting to facilitate potential second 
distribution, including drafting email to F Argus re 
same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

30-Jan-19 Reviewing various financial and trust material, 
drafting file note re preparation of profit and loss 
statements for settlement fund, telephone call 
with S Corrigan re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

31-Jan-19 Telephone call with S Reed and N Callen, 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re preparing tax 
returns and GST advice 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

31-Jan-19 Telephone call with J Kaye, KPMG and R Lyng re 
audit and reconciliation of bushfire trust accounts 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

31-Jan-19 Drafting file note of telephone call with J Kaye, 
KPMG 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

31-Jan-19 Telephone call with J Kaye, KPMG and J Peck re 
audit and reconciliation of bushfire trust accounts 

RWL 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

 12.70  $6,248.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.30 $237.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.70 $427.00 

 Jesse Jin $320.00 0.20 $64.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 8.40 $3,696.00 

 Kimi Nishimura $790.00 0.60 $474.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.90 $486.00 

 Roisin Lyng $540.00 1.60 $864.00 

  12.70 $6,248.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $6,248.00 

 $6,248.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
21-Nov-2018 Law In Order Pty Ltd - Photocopying Fees - Law In Order - Invoice 

433956 
$38.92 

05-Dec-2018 Law In Order Pty Ltd - Photocopying Fees - Law In Order - Invoice 
437135 

$445.54 

 $484.46 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $484.46 

 $484.46 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $7,405.71 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 05 April 2019     Due Date: 19 April 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-04-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 February 2019 to 28 February 

2019 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $15,063.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $1,506.30 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $16,569.30 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Feb-19 Reviewing various material re repayment 

obligations re compensation payments, drafting 
note re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

04-Feb-19 Conference with K Shami re repayment 
obligations re potential second distribution 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

04-Feb-19 Telephone call with S Reed, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re billing and GST issue, drafting file 
note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

04-Feb-19 Reviewing file note from J Peck re repayment 
obligations re potential second distribution 

KSH 0.10 $350.00 $35.00 

04-Feb-19 Conference with J Peck re repayment obligations 
re potential second distribution 

KSH 0.10 $350.00 $35.00 

05-Feb-19 Conference with K Shami re follow up on task re 
repayment obligations re potential second 
distribution 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

05-Feb-19 Responding to various group member emails, 
including enquiries about the taxation dispute and 
requests to update certain claimant details 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

05-Feb-19 Drafting group member update correspondence 
regarding the outcome in the taxation dispute 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

05-Feb-19 Reviewing material and drafting letter of further 
instruction to KPMG re audit of various material 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

05-Feb-19 Conference with J Peck re follow up on task re 
repayment obligations re potential second 
distribution 

KSH 0.10 $350.00 $35.00 

06-Feb-19 Reviewing material and drafting further letter of 
instruction to KPMG re audit of various material 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

06-Feb-19 Telephone call with G Riley of PFK, liquidators for 
Yea Valley Vineyard Pty Ltd re tax dispute and 
outcome of same, drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

06-Feb-19 Preparing for conference with A Watson and 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re SDS tax issues 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

06-Feb-19 Conference with S Rooke, S Reed, M Staunch 
and M Barnett of Pricewaterhouse Coopers, and 
A Watson re SDS tax issues 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

06-Feb-19 Drafting and settling file note of conference with 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re SDS tax issues 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

06-Feb-19 Reviewing account information and preparing 
profit and loss statement of bushfire funds for tax 
advisors 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

06-Feb-19 Conference with S Rooke, S Reed, M Staunch 
and M Barnett of Pricewaterhouse Coopers, and 
J Peck re SDS tax issues 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

12-Feb-19 Reviewing developer updates to Matter Centre re 
potential further distribution, drafting email to F 
Argus re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

12-Feb-19 Conference with K Nishimura re briefing Special 
Costs Referee for further costs report 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
12-Feb-19 Conference with A Watson re engagement of 

KPMG and special costs referee for further work 
JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

12-Feb-19 Reviewing various materials including costs and 
previous orders, preparing for conference with A 
Watson re engagement of third parties 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

12-Feb-19 Reviewing email of C Zheng re term deposits, 
drafting response to same, telephone call to 
same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

12-Feb-19 Reviewing term deposits and drafting controlled 
money advice forms to transfer funds between 
accounts 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

12-Feb-19 Preparing profit and loss statements for 
distribution funds 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

12-Feb-19 Drafting affidavit of A Watson updating Supreme 
Court on operation of settlement distribution 
scheme 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

12-Feb-19 Conference with J Peck re briefing Special Costs 
Referee for further costs report 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

12-Feb-19 Conference with J Peck re engagement of KPMG 
and special costs referee for further work 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

13-Feb-19 Drafting affidavit of Andrew Watson updating 
Supreme Court on operation of settlement 
distribution scheme 

JSP 2.00 $440.00 $880.00 

13-Feb-19 Further drafting affidavit of Andrew Watson 
updating Supreme Court on operation of 
settlement distribution scheme 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

14-Feb-19 Drafting affidavit of A Watson updating Supreme 
Court on operation of settlement distribution 
scheme 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

14-Feb-19 Reviewing materials and drafting file note re 
repayment obligations re potential second 
distribution 

KSH 0.50 $350.00 $175.00 

15-Feb-19 Reviewing data and drafting file note re 
repayment obligations re potential second 
distribution 

KSH 0.40 $350.00 $140.00 

18-Feb-19 Reviewing billing in tax dispute against budget, 
drafting email to A Watson re same, drafting and 
responding to email from S Reed re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

18-Feb-19 Reviewing data and drafting file note re 
repayment obligations re potential second 
distribution 

KSH 1.00 $350.00 $350.00 

19-Feb-19 Reviewing data and drafting file note re 
repayment obligations re potential second 
distribution 

KSH 0.10 $350.00 $35.00 

20-Feb-19 Telephone call with S Reed, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re various matters re tax dispute, 
drafting file note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

20-Feb-19 Telephone call to J Tyler re repayment 
obligations re potential second distribution 

KSH 0.20 $350.00 $70.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
20-Feb-19 Reviewing data and drafting file note re 

repayment obligations re potential second 
distribution 

KSH 1.30 $350.00 $455.00 

21-Feb-19 Telephone call with M Kelling re Estate of Kelling 
entitlement and executorship, drafting file note re 
same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

21-Feb-19 Preparing affidavit material in anticipation of case 
management hearing in the Supreme Court of 
Victoria 

JSP 1.80 $440.00 $792.00 

21-Feb-19 Considering correspondence from J Peck to CA 
Project support re developments and reporting 
needed in preparation for further distribution 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

21-Feb-19 Reviewing data and drafting file note re 
repayment obligations re potential second 
distribution 

KSH 0.20 $350.00 $70.00 

22-Feb-19 Conference with M Greaves re settlement 
distribution costs and affidavit material 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

22-Feb-19 Conference with A Watson and J Peck re retainer 
of KPMG, further costs report and preparation for 
judgment in the taxation dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

22-Feb-19 Settling and finalising further letter of instructions 
to KPMG, drafting enclosing email 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

22-Feb-19 Reviewing proposed correspondence to group 
members and drafting amendments to same, 
drafting instructions to M Greaves re same 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

22-Feb-19 Conference with L Menheere and F Argus re 
preparing database for steps required after 
outcome of taxation dispute, including preparing 
for same 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

22-Feb-19 Reviewing previous costs orders and drafting 
notes, drafting affidavit material re same in 
preparation of outcome in taxation dispute 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

22-Feb-19 Reviewing email from N Callen, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re filing of tax returns, drafting reply to 
same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

22-Feb-19 Conference with J Peck re settlement distribution 
costs and affidavit material 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

22-Feb-19 Conference with A Watson and J Peck re retainer 
of KPMG, further costs report and preparation for 
judgment in the taxation dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

25-Feb-19 Reviewing data and drafting file note re 
repayment obligations re potential second 
distribution 

KSH 0.10 $350.00 $35.00 

25-Feb-19 Email to J Peck re data reporting in preparation 
for further distribution 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

26-Feb-19 Perusing email Pricewaterhouse Coopers re 
judgement in tax matter 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

27-Feb-19 Conference with M Greaves re updating draft 
letter re taxation outcome 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
27-Feb-19 Review of draft update letter to group members in 

advance of taxation judgment, considering 
amendments required to same 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

27-Feb-19 Emails from A Watson and E Mukherji re update 
letter to group members following outcome of 
taxation dispute 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

27-Feb-19 Conference with A Watson re preparation for mail 
out following judgement 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-Feb-19 Reviewing email from S Reed, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers re judgement listing and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-Feb-19 Conference with K Nishimura re updating draft 
letter re taxation outcome 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-Feb-19 Telephone call from S Reed, Pricewaterhouse 
Coopers, re preparation for tax outcome 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-Feb-19 Multiple conferences with E Mukherji re draft 
letter re taxation outcome 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-Feb-19 Various attendances in advance of taxation 
outcome and bulk update to group members, 
including reviewing mail out lists, telephone 
conference with F Argus re mail out lists, email to 
and from Y Iqbal re hard copy letters and 
reviewing and amending draft outcome letters 
and various emails to A Watson, K Nishimura, E 
Mukherji and C Scott re same 

MYG 0.60 $540.00 $324.00 

27-Feb-19 Telephone conference with F Argus re updating 
and finalising mail out lists in preparation for bulk 
mail out following tax outcome 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-Feb-19 Multiple conferences with M Greaves re draft 
letter re taxation outcome 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

27-Feb-19 Considering and drafting update to group 
members to be sent following judgement on 
taxation dispute and reviewing bulk mail out lists 

ELM 1.20 $610.00 $732.00 

27-Feb-19 Conference with M Greaves re preparation for 
mail out following judgement 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

27-Feb-19 Settling letters re group member re taxation 
dispute 

AJW 0.60 $790.00 $474.00 

28-Feb-19 Email to K Turan and C Adams re managing 
group member enquiries re tax decision 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

28-Feb-19 Reviewing update letter to group members 
following outcome of tax dispute 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

28-Feb-19 Multiple conferences with M Greaves re finalising 
letter following tax outcome and preparing bulk 
update 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

28-Feb-19 Discussion with C Scott re update to website 
following outcome of tax dispute 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

28-Feb-19 Considering updated letter of instruction to KPMG 
for audit work and reply from KPMG with 
engagement letter and terms and conditions 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

28-Feb-19 Conference with M Greaves re updating website 
following judgement re tax dispute 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
28-Feb-19 Running mail merges re bulk mail out YAI 0.20 $240.00 $48.00 

28-Feb-19 Email to Law In Order re printing and posting 
letters 

YAI 0.10 $240.00 $24.00 

28-Feb-19 Considering judgement of Middleton J re taxation 
dispute 

ELM 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

28-Feb-19 Reviewing data for group member update mailout RWL 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

28-Feb-19 Multiple telephone conferences with F Argus re 
bulk mail out data spreadsheets 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

28-Feb-19 Conference with A Watson re next steps following 
judgement re tax dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

28-Feb-19 Various attendances re preparing for bulk mail 
out to group members following judgement re tax 
dispute, including multiple emails to and from CA 
Project Support re preparing updated mail out 
lists, reviewing and finalising mail out lists, email 
instructions to Y Iqbal re hard copy mail out, 
email instructions to F Argus re email mail out 

MYG 0.90 $540.00 $486.00 

28-Feb-19 Multiple conferences with E Mukherji re finalising 
letter following tax outcome and preparing bulk 
update 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

28-Feb-19 Reviewing and finalising letter to group members 
following judgement re tax dispute, including 
email to A Watson re same 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

28-Feb-19 Attendance at judgement re outcome of tax 
dispute 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

28-Feb-19 Conference with E Mukherji re updating website 
following judgement re tax dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

28-Feb-19 Preparation for judgement re outcome of tax 
dispute and next steps 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

28-Feb-19 Reviewing email from Y Iqbal re sample hard 
copy letters re bulk mail out, reviewing samples 
and replied re same 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

28-Feb-19 Email to Marketing re update to website following 
judgement re tax dispute 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

28-Feb-19 Reviewing email from Marketing re update to 
website following judgement re tax dispute, 
reviewing amendments and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

28-Feb-19 Reviewing reasons for judgement re tax dispute MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

28-Feb-19 Conference with A Watson re outcome of taxation 
dispute and next steps re same 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

28-Feb-19 Review of judgment in taxation decision in 
preparation for conference with counsel re same 

KZN 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

28-Feb-19 Conference with M Greaves re next steps 
following judgement re tax dispute 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

28-Feb-19 Conference with K Nishimura re outcome of 
taxation dispute and next steps re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
28-Feb-19 Conference M Greaves re outcome of toy appeal, 

email Pricewaterhouse Coopers re obtaining 
reasons, perusing reasons, considering issues 
related to appeal 

AJW 0.70 $790.00 $553.00 

 30.60  $15,063.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 2.20 $1,738.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 3.40 $2,074.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 15.30 $6,732.00 

 Karl Shami $350.00 4.10 $1,435.00 

 Kimi Nishimura $790.00 0.60 $474.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 4.40 $2,376.00 

 Roisin Lyng $540.00 0.30 $162.00 

 Yaseen Iqbal $240.00 0.30 $72.00 

  30.60 $15,063.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $15,063.00 

 $15,063.00 

264264



 

Page 11 of 11 

 
TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $16,569.30 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 April 2019     Due Date: 25 April 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
03-05-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 March 2019 to 31 March 2019 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $8,643.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $148,121.23 AUD 

Total GST Applied $15,676.42 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $172,440.65 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Mar-19 Preparation for conference with counsel re 

taxation judgment and next steps 
KZN 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

01-Mar-19 Conference with A Watson, K Nishimura, M 
Greaves, D Bloom QC, D McInerney of counsel 
and S Rooke, S Reed and M Wyles of PwC re 
next steps following judgment in taxation dispute 

KZN 0.40 $790.00 $316.00 

01-Mar-19 Preparation for conference with counsel and 
Pricewaterhouse Coopers re next steps following 
judgement in taxation dispute 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

01-Mar-19 Conference with A Watson, K Nishimura, M 
Greaves, D Bloom QC, D McInerney of counsel 
and S Rooke, S Reed and M Wyles of PwC re 
next steps following judgment in taxation dispute 

MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

01-Mar-19 Various attendances re bulk mail out to group 
members re outcome of tax dispute, including 
multiple emails to and from CA Project Support re 
preparing samples, testing multiple samples, 
requesting amendments and reviewing and 
approving further samples and email to CA team 
and reception re mail out, considering bounce 
back emails and group member issues accessing 
attachment 

MYG 0.80 $540.00 $432.00 

01-Mar-19 Conference with A Watson, K Nishimura, M 
Greaves, D Bloom QC, D McInerney of counsel 
and S Rooke, S Reed and M Wyles of PwC re 
next steps following judgment in taxation dispute 

AJW 0.40 $790.00 $316.00 

04-Mar-19 Conference with A Watson re outcome of the 
taxation dispute and appeal 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

04-Mar-19 Reviewing reasons for judgment in the taxation 
decision of the Federal Court 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

04-Mar-19 Reviewing various materials, drafting note re: 
taxation liability, withheld amounts and adverse 
costs 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

04-Mar-19 Telephone call from S Reed, PwC re alternative 
cost order proposal, reviewing docs, drafting 
reply email, drafting file note of call 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

04-Mar-19 Reviewing various pieces of correspondence 
from group members in response to tax dispute 
group correspondence, drafting replies where 
necessary 

JSP 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

04-Mar-19 Preparing update correspondence for group 
members who are insurers 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

04-Mar-19 Conference with E Mukherji re outcome of the 
taxation dispute and appeal 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

05-Mar-19 Settling and finalising correspondence to insurer 
group members 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

05-Mar-19 Conference with M Greaves re bushfire 
correspondence and database 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

05-Mar-19 Conference with J Peck re bushfire 
correspondence and database 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
05-Mar-19 Conference with F Argus re bounce backs 

following bulk mail out 
MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

07-Mar-19 Considering advice of Counsel on appeal of tax 
decision of Middleton J 

ELM 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

07-Mar-19 Considering KPMG engagement and terms and 
conditions and email correspondence re same 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

07-Mar-19 Reviewing advice from counsel re appeal 
prospects, drafting multiple emails re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

07-Mar-19 Telephone call to J White, Special Referee for 
costs re tax trial decision and next cost report, 
drafting note re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

07-Mar-19 Drafting update correspondence to group 
members re tax decision appeal 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

07-Mar-19 Drafting affidavit material re recent developments 
in taxation dispute 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

07-Mar-19 Drafting note re next steps re potential appeal to 
tax trial decision 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

07-Mar-19 Reviewing counsel opinion re appeal MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

07-Mar-19 Perusing and considering counsel advice re 
appeal on tax matter 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

08-Mar-19 Reviewing draft notice of appeal MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

08-Mar-19 Drafting emails to S Rooke and S Reed, PwC re 
invoicing and draft notice of appeal 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

12-Mar-19 Considering email from J Peck re deployment of 
updates to Mattercentre and reporting 
requirement 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

12-Mar-19 Considering correspondence with KPMG re 
engagement following the taxation dispute 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

12-Mar-19 Reviewing and responding to bushfire group 
member responses to tax update 
correspondence 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

13-Mar-19 Reviewing bushfire undeliverable and 
bounceback emails, drafting directions for further 
steps re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

13-Mar-19 Telephone call with S Reed, PwC re appeal from 
tax decision, drafting file note re same, drafting 
and responding to emails from same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

13-Mar-19 Reviewing draft notice of appeal and reviewing 
and amending correspondence to group 
members and copy for website re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

13-Mar-19 Drafting and responding to multiple emails from A 
Watson re filing of tax appeal documents and 
correspondence to group members 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

13-Mar-19 Reviewing emails from J Peck and F Argus re 
preparation for next bulk mail out 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

13-Mar-19 Perusing draft group member update re appeal AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

14-Mar-19 Conference with E Mukherji re preparing for bulk 
mail out 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
14-Mar-19 Conference with J Peck, K Turan and F Argus re 

updating contact information on database for 
various claimants and arranging bulk mail out re 
tax appeal 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

14-Mar-19 Conference with M Greaves, K Turan and F 
Argus re updating contact information on 
database for various claimants and arranging 
bulk mail out re tax appeal 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

14-Mar-19 Drafting email to F Argus re instructions for mail 
out to group members re tax appeal update 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

14-Mar-19 Drafting email to C Spalding re instructions for 
update to Maurice Blackburn website re bushfire 
tax appeal information 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

14-Mar-19 Conference with M Greaves re preparing for bulk 
mail out 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

14-Mar-19 Settling group member update re tax appeal AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

15-Mar-19 Reviewing formatting for updated mailing list for 
group member update re tax decision appeal 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

18-Mar-19 Conference with M McDonald and G Ioannidis, 
Hall & Wilcox and J Peck re tax judgment and 
potential appeal 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

18-Mar-19 Conference with M McDonald and G Ioannidis, 
Hall & Wilcox and A Watson re tax judgment and 
potential appeal 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

18-Mar-19 Drafting file note re conference with Hall & Wilcox JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

18-Mar-19 Amending and finalsing memorandum to A 
Watson reconsiderations for the tax dispute 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

18-Mar-19 Drafting and responding to emails from C 
Spalding re updates to Maurice Blackburn 
website re tax appeal 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

18-Mar-19 Settling group member tax update 
correspondence and overseeing mail out of 
same, including multiple emails to and from F 
Argus and Y Iqbal 

JSP 1.20 $440.00 $528.00 

18-Mar-19 Preparing and settling update to insurer group 
members re tax appeal 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

18-Mar-19 Running mail merge re bulk mail out YAI 0.30 $240.00 $72.00 

19-Mar-19 Considering notice of appeal ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

19-Mar-19 Reviewing responses from group members re tax 
appeal group member update 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

19-Mar-19 Preparing and settling update to insurer group 
members re tax appeal 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

20-Mar-19 Telephone call with S Rooke, PwC re counsel for 
the appeal 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

20-Mar-19 Telephone call with S Reed, PwC re next steps 
for the tax appeal, drafting note re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

21-Mar-19 Preparing spreadsheet re GST limitation, drafting 
email to S Reed, PwC re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
22-Mar-19 Reviewing various group member enquiries and 

drafting reply emails to same 
JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

26-Mar-19 Considering email from J Peck re next steps in 
preparation for further distribution in light of tax 
dispute decision 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

27-Mar-19 Conference with J Peck re payment of 
disbursement and preparation of application to 
Court 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

27-Mar-19 Conference with A Watson re payment of 
disbursement and preparation of application to 
Court 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

28-Mar-19 Reviewing claimant enquiries, drafting email to K 
Turan and D Wood re processes for dealing with 
same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

29-Mar-19 Conference with D Wood re communication with 
group members and responding to enquiries 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

 17.00  $8,643.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 1.50 $1,185.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 1.40 $854.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 10.70 $4,708.00 

 Kimi Nishimura $790.00 0.60 $474.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 2.50 $1,350.00 

 Yaseen Iqbal $240.00 0.30 $72.00 

  17.00 $8,643.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $8,643.00 

 $8,643.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
31-Jan-2019 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Miscellaneous Miscellaneous - Tax Matters - 

PricewaterhouseCoopers- Invoice 38117263 
$148,121.23 

 $148,121.23 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $148,121.23 

 $148,121.23 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $172,440.65 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 03 May 2019     Due Date: 17 May 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
24-06-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 April 2019 to 30 April 2019 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $11,093.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $1,109.30 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $12,202.30 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Apr-19 Conference with A Watson and E Mukherji re 

progress of Scheme and seeking reimbursement 
application 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

01-Apr-19 Email to J Kaye, KPMG, re tax appeal and further 
audit work required 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

01-Apr-19 Reviewing previous materials filed with Supreme 
Court of Victoria and various other materials, 
drafting notes re further application for costs 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

01-Apr-19 Telephone conference with J White, Special 
Costs Referee, and E Mukherji re further costs 
report, including discussion with E Mukherji 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

01-Apr-19 Drafting file note of telephone conversation with J 
White, Special Costs Referee 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

01-Apr-19 Conference with A Watson and J Peck re 
progress of Scheme and seeking reimbursement 
application 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

01-Apr-19 Telephone conference with J White, Special 
Costs Referee, and J Peck re further costs report, 
including discussion with J Peck 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

01-Apr-19 Preparation of file note re discussion with A 
Watson and J Peck re preparation for application 
to the Court for approval of costs 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

01-Apr-19 Conference with E Mukherji and J Peck re 
progress of Scheme and seeking reimbursement 
application 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

02-Apr-19 Reviewing previous briefs to J White, Special 
Costs Referee, drafting file notes re same 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

03-Apr-19 Reviewing material and preparing notes for 
affidavit and outline to J White, Special Costs 
Referee, re costs 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

03-Apr-19 Perusing email from J Peck re report to court and 
drafting reply 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

04-Apr-19 Preparing material to provide to J White, Special 
Costs Referee, including confidential exhibit to 
Watson affidavit on tax 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

05-Apr-19 Reviewing various material and drafting 
confidential exhibit on taxation issues 

JSP 1.10 $440.00 $484.00 

10-Apr-19 Conference with M Greaves re preparing material 
to update the Court on progress and in support of 
application for reimbursement 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

10-Apr-19 Reviewing various materials and drafting file note 
to Special Costs Referee re costs 

JSP 1.60 $440.00 $704.00 

10-Apr-19 Conference with J Peck re preparing material to 
update the Court on progress and in support of 
application for reimbursement 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

10-Apr-19 Email to and from J Peck re preparing report for J 
White, Special Costs Referee 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 
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Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
11-Apr-19 Reviewing Power BI report for updated mailing 

lists, drafting reply email to E Coombe-Heath re 
same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

11-Apr-19 Conference with E Mukherji re preparing various 
materials to brief J White, Special Costs Referee 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

11-Apr-19 Reviewing various material and drafting file note 
to Special Costs Referee re costs 

JSP 1.50 $440.00 $660.00 

11-Apr-19 Drafting affidavit material regarding Scheme 
progress including the confidential update on 
taxation 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

11-Apr-19 Conference with J Peck re preparing various 
materials to brief J White, Special Costs Referee 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

12-Apr-19 Drafting instructions to prepare billing export to S 
Feng re briefing J White, Special Costs Referee 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

12-Apr-19 Reviewing various material and drafting file note 
to J White, Special Costs Referee, re costs 

JSP 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

12-Apr-19 Reviewing various material and drafting affidavit 
material re Scheme progress including the 
confidential update on taxation 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

15-Apr-19 Reviewing various material and drafting note to J 
White, Special Costs Referee, re costs, collating 
related material 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

15-Apr-19 Reviewing various material and drafting file note 
to J White, Special Costs Referee, re costs, 
collating related material 

JSP 1.90 $440.00 $836.00 

16-Apr-19 Drafting confidential file note to J White, Special 
Costs Referee, re costs 

JSP 2.30 $440.00 $1,012.00 

16-Apr-19 Settling affidavit exhibit which is confidential 
update on taxation issues 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

17-Apr-19 Further settling notes which compose the brief of 
material to provide to J White, Special Costs 
Referee, drafting email to A Watson re same 

JSP 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

17-Apr-19 Settling notes which compose the brief of 
material to provide to J White, Special Costs 
Referee, drafting email to A Watson re same 

JSP 1.30 $440.00 $572.00 

17-Apr-19 Perusing and settling materials provided to J 
White, Special Costs Referee, drafting email to J 
Peck re same 

AJW 0.60 $790.00 $474.00 

18-Apr-19 Reviewing various documents and drafting 
material to provide to J White, Special Costs 
Referee in second tranche of material 

JSP 1.50 $440.00 $660.00 

18-Apr-19 Reviewing various documents and drafting 
material to provide to J White, Special Costs 
Referee in second tranche of material 

JSP 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

23-Apr-19 Reviewing various documents and drafting 
material to provide to J White, Special Costs 
Referee in second tranche of material 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

24-Apr-19 Preparing second tranche of material to brief J 
White, Special Costs Referee, re costs 

JSP 1.40 $440.00 $616.00 
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Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
26-Apr-19 Reviewing and settling material for J White, 

Special Costs Referee, drafting email enclosing 
same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

30-Apr-19 Reviewing, collating and preparing material for 
third tranche of brief for J White, Special Costs 
Referee 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

 24.10  $11,093.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 1.00 $790.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.70 $427.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 22.20 $9,768.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.20 $108.00 

  24.10 $11,093.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $11,093.00 

 $11,093.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $12,202.30 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 24 June 2019     Due Date: 08 July 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
01-07-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 May 2019 to 31 May 2019 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $5,650.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $565.00 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $6,215.00 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-May-19 Preparing material for third tranche of brief to J 

White, Special Referee 
JSP 1.90 $440.00 $836.00 

02-May-19 Settling material for the third tranche of material 
to provide to J White, Special Referee 

JSP 1.20 $440.00 $528.00 

03-May-19 Reviewing ELPD second distribution report, 
drafting reply to business analysts re further 
amendments required 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

06-May-19 Reviewing bank accounts, drafting email to 
Finance team re investment in term deposits, 
drafting email to E Mukherji re same 

JSP 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

08-May-19 Telephone call to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers, re various matters 
including tax appeal 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

10-May-19 Reviewing email from finance and drafting reply 
re investment of settlement sum in term deposits, 
telephone call to C Zheng, preparing controlled 
money advice 

JSP 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

12-May-19 Reviewing email from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers, re GST and drafting 
reply 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

13-May-19 Preparing controlled money documents, 
correspondence with Finance re same 

JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

13-May-19 Perusing email from J Peck re term deposits and 
drafting reply re same 

 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

14-May-19 Considering various emails from J Peck re 
management of settlement money and listing of 
tax appeal 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

14-May-19 Drafting email to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers, re dates of appeal 
hearing 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

16-May-19 Preparing material to facilitate trust transfer from 
settlement account to term deposit for 
investment, drafting and replying to emails from C 
Zheng re same 

JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

19-May-19 Preparing handover memorandum JSP 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

20-May-19 Preparing handover memorandum JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

20-May-19 Drafting and responding to emails from C Zheng 
re investment of settlement monies in term 
deposits 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

21-May-19 Preparing handover memorandum JSP 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

22-May-19 Telephone call to J White, Special Referee, for 
costs re preparing fifth cost report 

JSP 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

22-May-19 Reviewing material and preparing bushfires 
handover memorandum 

JSP 2.20 $440.00 $968.00 

23-May-19 Reviewing and settling handover memorandum JSP 1.30 $440.00 $572.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
23-May-19 Drafting affidavit material in preparation for next 

case management hearing 
JSP 1.20 $440.00 $528.00 

24-May-19 Reviewing filenote from J Peck re preparation for 
upcoming case management hearing 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

24-May-19 Drafting affidavit material in preparation for next 
case management hearing 

JSP 1.50 $440.00 $660.00 

 12.70  $5,650.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.10 $79.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.10 $61.00 

 Jonathan Peck $440.00 12.40 $5,456.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.10 $54.00 

  12.70 $5,650.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $5,650.00 

 $5,650.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $6,215.00 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 01 July 2019     Due Date: 15 July 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
15-08-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 June 2019 to 30 June 2019 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $478.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $47.80 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $525.80 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
03-Jun-19 Reviewing court orders re tax dispute appeal 

proceedings 
MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

07-Jun-19 Email to J White, Special Costs Referee, re 
progress of costs report 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

13-Jun-19 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
steps in preparation for tax appeal 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

14-Jun-19 Telephone call to J White, Special Costs Referee, 
re progress of costs report 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

18-Jun-19 Email to A Watson re preparation of appeal 
submissions 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

18-Jun-19 Perusing email from E Mukherji re tax appeal 
submissions, drafting reply 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

26-Jun-19 Reviewing emails from J White, Special Costs 
Referee, re request for further information, replied 
re same and email to E Mukherji re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-Jun-19 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
further instructions re GST advice 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

 0.80  $478.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.10 $79.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.30 $183.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.40 $216.00 

  0.80 $478.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $478.00 

 $478.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $525.80 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 15 August 2019     Due Date: 29 August 2019 
 

296296



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
18-09-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 July 2019 to 31 July 2019 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $9,434.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $943.40 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $10,377.40 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Jul-19 Email to J White, Special Costs Referee, re 

update re outstanding material 
MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

02-Jul-19 Telephone call from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re provision of material 
requested by J White, Special Costs Referee 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

02-Jul-19 Email to J White, Special Costs Referee re 
update re material requested from 
PricewaterhouseCoopers for costs report 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

02-Jul-19 Considering email from PricewaterhouseCoopers 
re GST advice and email to K Turan re 
preparation of material 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

04-Jul-19 Reviewing email from G Ioannidis, Hall & Wilcox, 
re update on tax dispute and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

04-Jul-19 Email to PricewaterhouseCoopers re material 
requested for GST advice 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

09-Jul-19 Reviewing email from J White, Special Costs 
Referee re request for further information and 
email to R Lyng re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

09-Jul-19 Reviewing memorandum re tax dispute RWL 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

09-Jul-19 Reviewing email from Hall and Wilcox re tax 
dispute and responding to same 

RWL 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

09-Jul-19 Reviewing correspondence from Telford solicitors 
re ongoing dispute re ELPD settlement monies, 
reviewing claim and all documentation and 
drafting response 

RWL 2.20 $540.00 $1,188.00 

12-Jul-19 Conference, R Lyng and M Greaves re collation 
and provision of material to J White, Special 
Costs Referee 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

12-Jul-19 Multiple emails to and from R Lyng re collation 
and provision of material to J White, special costs 
referee 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Jul-19 Reviewing draft email from R Lyng to J White, 
Special Costs Referee, reviewing and collating 
further information, multiple emails to and from K 
Turan requiring updated material and email to J 
White re same 

MYG 0.60 $540.00 $324.00 

12-Jul-19 Telephone call from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re update re provision 
of further information required as requested by J 
White, Special Costs Referee 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Jul-19 Conference, R Lyng and M Greaves re collation 
and provision of material to J White, Special 
Costs Referee 

RWL 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

12-Jul-19 Reviewing affidavit for Case Management 
Conference 

RWL 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

12-Jul-19 Conference with D Wood re materials for J White, 
Special Costs Referee 

RWL 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

12-Jul-19 Reviewing email from J White, Special Costs 
Referee, collating materials requested and 
drafting reply 

RWL 1.20 $540.00 $648.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
15-Jul-19 Email to E Mukherji re tax dispute RWL 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

16-Jul-19 Telephone call from J White, Special Costs 
Referee, re confidential note for costs 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

17-Jul-19 Multiple emails from and to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re information 
regarding settlement administration for purposes 
of taxation dispute 

KZN 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

18-Jul-19 Email to R Lyng re confidential note to J White, 
Special Costs Referee and draft affidavit 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

18-Jul-19 Amending confidential note and email to J White, 
Special Costs Referee re same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

18-Jul-19 Telephone conference with S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re preparation for tax 
appeal 

ELM 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

18-Jul-19 Reviewing email from RMCG and letter from 
Telford and Co re ELPD family dispute 

RWL 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

18-Jul-19 Drafting response to RMCG re Jowett dispute 
including review all correspondence and 
assessments 

RWL 0.60 $540.00 $324.00 

18-Jul-19 Reviewing status of outstanding distributions re 
note for J White, Special Costs Referee 

RWL 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

18-Jul-19 Drafting response to RMCG re Jowett dispute 
including review all correspondence and 
assessments 

RWL 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

19-Jul-19 Telephone conference with S Reed and S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers, re information 
requested by J White, Special Costs Referee, 
drafting file note following same 

KZN 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

19-Jul-19 Telephone call with RMCG re disputed 
assessment 

RWL 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

19-Jul-19 Telephone call from RMCG re Jowett dispute RWL 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

22-Jul-19 Email to A Watson re preparation for filing tax 
appeal submissions 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

23-Jul-19 Reviewing email from J White, Special Costs 
Referee, re access to FileSite and Matter Centre, 
reviewing email from S Reed, 
PriceWaterHouseCoopers re provision of invoice 
material for J White, reviewing and collating 
material, and email to J White re same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

23-Jul-19 Conference, M Greaves and K Turan re access 
to FileSite and Matter Centre for J White, Special 
Costs Referee 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

23-Jul-19 Considering email from S Reed re GST issue ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

24-Jul-19 Reviewing email from J White, Special Costs 
Referee, re request for various stack graphs, 
preparing stack graphs and replied re same 

MYG 0.90 $540.00 $486.00 

24-Jul-19 Email to J White, Special Costs Referee, re 
access to FileSite and Matter Centre, including 
arranging access and collating reference material 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
24-Jul-19 Multiple telephone conferences with S Reed, 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re tax submissions 
ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

24-Jul-19 Conference with E Mukherji and A Watson re tax 
appeal submissions 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

24-Jul-19 Conference with E Mukherji and A Watson re tax 
appeal submissions 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

24-Jul-19 Perusing appeal submissions AJW 0.50 $790.00 $395.00 

24-Jul-19 Perusing revised submission re tax appeal AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

24-Jul-19 Considering draft submissions to be filed in tax 
appeal including judgement of Middleton J 

ELM 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

25-Jul-19 Telephone conference S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers, A Watson and E 
Mukherji re tax appeal submissions 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

25-Jul-19 Telephone conference S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers, A Watson and E 
Mukherji re tax appeal submissions 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

25-Jul-19 Considering correspondence from 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re PAYG and email in 
reply 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

25-Jul-19 Preparing file note from telephone conference 
with S Rooke, PricewaterhouseCoopers re tax 
appeal submissions 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

25-Jul-19 Multiple emails to A Watson and S Rooke re tax 
appeal submissions 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

25-Jul-19 Correspondence with N Callen, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers and Finance re 
provision of account reconciliations for 
preparation of tax returns 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

29-Jul-19 Multiple emails to and from J White, Special 
Referee Costs re access to FileSite and Matter 
Centre and replied re same, including email to K 
Turan re same 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

30-Jul-19 Conference with K Turan re collation of material 
for J White, Special Referee Costs 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

30-Jul-19 Reviewing email from J White, Special Referee 
Costs, re request for further material, collating 
further material, including multiple emails to and 
from K Turan and D Wood, email to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re request for further 
material and email to J White re same 

MYG 0.70 $540.00 $378.00 

 16.40  $9,434.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 1.00 $790.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 2.90 $1,769.00 

 Kimi Nishimura $790.00 0.50 $395.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 4.80 $2,592.00 

 Roisin Lyng $540.00 7.20 $3,888.00 

  16.40 $9,434.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $9,434.00 

 $9,434.00 

303303



 

Page 8 of 8 

 
TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $10,377.40 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 18 September 2019     Due Date: 02 October 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
02-10-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 August 2019 to 31 August 2019 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $10,605.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $449.90 AUD 

Total GST Applied $1,105.49 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $12,160.39 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Aug-19 Various attendances re provision of further 

material to J White, Special Costs Referee, 
including emails to and from J White, email from 
and to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers, 
reviewing filesite and collating material 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

01-Aug-19 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
GST 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

05-Aug-19 Telephone conference, E Mukherji and M 
Greaves re update re preparation for tax dispute 
hearing 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

05-Aug-19 Telephone conference, E Mukherji and M 
Greaves re update re preparation for tax dispute 
hearing 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

07-Aug-19 Reviewing email from John White, Special Costs 
Referee re draft costs report and request for 
further information 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

07-Aug-19 Telephone in from S Reed re preparation of 
submissions in reply 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

07-Aug-19 Email to A Watson re tax appeal submissions ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

08-Aug-19 Reviewing reply submissions re taxation matter, 
reviewing further revised submissions and 
emailing E'OShea re same 

AJW 0.40 $790.00 $316.00 

12-Aug-19 Collating and reviewing FY18 and FY19 account 
reconciliations and email same to N Callen, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers 

ELM 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

13-Aug-19 Detailed review of email from J White, Special 
Costs Referee, replied re same and collating 
various material re same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

13-Aug-19 Multiple emails to and from E Mukherji re 
confidential note on taxation dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

13-Aug-19 Reviewing and amending draft affidavit MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

13-Aug-19 Drafting confidential note on taxation dispute to 
be annexed to affidavit of A Watson 

ELM 0.70 $610.00 $427.00 

13-Aug-19 Multiple emails to and from M Greaves re advice 
from PricewaterhouseCoopers re tax and GST in 
preparation for report to the Supreme Court 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

13-Aug-19 Reviewing draft affidavit and trust monies 
accounts 

RWL 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

15-Aug-19 Conference, A Watson, E Mukherji and M 
Greaves re delaying application to court re costs 
approval and next steps 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

15-Aug-19 Reviewing and drafting affidavit including auditing 
all trust monies 

RWL 1.10 $540.00 $594.00 

15-Aug-19 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
affidavit preparation re approval of costs and 
preparation for hearing re taxation dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

15-Aug-19 Conference, A Watson, E Mukherji and M 
Greaves re delaying application to court re costs 
approval and next steps 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
15-Aug-19 Reviewing draft report of J White, Special Costs 

Referee 
MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

15-Aug-19 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
affidavit preparation re approval of costs and 
preparation for hearing re taxation dispute 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

15-Aug-19 Conference, A Watson, E Mukherji and M 
Greaves re delaying application to court re costs 
approval and next steps 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

16-Aug-19 Email to J White, Special Costs Referee, re 
update re court reporting and costs report 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

21-Aug-19 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
preparation for taxation appeal hearing 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

21-Aug-19 Reviewing Middleton J decision, appellant and 
respondent submissions and chronology and 
authorities in preparation for taxation appeal 

ELM 1.40 $610.00 $854.00 

21-Aug-19 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
preparation for taxation appeal hearing 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

21-Aug-19 Email to A Watson re preparation for taxation 
appeal 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

21-Aug-19 Instructions to K Turan re preparation of 
hardcopy brief for tax appeal 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

21-Aug-19 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
preparation for taxation appeal hearing 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

22-Aug-19 Attendance at Federal Court for Full Court appeal 
of taxation dispute 

ELM 2.50 $610.00 $1,525.00 

22-Aug-19 Reviewing various material in preparation for 
taxation appeal hearing, including original 
decision, submissions, chronology and authorities 

MYG 0.70 $540.00 $378.00 

22-Aug-19 Attendance at Federal Court for Full Court appeal 
of taxation dispute 

MYG 1.80 $540.00 $972.00 

22-Aug-19 Attendance at Federal Court for Full Court appeal 
of taxation dispute 

AJW 1.50 $790.00 $1,185.00 

23-Aug-19 Telephone call to K Rowe to provide update on 
tax appeal hearing 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

23-Aug-19 Conference, A Watson and M Greaves re settling 
draft update letter to group members following 
taxation appeal hearing 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

23-Aug-19 Various attendances re preparing update letter 
and mail out to group members following taxation 
appeal hearing, including drafting and finalising 
letter, email to A Watson, and multiple emails to 
and from CA Project Support and Y Iqbal re 
preparations for mail out 

MYG 0.90 $540.00 $486.00 

23-Aug-19 Conference, A Watson and M Greaves re settling 
draft update letter to group members following 
taxation appeal hearing 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

23-Aug-19 Reviewing and settling group member update AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
26-Aug-19 Various attendances re preparing bulk mail out to 

group members following taxation appeal 
hearing, including multiple emails to and from CA 
Project Support, reviewing, amending and 
finalising mail out spreadsheets, reviewing 
samples, and email to Y Iqbal re instructions re 
postal mail out 

MYG 1.30 $540.00 $702.00 

26-Aug-19 Considering draft press release re tax appeal and 
email to C Scott re same 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

27-Aug-19 Reviewing hard copy letter samples and email to 
Y Iqbal re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

30-Aug-19 Considering file notes re advice from 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re GST strategy and 
preparing file note from telephone conference 
with S Reed 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

 17.70  $10,605.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 2.20 $1,738.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 7.10 $4,331.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 6.80 $3,672.00 

 Roisin Lyng $540.00 1.60 $864.00 

  17.70 $10,605.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $10,605.00 

 $10,605.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
29-Aug-2019 Law Image Service (MELB) Pty Ltd - Photocopying Charges 

Photocopying Fees - Law Image - Invoice M0064414 
$449.90 

 $449.90 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $449.90 

 $449.90 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $12,160.39 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 02 October 2019     Due Date: 16 October 2019 
 

313313



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
20-11-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 September 2019 to 30 

September 2019 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, 
testing, implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the 
Supreme Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) 
by orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,638.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $163.80 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $1,801.80 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
05-Sep-19 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re 

various group member enquiries 
MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

05-Sep-19 Reviewing email from group member re enquiry 
and email to D Wood re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

05-Sep-19 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
various group member enquiries 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

08-Sep-19 Responding to group member enquiry re tax 
dispute 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

09-Sep-19 Email to D Wood re group member enquiry MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

18-Sep-19 Reviewing email enquiry from K Nishimura, 
replied re same and email to D Wood re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

18-Sep-19 Telephone conference with S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re GST issue, tax 
appeal, next steps and preparing file note re 
same 

ELM 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

19-Sep-19 Reviewing filenote from E Mukherji re GST issue 
and taxation appeal 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

19-Sep-19 Preparing file note re position on GST and 
lodgement for BAS 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

19-Sep-19 Reviewing Pricewaterhouse invoices and advice 
in preparation for meeting with A Watson 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

20-Sep-19 Reviewing group member claim and email to M 
Greaves re same 

RWL 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

20-Sep-19 Considering PricewaterhouseCoopers invoices re 
GST advice and email to A Watson re same 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

20-Sep-19 Email to K Turan re PricewaterhouseCoopers 
outstanding invoices 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

25-Sep-19 Reviewing enquiry re potential group member 
and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

25-Sep-19 Reviewing email from D Wood re estate enquiry 
and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

30-Sep-19 Telephone call and email to S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re tax appeal and 
review of invoices 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

 2.80  $1,638.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 1.80 $1,098.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.80 $432.00 

 Roisin Lyng $540.00 0.20 $108.00 

  2.80 $1,638.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,638.00 

 $1,638.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $1,801.80 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 20 November 2019     Due Date: 04 December 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
22-11-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 October 2019 to 31 October 

2019 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $2,466.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $262,854.55 AUD 

Total GST Applied $26,159.31 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $291,479.86 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
03-Oct-19 Telephone call to S Reed, 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re GST advice 
ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

07-Oct-19 Telephone conference with S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re GST 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

07-Oct-19 Reviewing PricewaterhouseCoopers invoices for 
tax dispute, comparing with estimated budget and 
email to K Turan re same 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

08-Oct-19 Email to K Turan re payment of 
PricewaterhouseCoopers invoices to be paid 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

09-Oct-19 Email to K Turan re reconciliation of 
PricewaterhouseCoopers invoices for tax dispute 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

15-Oct-19 Correspondence with PricewaterhouseCoopers 
re GST advice, telephone call to S Reed re same 
and preparation of file note 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

16-Oct-19 Telephone conference with S Reed re GST 
strategy and file note re same 

ELM 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

16-Oct-19 Considering email from K Turan re tax dispute 
budget estimate 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

17-Oct-19 Reviewing email from Finance re unclaimed 
settlement monies and email to K Turan and D 
Wood re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

17-Oct-19 Preparing update to website following taxation 
hearing 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

17-Oct-19 Conference with K Turan re 
PricewaterhouseCoopers fees 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

21-Oct-19 Reviewing email from C Spalding re website 
updates, reviewing updates and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

21-Oct-19 Conference with K Turan and D Wood re 
preparation of invoices for lodgement of BAS 
statements 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

23-Oct-19 Telephone conference with 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re preparation of ABN 
lodgement and next steps re GST 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

23-Oct-19 Reviewing ABN application form and email to 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

23-Oct-19 Email to A Watson re review of appeal costs 
against budget estimate 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

23-Oct-19 Reviewing PricewaterhouseCoopers fee tracker 
and invoices and email to S Reed re same 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

23-Oct-19 Email to CA Costs re tax file number and trust 
account details 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

24-Oct-19 Telephone conference with S Reed re informal 
discussions with the ATO re lodgement of BAS, 
and process to self amend 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

25-Oct-19 Email to C Gu, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
lodgement of BAS, including provision of 
professional fees and invoices for relevant period 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
28-Oct-19 Reviewing draft BAS statements prepared by 

PricewaterhouseCoopers, conferring with A 
Watson re same and email to 
PricewaterhouseCoopers to confirm lodgement 

ELM 0.80 $610.00 $488.00 

28-Oct-19 Preparing file note from conference with A 
Watson re confirmation of lodgement of BAS 
statements 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

28-Oct-19 File note from telephone conference with S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers to discuss preparation 
for and lodgement of BAS and proposed strategy 
for dealing with the ATO 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

29-Oct-19 Reviewing email enquiry from group member re 
outstanding taxation decision and email to D 
Wood re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

29-Oct-19 Telephone call from S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re GST lodgement and 
response of ATO 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

 4.10  $2,466.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 3.60 $2,196.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.50 $270.00 

  4.10 $2,466.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $2,466.00 

 $2,466.00 

325325



 

Page 7 of 8 

 

Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
30-Jun-2019 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Miscellaneous Miscellaneous - Tax Charges 

- PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 39058395 
$65,057.45 

24-Sep-2019 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Miscellaneous Miscellaneous - Legal 
Services - PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 39089870 

$194,069.60 

 $259,127.05 

 
Disbursements Not Subject to GST 
30-Jun-2019 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Miscellaneous Miscellaneous - Tax Charges 

- PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 39058395 (GST Free) 
$3,727.50 

 $3,727.50 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $259,127.05 

 Disbursements Not Subject to GST $3,727.50 

 $262,854.55 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $291,479.86 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 22 November 2019     Due Date: 06 December 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12-12-2019 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 November 2019 to 30 November 

2019 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $872.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $87.20 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $959.20 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
13-Nov-19 Telephone call to S Rooke, PwC re update on 

GST issues and negotiations with the ATO 
ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

16-Nov-19 Reviewing correspondence from PwC re update 
on GST issues, including proposed letter to ATO 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

16-Nov-19 Settling draft letter to the ATO prepared by PwC, 
providing comment and seeking further 
clarification from PwC re same 

ELM 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

25-Nov-19 Settling letter to ATO re GST and email to PwC 
re same 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

26-Nov-19 Reviewing email from Supreme Court re update 
on progress 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

26-Nov-19 Conference with E Mukherji re update on 
progress for Supreme Court 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

26-Nov-19 Conference with A Watson re update on progress 
for Supreme Court 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

26-Nov-19 Email to Supreme Court re update on progress ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

 1.40  $872.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.10 $79.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 1.30 $793.00 

  1.40 $872.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $872.00 

 $872.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $959.20 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 12 December 2019     Due Date: 26 December 2019 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
13-01-2020 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 December 2019 to 31 December 

2019 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $4,173.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $417.30 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $4,590.30 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
05-Dec-19 Telephone conference with S Reed, 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re GST issue and 
correspondence with ATO 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

10-Dec-19 Conference with A Watson, K Nishimura, E 
Mukherji, M Greaves and R Lyng re preparation 
for second distribution 

MYG 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

10-Dec-19 Conference with A Watson, K Nishimura, E 
Mukherji, M Greaves and R Lyng re preparation 
for second distribution 

KZN 0.50 $790.00 $395.00 

10-Dec-19 Conference with A Watson, K Nishimura, E 
Mukherji, M Greaves and R Lyng re preparation 
for second distribution 

RWL 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

10-Dec-19 Conference with A Watson, K Nishimura, E 
Mukherji, M Greaves and R Lyng re preparation 
for second distribution 

AJW 0.50 $790.00 $395.00 

10-Dec-19 Conference with A Watson, K Nishimura, E 
Mukherji, M Greaves and R Lyng re preparation 
for second distribution 

ELM 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

11-Dec-19 Considering requirements for bulk mail out to 
update group members re tax appeal 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

12-Dec-19 Conference with M Stephens and R Lyng re 
preparation of update letter mailout 

MST 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

12-Dec-19 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re steps 
required for preparation of bulk mail out 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

12-Dec-19 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re steps 
required for preparation of bulk mail out 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Dec-19 Email to M Greaves re contact lists for mailout RWL 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Dec-19 Conference with M Stephens and R Lyng re 
preparation of update letter mailout 

RWL 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

13-Dec-19 Reviewing draft letter re taxation update and 
email to E Mukherji re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

13-Dec-19 Settling group member update re tax appeal AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

13-Dec-19 Considering recent updates to group members 
and drafting further update to group member re 
tax appeal 

ELM 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

16-Dec-19 Drafting email to Class Actions Project Support 
team re preparing bulk mail out to group 
members 

MST 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

16-Dec-19 Preparing update letter mailout MST 0.40 $320.00 $128.00 

16-Dec-19 Email to and from R Lyng and M Greaves re 
preparation for bulk mail out update to group 
members 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

16-Dec-19 Reviewing update letter RWL 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

16-Dec-19 Email to E Mukherji re update letter RWL 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

17-Dec-19 Preparing update letter mailout MST 0.70 $320.00 $224.00 

337337



 

Page 5 of 7 

 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
17-Dec-19 Reviewing update letter, mailing lists and email to 

team re same 
RWL 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

18-Dec-19 Email to M Stephens re update letter to group 
members 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

18-Dec-19 Preparing update letter mail out MST 0.10 $320.00 $32.00 

19-Dec-19 Preparing update letter mail out MST 0.30 $320.00 $96.00 

19-Dec-19 Reviewing template letter and data sets for 
update letter mailout 

RWL 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

20-Dec-19 Considering email from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re GST and email in 
reply 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

 7.70  $4,173.00 

338338
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.70 $553.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 1.90 $1,159.00 

 Kimi Nishimura $790.00 0.50 $395.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.80 $432.00 

 Molly Stephens $320.00 1.90 $608.00 

 Roisin Lyng $540.00 1.90 $1,026.00 

  7.70 $4,173.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $4,173.00 

 $4,173.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $4,590.30 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 13 January 2020     Due Date: 27 January 2020 
 

340340



Matter Ref 3052534

Tax Invoice 

Scheme Administrator

Class Actions Dept

Maurice Blackburn Lawyers

Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street

Melbourne VIC 3000   

29-06-2020

TO: 

RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General

Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 January 

2020 to 31 January 2020 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and 

Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 

administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the 

Supreme Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & 

Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders of 27 May 2015.

SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE

Total Professional Fees $6,274.00 AUD

Total Disbursements $20,128.84

$2,640.28Total GST Applied

AUD

AUD

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $29,043.12

With Compliments

MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD

AUD

341341



Page 2 of 8

342342



Page 3 of 8

343343



Professional Fees

AmountOper UnitsDate RateDetails

$540.00$540.00Reviewing sample update letters and drafting email to 

CA Projects re mailout amendments required

 1.00RWL6-Jan-20

$540.00$540.00Reviewing data set and preparing mail merge of 

physical letters for printing

 1.00RWL7-Jan-20

$540.00$540.00Reviewing samples for update letter mailout and email 

to CA Projects re required amendments

 1.00RWL7-Jan-20

$108.00$540.00Multiple emails to and from R Lyng re update letter 

samples

 0.20MYG7-Jan-20

$162.00$540.00Conference with H Soley re update letter enquiries and 

responses

 0.30RWL7-Jan-20

$540.00$540.00Reviewing emails from group members in response to 

update letter and drafting replies

 1.00RWL9-Jan-20

$1,080.00$540.00Drafting and sending correspondence to subrogated 

claimants re update on taxation dispute

 2.00RWL10-Jan-20

$162.00$540.00Email to team re payments to subrogated claimants in 

the event of a second distribution

 0.30RWL10-Jan-20

$54.00$540.00Email to group member re payment details  0.10RWL10-Jan-20

$108.00$540.00Conference with H Soley re various group member 

enquiries following bulk mail out

 0.20MYG21-Jan-20

$162.00$540.00Reviewing various group member enquiries and 

multiple emails to D Wood re same

 0.30MYG22-Jan-20

$108.00$540.00Reviewing trust accounts  0.20RWL23-Jan-20

$108.00$540.00Reviewing distribution to deregistered companies and 

drafting email to M Greaves re same

 0.20RWL23-Jan-20

$162.00$540.00Reviewing enquiries from group members re further 

distribution issues

 0.30RWL23-Jan-20

$54.00$540.00Email to K Nishimura re various enquiries re potential 

further distribution and deregistered companies

 0.10MYG23-Jan-20

$108.00$540.00Reviewing various emails from group members 

following bulk mail out, drafting replies and emails to D 

Wood re same

 0.20MYG23-Jan-20

$108.00$540.00Various attendances re group member enquiries, 

including multiple emails to and from C Raso, D Wood 

and H Soley

 0.20MYG24-Jan-20

$54.00$540.00Conference with C Raso re handover re preparation 

for potential distribution

 0.10MYG24-Jan-20

$162.00$540.00Conference with K Nishimura and R Lyng re 

deregistered companies and further distribution

 0.30MYG24-Jan-20

$162.00$540.00Conference with M Greaves and K Nishimura re 

deregistered companies and further distribution

 0.30RWL24-Jan-20

$108.00$540.00Conference with K Nishimura re ELPD de-registered 

company enquiries and preparation for potential further 

distribution

 0.20MYG24-Jan-20

$54.00$540.00Conference with K Nishimura and R Lyng re ELPD 

de-registered company enquiries

 0.10MYG24-Jan-20

$44.00$440.00Conference with M Greaves re handover re 

preparation for potential distribution

 0.10CAR24-Jan-20

$54.00$540.00Conference with K Nishimura and M Greaves re ELPD 

de-registered company enquiries

 0.10RWL24-Jan-20

Page 4 of 8

344344



Professional Fees

AmountOper UnitsDate RateDetails

$158.00$790.00Conference with M Greaves re ELPD de-registered 

company enquiries and preparation for potential further 

distribution

 0.20KZN24-Jan-20

$79.00$790.00Conference with R Lyng and M Greaves re ELPD 

de-registered company enquiries

 0.10KZN24-Jan-20

$237.00$790.00Conference with M Greaves and R Lyng re 

deregistered companies and further distribution

 0.30KZN24-Jan-20

$79.00$790.00Planning for ELPD potential further distribution, 

including consideration of issues re distributing to now 

deregistered companies

 0.10KZN24-Jan-20

$54.00$540.00Reviewing email from D Mullen, Finance re cheque 

remediation payments proposal and replied re same

 0.10MYG29-Jan-20

$108.00$540.00Conference with H Soley and S Spencer re 

consideration of database migration and potential 

further distribution

 0.20MYG29-Jan-20

$54.00$540.00Reviewing email from D Wood re group member 

enquiry re further distribution and email in reply re 

same

 0.10MYG29-Jan-20

$61.00$610.00Conference with M Greaves re update re group 

member response following bulk mail out and 

consideration of potential further distribution threshold

 0.10ELM30-Jan-20

$54.00$540.00Conference with E Mukherji re update re group 

member response following bulk mail out and 

consideration of potential further distribution threshold

 0.10MYG30-Jan-20

$54.00$540.00Emails to and from CA Project Support re updates to 

portal re group members names in preparation for 

further distribution

 0.10MYG31-Jan-20

$54.00$540.00Reviewing multiple emails from H Soley and R Lyng re 

amending claimant name in portal in preparation for 

potential further distribution and email to CA Project 

Support re request for amendment to portal

 0.10MYG31-Jan-20

 11.30 $6,274.00
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Professional Fees Summary

AmountUnitsRate

$44.00 0.10$440.00Christian Raso

$61.00 0.10$610.00Elizabeth Mukherji

$553.00 0.70$790.00Kimi Nishimura

$1,404.00 2.60$540.00Megan Greaves

$4,212.00 7.80$540.00Roisin Lyng

 11.30 $6,274.00

 11.30 $6,274.00

Professional Fees - Events Code Summary

AmountUnits

Professional Fees Summary

Professional Fees Subject to GST $6,274.00

$6,274.00

Page 6 of 8
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Disbursements

AmountDate Details

Sundries

Disbursements Subject to GST

15-Jan-2020 Law Image Service (MELB) Pty Ltd - Photocopying Charges - 

Invoice M0065391 (mailout 07.01.2020)

$650.40

31-Jan-2020 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Expert Fees - Invoice 40005457 dated 

31 January 2020 (to 20.12.2019 including preparation of letter to 

ATO re BAS to 30.09.2019, additional and subsequent 

correspondence with ATO, preparation of BAS to 30.09.2019, 

document copying and delivery)

$19,478.44

$20,128.84Sundries

Disbursement Summary

$20,128.84Disbursements Subject to GST

$20,128.84

Page 7 of 8
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Methods of Payment
By Cheque:

Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as 

Remittance Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  

 

By Direct Debit: 

Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your 

Client Ref is quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating 

Invoices included in payment.

Credit Card by Phone:  (For Invoices up to $10,000 only)

Please call 03 9605 2700

We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail.

TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice

Matter No: 3052534 Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General

Invoice Number: Amount Due:$29,043.12 AUD

Invoice Date: 29-June-2020

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

 (For Invoices up to $10,000 only)
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-03-2020 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 February 2020 to 29 February 

2020 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $527.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $52.70 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $579.70 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
03-Feb-20 Considering group member enquiries in response 

to update letter 
ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

10-Feb-20 Conference with R Lyng re handover of 
settlement distribution 

CAR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

10-Feb-20 Conference with C Raso re handover of 
settlement distribution 

RWL 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

12-Feb-20 Email to CA Project Support re update to 
administration portal re group member details in 
preparation for potential further distribution 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

20-Feb-20 Reviewing email from R Lyng re accounts and 
payment records and email to Finance re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

20-Feb-20 Reviewing accounts and payment records and 
email to M Greaves re conduct money 

RWL 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

 1.00  $527.00 

352352
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Christian Raso $440.00 0.20 $88.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.10 $61.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.20 $108.00 

 Roisin Lyng $540.00 0.50 $270.00 

  1.00 $527.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $527.00 

 $527.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $579.70 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 March 2020     Due Date: 25 March 2020 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
22-04-2020 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 March 2020 to 31 March 2020 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $4,282.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $428.20 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $4,710.20 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
12-Mar-20 Conference with E Mukherji and C Raso re steps 

in preparation for potential distribution following 
judgement on tax liability 

MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

12-Mar-20 Conference with E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
steps in preparation for potential distribution 
following judgement on tax liability 

CAR 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

12-Mar-20 Reviewing and considering various filenotes and 
memoranda re steps in preparation for potential 
distribution following judgement on tax liability 
and drafting letter to group members re potential 
outcome 

CAR 1.80 $440.00 $792.00 

12-Mar-20 Conference with M Greaves and C Raso re steps 
in preparation for potential distribution following 
judgement on tax liability 

ELM 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

12-Mar-20 Considering email from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re GST 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

13-Mar-20 Conference with M Greaves re steps in 
preparation for potential distribution following 
judgment on tax liability 

CAR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

13-Mar-20 Various attendances re steps in preparation for 
potential distribution following judgment on tax 
liability including reviewing and considering 
various filenotes, memoranda and 
correspondence, email correspondence with 
finance and costs department, reviewing account 
reconciliations and costs report, email to E 
Mukherji and M Greaves 

CAR 2.40 $440.00 $1,056.00 

13-Mar-20 Conference with C Raso re steps in preparation 
for potential distribution following judgment on tax 
liability 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

16-Mar-20 Reviewing email from H Soley re enquiry from 
HWL Ebsworth and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

16-Mar-20 Multiple emails to and from H Soley re group 
member enquiries 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

16-Mar-20 Reviewing email from T Fenech re requests from 
group members to update contact details, 
reviewing spreadsheet and email to T Fenech 
and H Soley re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

17-Mar-20 Considering J Peck handover document and draft 
affidavit and considering steps in preparation for 
further distribution and application for approval of 
costs 

ELM 0.80 $610.00 $488.00 

18-Mar-20 Multiple emails to and from H Soley re various 
group members re bounce backs and obtaining 
updated contact details 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

18-Mar-20 Reviewing and considering account 
reconciliations and fees and disbursements in 
consideration of potential judgement re taxation 
dispute 

CAR 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

23-Mar-20 Conference with A Watson and C Raso re steps 
in preparation for potential distribution following 
judgment on tax liability 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
23-Mar-20 Conference with A Watson and M Greaves re 

steps in preparation for potential distribution 
following judgment on tax liability 

CAR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

23-Mar-20 Reviewing reconciliation, fee report and orders in 
approval of payment of costs, drafting summary 
of unpaid fees and disbursements to date, email 
to A Watson 

CAR 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

23-Mar-20 Reviewing emails from A Watson and M Greaves 
re next steps in relation to potential costs 
approval 

CAR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

23-Mar-20 Conference with M Greaves and C Raso re steps 
in preparation for potential distribution following 
judgment on tax liability 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

24-Mar-20 Considering email from C Raso re breakdown of 
unpaid fees and disbursements and email to A 
Watson re same 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

25-Mar-20 Reviewing email from E Mukherji re affidavit in 
support of costs approval 

CAR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

 8.80  $4,282.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.10 $79.00 

 Christian Raso $440.00 6.00 $2,640.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 1.50 $915.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 1.20 $648.00 

  8.80 $4,282.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $4,282.00 

 $4,282.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $4,710.20 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 22 April 2020     Due Date: 06 May 2020 
 

361361



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
29-06-2020 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 April 2020 to 30 April 2020 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $3,919.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $391.90 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $4,310.90 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Apr-20 Email to H Soley re PricewaterhouseCoopers 

invoice 
ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

01-Apr-20 Reviewing and considering ELPD memorandum 
prepared by J Peck in preparation for potential 
further distribution 

ELM 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

16-Apr-20 Conference with E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
steps in preparation for potential distribution to 
group members including resolving potential 
payments to third parties 

CAR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

16-Apr-20 Reviewing various materials re potential 
payments to third parties 

CAR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

16-Apr-20 Conference with E Mukherji and C Raso re steps 
in preparation for potential distribution to group 
members including resolving potential payments 
to third parties 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

16-Apr-20 Conference with M Greaves and C Raso re steps 
in preparation for potential distribution to group 
members including resolving potential payments 
to third parties 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

20-Apr-20 Reviewing various materials re potential 
payments to third parties 

CAR 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

21-Apr-20 Reviewing various materials re potential 
payments to third parties and drafting filenote re 
same 

CAR 0.80 $440.00 $352.00 

22-Apr-20 Email to J White, Costs Referee re preparing 
updated report for court approval 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

22-Apr-20 Reviewing various materials re potential 
payments to third parties and drafting filenote re 
same 

CAR 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

22-Apr-20 Reviewing draft report of J White, Costs Referee 
and previous material provided to J White and 
considering next steps 

MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

22-Apr-20 Reviewing January 2020 update to group 
members and email to A Watson re further 
update to group members 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

23-Apr-20 Telephone conference with E Mukherji and C 
Raso re preparation for potential further 
distribution, including calculations of potential 
residual amounts, potential payments to third 
parties and 

MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

23-Apr-20 Telephone conference with E Mukherji and M 
Greaves re preparation for potential further 
distribution, including calculations of potential 
residual amounts, potential payments to third 
parties and 

CAR 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

23-Apr-20 Reviewing various materials re potential 
payments to third parties and drafting filenote re 
same 

CAR 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

23-Apr-20 Settling update letter to group members re 
outcome of appeal 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
23-Apr-20 Telephone conference with M Greaves and C 

Raso re preparation for potential further 
distribution, including calculations of potential 
residual amounts, potential payments to third 
parties and 

ELM 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

24-Apr-20 Drafting report for J White, Costs Referee MYG 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

27-Apr-20 Reviewing various materials re potential 
payments to third parties and drafting filenote re 
same 

CAR 0.90 $440.00 $396.00 

29-Apr-20 Drafting report for J White, Costs Referee MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

29-Apr-20 Reviewing and considering email from E Mukherji 
re group member communication re outcome of 
appeal and replied re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

29-Apr-20 Email to A Watson re update letter to group 
members re outcome of appeal 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

 7.70  $3,919.00 
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.10 $79.00 

 Christian Raso $440.00 3.90 $1,716.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 1.80 $1,098.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 1.90 $1,026.00 

  7.70 $3,919.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $3,919.00 

 $3,919.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $4,310.90 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 29 June 2020     Due Date: 13 July 2020 
 

368368



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
29-06-2020 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 May 2020 to 31 May 2020 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $8,672.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $867.20 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $9,539.20 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
04-May-20 Drafting report for J White, special costs referee MYG 0.60 $540.00 $324.00 

14-May-20 Reviewing various materials re potential 
payments to third parties 

CAR 1.10 $440.00 $484.00 

16-May-20 Settling letter to group members re outcome of 
tax dispute 

ELM 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

19-May-20 Conference with E Mukherji and C Raso re 
approach to potential repayment to third parties 
following outcome of taxation dispute 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

19-May-20 Conference with E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
approach to potential repayment to third parties 
following outcome of taxation dispute 

CAR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

19-May-20 Reviewing various materials re potential payment 
to third parties 

CAR 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

19-May-20 Conference with M Greaves and C Raso re 
approach to potential repayment to third parties 
following outcome of taxation dispute 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

21-May-20 Reviewing email from D Wood re group member 
enquiry re outstanding tax judgement and replied 
re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

21-May-20 Conference with E Mukherji and C Raso re 
correspondence to group members re outcome of 
taxation dispute 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

21-May-20 Multiple emails to H Soley, D Wood and CA 
Project Support re preparation for mail out 
following judgement 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

21-May-20 Reviewing email from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re time frame for 
delivery of judgement 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

21-May-20 Conference with E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
correspondence to group members re outcome of 
taxation dispute 

CAR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

21-May-20 Conference with M Greaves and C Raso re 
correspondence to group members re outcome of 
taxation dispute 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

22-May-20 Preparation for bulk mail out to group members, 
including reviewing email from H Soley and 
replied re same 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

25-May-20 Telephone call to K Rowe re tax appeal decision 
to be handed down 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

26-May-20 Conference with E Mukherji and H Soley re 
preparation for handing down of decision and 
bulk update to group members 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

26-May-20 Preparation for bulk mail out to group members 
following court of appeal decision 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

26-May-20 Reviewing FCA and HCA rules re communication 
to group members re appeal period and email to 
E Mukherji re same 

CAR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

372372
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
26-May-20 Conference with M Greaves and H Soley re 

preparation for handing down of decision and 
bulk update to group members 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

26-May-20 Email to H Solely re preparation for outcome of 
tax appeal and group member update 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

26-May-20 Email to E O'Shea re outcome of tax appeal, bulk 
update to group members and managing group 
member enquiries and resourcing 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

26-May-20 Emails to and from A Watson and settlement 
administration team members re preparation for 
outcome of tax appeal, bulk update to group 
members and managing group member enquiries 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

26-May-20 Reviewing draft communication with group 
members, email to E O'Shea re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

27-May-20 Attending appeal judgment hearing MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

27-May-20 Reviewing reasons for judgement MYG 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

27-May-20 Multiple telephone conferences with T Ashenden 
re export of data for bulk group member mail out 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

27-May-20 Email to CA Project Support re preparation for 
bulk group member mail out 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-May-20 Conference with E Mukherji re group member 
bulk mail out 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-May-20 Preparation for bulk group member mail out, 
including finalising template letter to group 
members, multiple emails to and from CA Project 
Support re preparing data extracts, reviewing 
data extracts, and email to D Wood re reviewing 
data re same 

MYG 0.70 $540.00 $378.00 

27-May-20 Attending appeal judgment hearing and reviewing 
reasons for judgment 

CAR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

27-May-20 Drafting amendments to website text CAR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

27-May-20 Conference with M Greaves re group member 
bulk mail out 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

27-May-20 Considering Full Court decision re tax appeal ELM 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

27-May-20 Considering correspondence with P Murphy, 
updating Touchpoint telephone system, various 
emails re preparation for group member update 
and managing group member enquiries 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

27-May-20 Telephone call to K Rowe re outcome of tax 
appeal 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

27-May-20 Email to and from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re outcome of tax 
appeal and next steps 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

27-May-20 Email to H Solely and D Wood re outcome of tax 
appeal, next steps and group member enquiries 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

27-May-20 Attending appeal judgment hearing re tax 
dispute, telephone call with E Mukherji re 
judgment and next steps, perusing and 
considering judgment 

AJW 0.60 $790.00 $474.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
27-May-20 Perusing email from PricewaterhouseCoopers re 

approach to Australian Taxation Office re costs, 
drafting reply 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

28-May-20 Reviewing and amending website updates 
following tax appeal hearing and emails to and 
from C Raso re same 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

28-May-20 Conference with H Soley re reviewing data export 
for group members bulk mail out against updates 
to admin portal 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

28-May-20 Various attendances re preparing group 
members bulk mail out, including multiple emails 
to and from CA Project Support, reviewing 
dataset against details in matter centre, emails to 
and from D Wood and H Soley re reviewing 
contact details, and reviewing finalised dataset 
for mail out 

MYG 1.60 $540.00 $864.00 

28-May-20 Sending letters to insurers re outcome of tax 
dispute 

CAR 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

28-May-20 Email to marketing re settling amendments to 
web pages 

CAR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

28-May-20 Email to Y Iqbal re hard copy group member bulk 
mail out 

CAR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

29-May-20 Various attendances re email group member bulk 
mail out, including multiple emails to and from CA 
Project Support and reviewing various samples 

MYG 0.60 $540.00 $324.00 

29-May-20 Various attendances re hard copy group member 
bulk mail out, including multiple emails to and 
from Y Iqbal and reviewing various samples 

MYG 0.70 $540.00 $378.00 

29-May-20 Telephone conference with A Watson and E 
Mukherji, S Rooke and S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re consideration of 
application for special leave following judgment 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

29-May-20 Telephone conference with A Watson and M 
Greaves, S Rooke and S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re consideration of 
application for special leave following judgment 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

29-May-20 Running mail merge of Word versions of group 
members hard copy bulk mail out to generate 
PDFs for printing 

YAI 1.10 $240.00 $264.00 

29-May-20 Telephone conference with E Mukherji and M 
Greaves, S Rooke and S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re consideration of 
application for special leave following judgment 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

 16.40  $8,672.00 

374374



 

Page 7 of 8 

 

Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 1.10 $869.00 

 Christian Raso $440.00 3.60 $1,584.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 3.30 $2,013.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 7.30 $3,942.00 

 Yaseen Iqbal $240.00 1.10 $264.00 

  16.40 $8,672.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $8,672.00 

 $8,672.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $9,539.20 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 29 June 2020     Due Date: 13 July 2020 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
21-07-2020 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 June 2020 to 30 June 2020 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $6,813.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $681.30 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $7,494.30 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Jun-20 Email to D Wood re update following bulk mail 

out 
MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

01-Jun-20 Email to H Soley re preparing letter to group 
members with failed email mail out 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

01-Jun-20 Considering email from M Greaves re update on 
bulk mail out 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

02-Jun-20 Reviewing email from D Wood re feedback 
following bulk mail out 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

02-Jun-20 Telephone conference with A Watson, E 
Mukherji, D Bloom QC, D McInerney, S Rooke 
and S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
consideration of application for special leave 
following judgment 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

02-Jun-20 Telephone conference with A Watson, M 
Greaves, D Bloom QC, D McInerney, S Rooke 
and S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
consideration of application for special leave 
following judgment 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

02-Jun-20 Telephone conference with E Mukherji, M 
Greaves, D Bloom QC, D McInerney, S Rooke 
and S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
consideration of application for special leave 
following judgment 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

04-Jun-20 Conference with E Mukherji re analysis of factors 
to consider following appeal judgement 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

04-Jun-20 Email to E Mukherji re provision of material for 
analysis 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

04-Jun-20 Telephone conference with S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re costs 

ELM 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

04-Jun-20 Conference with M Greaves re analysis of factors 
to consider following appeal judgement 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

04-Jun-20 Telephone conference with A Watson re balance 
of settlement funds and special leave application 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

04-Jun-20 Telephone conference with E Mukherji re balance 
of settlement funds and special leave application 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

05-Jun-20 Reviewing email from A Watson re consideration 
of lodging special leave application and email to 
S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

05-Jun-20 Telephone call from S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re enquiry re tax and 
email to A Watson re same 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

05-Jun-20 Perusing memorandum re costs and available 
funds for taxation, email to E Mukherji re same, 
perusing and considering email from M Greaves 
re same 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

05-Jun-20 Perusing email from M Greaves re potential 
interest and penalties on outstanding tax 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

07-Jun-20 Considering issues of interest and penalties on 
tax debt, calculations prepared by J Peck and 
email to A Watson and M Greaves re same 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
08-Jun-20 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 

calculation of penalties and interest 
ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

08-Jun-20 Reviewing email from E Mukherji re tax query MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

09-Jun-20 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
calculation of penalties and interest 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

11-Jun-20 Telephone conference with S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re calculation of 
penalties and interest 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

11-Jun-20 Email to A Watson re update on advice from 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re calculation of 
penalties and interest 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

12-Jun-20 Conference with C Zheng, Finance re 
management of settlement accounts 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Jun-20 Perusing calculations re interest owing on tax, 
email from E Mukherji re same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

14-Jun-20 Email to S Rooke, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
instructions re special leave application 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

15-Jun-20 Reviewing emails from E Mukherji and S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re preparing special 
leave to appeal application 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

15-Jun-20 Telephone conference with E Mukherji re special 
leave to appeal and confirmation of instructions 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re consideration of 
application for special leave following judgment re 
same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

15-Jun-20 Considering interest calculations and note 
prepared by PricewaterhouseCoopers 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

15-Jun-20 Email to S Rooke, PricewaterhouseCoopers 
confirming instructions to issue application for 
special leave 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

15-Jun-20 Telephone conference with A Watson re special 
leave to appeal and confirmation of instructions 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re consideration of 
application for special leave following judgment re 
same 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

19-Jun-20 Telephone conference with E Mukherji and D 
McInerney, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
preparation of affidavit re public interest 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

19-Jun-20 Telephone conference with A Watson and D 
McInerney, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
preparation of affidavit re public interest 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

20-Jun-20 Considering settlement administration historical 
data and email to S Reed and S Rooke, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re preparation of 
affidavit for special leave application 

ELM 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

22-Jun-20 Reviewing emails from E Mukherji re information 
required to prepare for application for special 
leave 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

22-Jun-20 Perusing and considering email from 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re cost of High Court 
application, drafting reply 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

381381
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
22-Jun-20 Perusing submissions re special leave, email to 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 
AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

22-Jun-20 Email to S Feng re preparation of settlement 
administration data for special leave application 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

22-Jun-20 Telephone conference with S Rooke and S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re special leave 
application and costs estimate 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

22-Jun-20 Email to A Watson re advice from 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re estimated costs of 
special leave application 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

23-Jun-20 Considering draft special leave application ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

23-Jun-20 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
special leave application and affidavit in support 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

23-Jun-20 Telephone conference with A Watson re affidavit 
in support of application for special leave 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

23-Jun-20 Conference with A Watson and D McInerney, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re preparation of 
special leave application and affidavit in support 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

23-Jun-20 Telephone conference with E Mukherji re affidavit 
in support of application for special leave 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

23-Jun-20 Conference with E Mukherji, and D McInerney, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re preparation of 
special leave application and affidavit in support 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

23-Jun-20 Settling affidavit re special leave application AJW 0.40 $790.00 $316.00 

23-Jun-20 Perusing email from E Mukherji re special leave 
application 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

24-Jun-20 Various attendances re finalising affidavit for 
special leave application, including multiple 
emails to and from A Watson and E O'Shea re 
same and multiple emails to and from M Wyles, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

MYG 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

24-Jun-20 Reviewing emails from D McInerney, S Reed and 
M Wyles, PricewaterhouseCoopers re special 
leave application 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

24-Jun-20 Telephone call from M Wyles, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re filing affidavit for 
special leave application 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

24-Jun-20 Email to and from H Soley re material filed re 
special leave application 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

24-Jun-20 Email to A Watson and E Mukherji re special 
leave application and time frame for update to 
group members 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

24-Jun-20 Perusing final version of affidavit, attendance at 
swearing of same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

25-Jun-20 Telephone call to K Rowe re update on tax 
appeal 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

29-Jun-20 Conference with H Soley re obtaining updated 
contact details from return to sender group 
members 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

382382
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 

 10.50  $6,813.00 

383383
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 3.20 $2,528.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 4.90 $2,989.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 2.40 $1,296.00 

  10.50 $6,813.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $6,813.00 

 $6,813.00 

384384
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $7,494.30 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 21 July 2020     Due Date: 04 August 2020 
 

385385



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
28-08-2020 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 July 2020 to 31 July 2020 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,589.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $88,734.97 AUD 

Total GST Applied $8,864.15 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $99,188.12 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
16-Jul-20 Perusing and considering Australian Taxation 

Office submissions re special leave application 
AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00 

16-Jul-20 Considering invoice from PricewaterhouseCooper 
and instructions to H Solely re same 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

16-Jul-20 Considering Australian Tax Office response to 
special leave application 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

21-Jul-20 Conference with E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
special leave application, group member update 
and preparation for costs approval 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

21-Jul-20 Conference with A Watson and E Mukherji re 
special leave application, group member update 
and preparation for costs approval 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

21-Jul-20 Reviewing Commissioner's response to special 
leave application and Applicant's reply, emails 
from S Rooke, PricewaterhouseCoopers and A 
Watson re same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

21-Jul-20 Conference with A Watson and M Greaves re 
special leave application, group member update 
and preparation for costs approval 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

21-Jul-20 Perusing draft reply submissions re special leave 
application, drafting email to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

22-Jul-20 Reviewing email from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re draft reply to the 
Commissioner's response re special leave 
application 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

29-Jul-20 Reviewing and amending memorandum for J 
White, costs referee and emails to H Soley re 
same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

31-Jul-20 Drafting update letter to group members and 
email to E Mukherji to settle re same 

MYG 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

31-Jul-20 Reviewing email from E Mukherji re appeal book MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

 2.60  $1,589.00 

389389



 

Page 5 of 7 

 

Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.60 $474.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.50 $305.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 1.50 $810.00 

  2.60 $1,589.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,589.00 

 $1,589.00 

390390
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
29-May-2020 Law Image Service (MELB) Pty Ltd - Photocopying Charges - Invoice 

M0066274 
$489.80 

30-Jun-2020 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Expert Fees - Invoice 40066633 $23,970.50 

31-Jul-2020 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Expert Fees - Invoice 40076131 $62,592.17 

 $87,052.47 

 
Disbursements Not Subject to GST 
30-Jun-2020 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Expert Fees - Invoice 40066633 (GST Free) $1,682.50 

 $1,682.50 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $87,052.47 

 Disbursements Not Subject to GST $1,682.50 

 $88,734.97 

391391
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $99,188.12 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 28 August 2020     Due Date: 11 September 2020 
 

392392



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
08-09-2020 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 August 2020 to 31 August 2020 

onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $3,760.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $376.00 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $4,136.00 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
04-Aug-20 Settling update to group members ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

05-Aug-20 Reviewing and amending draft update letter to 
group members and email to A Watson to settle 
re same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

05-Aug-20 Settling group member update re special leave 
application 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

06-Aug-20 Conference with E Mukherji re draft update letter 
to group members 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

06-Aug-20 Conference with M Greaves re draft update letter 
to group members 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

07-Aug-20 Email to A Watson re draft update letter to group 
members 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

07-Aug-20 Various attendances re bulk mail out to group 
members including emails to and from A Watson, 
settling letter, email to Y Iqbal re hard copy mail 
out and email to CA Project Support re email mail 
out and mail out list 

MYG 0.50 $540.00 $270.00 

07-Aug-20 Perusing email from M Greaves re group member 
update and replied re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

10-Aug-20 Conference with E Mukherji re appeal claim book MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

10-Aug-20 Reviewing email from Y Iqbal re hard copy mail 
out to group members and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

10-Aug-20 Email to and from J White, special costs referee 
re update on report 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

10-Aug-20 Conference with T Ashenden re mail out list MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

10-Aug-20 Conference with M Greaves re appeal claim book ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

10-Aug-20 Telephone conference with S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re preparation and 
lodgement of appeal book, email to A Watson 
and S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

10-Aug-20 Perusing application book and email to 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re same, email to E 
Mukherji re same 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

12-Aug-20 Conference with H Soley re bulk mail out to group 
members 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

12-Aug-20 Reviewing filed application book for appeal to 
High Court 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

13-Aug-20 Emails to and from H Soley re uncontactable 
group members in preparation for mail out 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

24-Aug-20 Reviewing email from H Soley re updated data 
for mail out and email to CA Project Support to 
prepare mailing lists for bulk mail out 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

25-Aug-20 Conference with H Soley re preparation for bulk 
mail out 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

25-Aug-20 Reviewing and cross-checking mail out lists and 
emails to and from H Soley and CA Project 
Support re same 

MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

396396
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
26-Aug-20 Various attendances re bulk mail out to group 

members including reviewing and settling mail 
lists, multiple emails to and from CA Project 
Support re preparing email mail out, reviewing 
email samples and providing feedback, approving 
final email mail out, running mail merge for postal 
mail out, emails to and from H Soley and email to 
Y Iqbal re same 

MYG 2.40 $540.00 $1,296.00 

26-Aug-20 Telephone conference with T Ashenden re email 
mail out 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

26-Aug-20 Email to Finance re management of settlement 
account 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

26-Aug-20 Email to H Soley re completed mail out MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

26-Aug-20 Reviewing email from H Soley re bounce backs 
following bulk mail out to group members and 
replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

27-Aug-20 Drafting updates to touchpoint and website and 
email to E Mukherji to settle same 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

27-Aug-20 Email to H Soley re implementing approved 
updates to touchpoint and website 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

31-Aug-20 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
additional appeal costs 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

 6.70  $3,760.00 

397397
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.40 $316.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.60 $366.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 5.70 $3,078.00 

  6.70 $3,760.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $3,760.00 

 $3,760.00 

398398
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $4,136.00 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 08 September 2020     Due Date: 22 September 2020 
 

399399



 

Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited  

ABN 21 105 657 949 

Level 21 

380 La Trobe Street 

Melbourne VIC 3000 
 

PO Box 523 

Melbourne VIC 3001 
 

DX 466 Melbourne 
 

T (03) 9605 2700 

F (03) 9258 9600 

 

 

 

Maurice Blackburn  Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 

www.mauriceblackburn.com.au  

Matter Ref 3052534 

Tax Invoice  

Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000    

13-10-2020 

TO:  

RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 

Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 September 
2020 to 30 September 2020 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and 
Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or administration 
of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria 
in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by 
orders of 27 May 2015. 

SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

Total Professional Fees  $884.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $476.90 

$136.09 Total GST Applied 

AUD 

AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $1,496.99 

With Compliments 
 
 
 
 

MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

AUD 

400400
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Professional Fees 
 

Amount Oper Units Date Rate Details 

$54.00 $540.00 Reviewing and approving updates to website  0.10 MYG 1-Sep-20 

$122.00 $610.00 Considering draft BAS and email to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

 0.20 ELM 4-Sep-20 

$54.00 $540.00 Reviewing account reconciliation  0.10 MYG 8-Sep-20 

$54.00 $540.00 Email to T Thatcher re extract for filenote re 
administration costs 

 0.10 MYG 9-Sep-20 

$54.00 $540.00 Reviewing email from H Soley re bouncebacks 
spreadsheet, reviewing spreadsheet and replied re same 

 0.10 MYG 10-Sep-20 

$54.00 $540.00 Email to and from Finance re management of settlement 
accounts 

 0.10 MYG 15-Sep-20 

$79.00 $790.00 Approving transfer of term deposit funds  0.10 AJW 17-Sep-20 

$108.00 $540.00 Management of settlement accounts, including reviewing 
controlled money forms and emails to and from A Watson 
re approval of term deposit transfers and email to 
Finance re same 

 0.20 MYG 17-Sep-20 

$183.00 $610.00 Considering draft BAS and email to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

 0.30 ELM 21-Sep-20 

$122.00 $610.00 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
preparation and lodgement of BAS 

 0.20 ELM 22-Sep-20 

 1.50 $884.00 

Page 4 of 7 
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 Professional Fees Summary 
 

Amount Units Rate 

$79.00  0.10 $790.00 Andrew Watson 

$427.00  0.70 $610.00 Elizabeth Mukherji 

$378.00  0.70 $540.00 Megan Greaves 

 1.50 $884.00 

 1.50 $884.00 

Professional Fees - Events Code Summary 
 

Amount Units 

Professional Fees Summary 

Professional Fees Subject to GST $884.00 

$884.00 

Page 5 of 7 
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 Disbursements 
 

Amount Date Details 

Sundries 

Disbursements Subject to GST 

02-Oct-2020 Law Image Service (MELB) Pty Ltd - Group Member bulk mailout - 
Invoice M0067080 

$476.90 

$476.90 Sundries 

Disbursement Summary 

$476.90 Disbursements Subject to GST 

$476.90 

Page 6 of 7 
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Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as 
Remittance Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client 
Ref is quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices 
included in payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone:  (For Invoices up to $10,000 only) 
Please call 03 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 

TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 

Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due:$1,496.99 AUD 
 

Invoice Date: 13-October-2020 

---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

 (For Invoices up to $10,000 only) 

Page 7 of 7 
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Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12-11-2020 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period of 1 October 2020 to 31 October 

2020 onwards by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $3,873.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $387.30 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $4,260.30 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
09-Oct-20 Reviewing email from S Reed, 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re special leave 
application update 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

10-Oct-20 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
handing down of High Court's decision 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

14-Oct-20 Reviewing email from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re High Court dismissal 
of special leave application and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

15-Oct-20 Reviewing and amending confidential note to J 
White, costs referee 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

19-Oct-20 Telephone conference with E Mukherji, S Rooke 
and S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
dismissal of special leave application and next 
steps 

MYG 0.40 $540.00 $216.00 

19-Oct-20 Reviewing and amending confidential note to J 
White, costs referee 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

19-Oct-20 Telephone conference with M Greaves, S Rooke 
and S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
dismissal of special leave application and next 
steps 

ELM 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

27-Oct-20 Telephone conference with E Mukherji re next 
steps following dismissal of special leave 
application 

MYG 0.30 $540.00 $162.00 

27-Oct-20 Telephone conference with M Greaves re next 
steps following dismissal of special leave 
application 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

29-Oct-20 Conference with A Watson and E Mukherji re 
preparation for bulk mail out to group members re 
dismissal of special leave application 

MYG 0.20 $540.00 $108.00 

29-Oct-20 Preparation for bulk mail out following dismissal 
of special leave application, including reviewing 
and amending draft letter, finalising letter, 
multiple emails to and from H Soley re contacting 
group members re updated contact details, 
emails to and from CA Project Support re 
preparing for bulk email and emails to and from Y 
Iqbal re preparing for bulk postal mail out 

MYG 1.00 $540.00 $540.00 

29-Oct-20 Conference with E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
preparation for bulk mail out to group members re 
dismissal of special leave application 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

29-Oct-20 Settling group member update re outcome of 
special leave application 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

29-Oct-20 Conference with A Watson and E Mukherji re 
preparation for bulk mail out to group members re 
dismissal of special leave application 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

29-Oct-20 Drafting update letter to group members re 
outcome of special leave application 

ELM 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

29-Oct-20 Email to A Watson re bulk update to group 
members re outcome of special leave application 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

410410
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
29-Oct-20 Telephone call to K Rowe re outcome of special 

leave application and next steps and file note re 
same 

ELM 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

30-Oct-20 Various attendances re bulk mail out to group 
members including emails to and from CA Project 
Support re preparing mailout lists and sending 
bulk update, undertaking review of mail out lists, 
multiple emails to and from H Soley re 
preparation for bulk mail out, reviewing and 
amending sample emails, preparing mail merge 
for hard copy mail out and emails to and from Y 
Iqbal re same, amending touchpoint script, 
amending website text, and email to reception re 
management of enquiries 

MYG 1.80 $540.00 $972.00 

30-Oct-20 Reviewing email from H Soley re group member 
enquiry and email to H Soley and E Mukherji re 
same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

30-Oct-20 Conference with H Soley re group member 
response from bulk update to group members re 
dismissal of special leave application 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

 6.80  $3,873.00 

411411
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.30 $237.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 1.80 $1,098.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 4.70 $2,538.00 

  6.80 $3,873.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $3,873.00 

 $3,873.00 

412412
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $4,260.30 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 12 November 2020     Due Date: 26 November 2020 
 

413413



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
10-12-2020 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 November 2020 to 30 November 

2020 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,002.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $6,409.23 AUD 

Total GST Applied $741.12 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $8,152.35 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

414414
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415415
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
02-Nov-20 Considering tax and GST issues and email to S 

Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 
ELM 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

04-Nov-20 Considering group member responses to update 
letter and replied re same 

ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

11-Nov-20 Email to Supreme Court re update ELM 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

20-Nov-20 Telephone conference with insurer client, emails 
to insurer client attaching updates 

CAR 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

24-Nov-20 Reviewing emails from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers and E Mukherji re GST 
application and email to E Mukherji re same 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

25-Nov-20 Email to J White, special referee, re update on 
matter and next steps re court application 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

25-Nov-20 Reviewing email from H Soley re group member 
enquiry 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

26-Nov-20 Email to A Watson re update to Supreme Court ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

27-Nov-20 Reviewing letter from group member MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

 1.80  $1,002.00 

417417
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Christian Raso $440.00 0.40 $176.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 1.00 $610.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.40 $216.00 

  1.80 $1,002.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,002.00 

 $1,002.00 

418418
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
11-Nov-2020 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Expert Fees to 30.08.2020 re special leave 

application - Invoice 40109570 (50% only) 
$5,858.83 

12-Nov-2020 Law Image Service (MELB) Pty Ltd - mailout to group members 
30.10.2020 re dismissal of special leave application - Invoice M0067802 

$550.40 

 $6,409.23 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $6,409.23 

 $6,409.23 

419419
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $8,152.35 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 10 December 2020     Due Date: 24 December 2020 
 

420420



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
08-01-2021 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 December 2020 to 31 December 

2020 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $237.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $23.70 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $260.70 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

421421
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Dec-20 Reviewing emails from E Mukherji and N Callen, 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re preparation of tax 
returns 

MYG 0.10 $540.00 $54.00 

01-Dec-20 Email to PricewaterhouseCoopers re preparation 
of outstanding tax returns 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

01-Dec-20 Email to Supreme Court class actions list re 
update on administration and next steps 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

07-Dec-20 Email to PricewaterhouseCoopers re update on 
GST 

ELM 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

 0.40  $237.00 

424424
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $610.00 0.30 $183.00 

 Megan Greaves $540.00 0.10 $54.00 

  0.40 $237.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $237.00 

 $237.00 

425425
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $260.70 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 08 January 2021     Due Date: 22 January 2021 
 

426426



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12-05-2021 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 January 2021 to 31 January 2021 

by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $122.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $12.20 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $134.20 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
20-Jan-21 Emails to and from Finance re management of 

settlement funds and reviewing account 
reconciliation re same 

MYG 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

 0.20  $122.00 

430430
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Megan Greaves $610.00 0.20 $122.00 

  0.20 $122.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $122.00 

 $122.00 

431431
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $134.20 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 12 May 2021     Due Date: 26 May 2021 
 

432432



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12-05-2021 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 February 2021 to 28 February 2021 

by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,258.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $125.80 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $1,383.80 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

433433
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
15-Feb-21 Email to H Soley re preparation of brief to costs 

assessor 
MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

17-Feb-21 Conference, M Greaves and H Soley re preparing 
updated filenote for costs assessor and email to 
T Thatcher re extract request re same 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

17-Feb-21 Reviewing correspondence re GST and email to 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re outstanding costs 

ELM 0.20 $720.00 $144.00 

18-Feb-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re next 
steps re GST application 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

18-Feb-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re next 
steps re GST application 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00 

19-Feb-21 Reviewing email from N Callen, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re progress of 
deductibility of costs 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

19-Feb-21 Reviewing email from N Callen, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re status of preparation 
and lodgement of income tax returns 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00 

23-Feb-21 Conference, E Mukherji, M Greaves and S Reed 
and N Callen, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
resolution of tax issues and next steps 

MYG 0.50 $610.00 $305.00 

23-Feb-21 Conference, E Mukherji, M Greaves and S Reed 
and N Callen, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
resolution of tax issues and next steps 

ELM 0.50 $720.00 $360.00 

26-Feb-21 Reviewing email from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re update on income 
tax and GST and replied re same 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

 1.90  $1,258.00 

436436



 

Page 5 of 6 

 

Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 0.90 $648.00 

 Megan Greaves $610.00 1.00 $610.00 

  1.90 $1,258.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,258.00 

 $1,258.00 

437437
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $1,383.80 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 12 May 2021     Due Date: 26 May 2021 
 

438438



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12-05-2021 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 March 2021 to 31 March 2021 by 

the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,951.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $195.10 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $2,146.10 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
03-Mar-21 Reviewing email from N Callen, 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re request for 
information re income tax returns and replied re 
same 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

16-Mar-21 Conference, A Watson, E Mukherji and M 
Greaves re update on finalisation of taxation 
issues and next steps 

MYG 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

16-Mar-21 Reviewing email from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers and previous 
correspondence re progress of resolution of 
taxation issues 

MYG 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

16-Mar-21 Conference, A Watson, E Mukherji and M 
Greaves re update on finalisation of taxation 
issues and next steps 

AJW 0.40 $790.00 $316.00 

16-Mar-21 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
submissions to ATO on GST 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00 

16-Mar-21 Conference, A Watson, E Mukherji and M 
Greaves re update on finalisation of taxation 
issues and next steps 

ELM 0.40 $720.00 $288.00 

17-Mar-21 Email to N Callen, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
lodgement of tax returns 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

23-Mar-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves, with S 
Rooke, S Reed and N Callen, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re lodgement of tax 
returns and GST issue 

MYG 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

23-Mar-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves, with S 
Rooke, S Reed and N Callen, 
PriceewaterhouseCoopers re lodgement of tax 
returns and GST issue 

ELM 0.30 $720.00 $216.00 

24-Mar-21 Preparation of further costs and disbursement 
information for PricewaterhouseCoopers and 
email same to S Reed 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00 

26-Mar-21 Reviewing email from S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re draft submissions re 
GST issue, reviewing submissions and email to A 
Watson re next steps 

MYG 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

26-Mar-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re draft 
submissions re GST 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

26-Mar-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re draft 
submissions re GST 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00 

 2.90  $1,951.00 

442442
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.40 $316.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 1.00 $720.00 

 Megan Greaves $610.00 1.50 $915.00 

  2.90 $1,951.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,951.00 

 $1,951.00 

443443
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $2,146.10 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 12 May 2021     Due Date: 26 May 2021 
 

444444



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12-05-2021 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 April 2021 to 30 April 2021 by the 

Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,118.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $111.80 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $1,229.80 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
01-Apr-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves with S 

Rooke and S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
update on tax returns and next steps 

MYG 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

01-Apr-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves with S 
Rooke and S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
update on tax returns and next steps 

ELM 0.40 $720.00 $288.00 

01-Apr-21 Telephone conference, A Watson and E Mukherji 
re update on tax position 

ELM 0.20 $720.00 $144.00 

01-Apr-21 Telephone conference, A Watson and E Mukherji 
re update on tax position 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

01-Apr-21 Email to S Rooke, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
instructions on next steps for tax matters 

ELM 0.20 $720.00 $144.00 

07-Apr-21 Emails from and to A Watson re draft GST 
submissions to ATO and email to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

07-Apr-21 Perusing submission re GST AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

 1.60  $1,118.00 

448448
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.30 $237.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 0.80 $576.00 

 Megan Greaves $610.00 0.50 $305.00 

  1.60 $1,118.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,118.00 

 $1,118.00 

449449
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $1,229.80 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 12 May 2021     Due Date: 26 May 2021 
 

450450



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-07-2022 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 May 2021 to 31 May 2021 by the 

Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $3,898.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $4,575.72 AUD 

Total GST Applied $847.37 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $9,321.09 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

451451
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452452
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453453
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
07-May-21 Reviewing and amending filenote for J White, 

costs referee 
MYG 0.70 $610.00 $427.00

11-May-21 Conference, M Greaves and H Soley re filenote 
for J White, costs assessor 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00

13-May-21 Emails to and from H Soley and CA Costs re data 
extract 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00

17-May-21 Reviewing costs extract and filenote to J White, 
costs assessor, and email from M Greaves re 
next steps 

SIR 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

17-May-21 Reviewing costs extract and filenote to J White, 
costs assessor, and email to S Robinson re next 
steps re same 

MYG 0.30 $610.00 $183.00

18-May-21 Conference, M Greaves and S Robinson re 
confidential filenote to J White, costs assessor, 
and next steps re same 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00

18-May-21 Conference, M Greaves and S Robinson re 
confidential filenote to J White, costs assessor, 
and next steps re same 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

18-May-21 Reviewing costs extract and filenote to J White, 
costs assessor, and email from M Greaves re 
next steps 

SIR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

19-May-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re tax 
returns 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00

19-May-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re tax 
returns 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

19-May-21 Telephone conference E Mukherji and S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re progress of tax 
negotiations with the ATO 

ELM 0.40 $720.00 $288.00

26-May-21 Reviewing costs extract and drafting filenote to J 
White, costs assessor 

SIR 2.10 $440.00 $924.00

27-May-21 Reviewing costs extract and drafting filenote to J 
White, costs assessor 

SIR 1.90 $440.00 $836.00

28-May-21 Reviewing costs extract and drafting filenote to J 
White, costs assessor 

SIR 0.90 $440.00 $396.00

 8.00  $3,898.00

454454
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 0.50 $360.00

 Megan Greaves $610.00 1.40 $854.00

 Sharni Robinson $440.00 6.10 $2,684.00

  8.00 $3,898.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $3,898.00

 $3,898.00

455455



 

Page 6 of 7 

 

Disbursements 

Date Details Amount

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
31-Mar-2021 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Expert Fees - Invoice 4102555 (1 of 2) $4,575.72

 $4,575.72

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $4,575.72

 $4,575.72

456456
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $9,321.09 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 July 2022     Due Date: 25 July 2022 
 

457457



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-07-2022 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 June 2021 to 30 June 2021 by the 

Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders of 27 May 2015 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,004.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $100.40 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $1,104.40 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

458458
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459459
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
02-Jun-21 Reviewing updated advice and correspondence 

from PricewaterhouseCoopers and reviewing 
updated GIC submissions and email to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

ELM 0.60 $720.00 $432.00

04-Jun-21 Drafting filenote to J White, costs assessor SIR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

08-Jun-21 Reviewing Summary of Tax payable and 
preparing table of comparison with 
PricewaterhouseCoopers estimates 

SIR 1.10 $440.00 $484.00

 1.90  $1,004.00

461461
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 0.60 $432.00

 Sharni Robinson $440.00 1.30 $572.00

  1.90 $1,004.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,004.00

 $1,004.00

462462
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $1,104.40 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 July 2022     Due Date: 25 July 2022 
 

463463



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-07-2022 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 July 2021 to 31 July 2021 by the 

Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $561.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $56.10 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $617.10 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

464464
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465465
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
05-Jul-21 Conference, M Greaves and S Reed and A 

Antonopoulos, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
enquiry from Australian Taxation Office re 
submissions 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00

13-Jul-21 Reviewing email correspondence from 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re March 2021 BAS, 
reviewing BAS and replied re same 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

19-Jul-21 Email to A Watson re update to Supreme Court 
on status of matter 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

20-Jul-21 Drafting email to Supreme Court re update on 
status of tax matters and timing for final orders 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

22-Jul-21 Perusing email from Court and settling proposed 
response 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00

22-Jul-21 Email to H Soley re response to Supreme Court 
re update 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

29-Jul-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
preparation for briefing costs assessor 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00

29-Jul-21 Conference, E Mukherji and M Greaves re 
preparation for briefing costs assessor 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

 0.80  $561.00

467467
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.10 $79.00

 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 0.50 $360.00

 Megan Greaves $610.00 0.20 $122.00

  0.80 $561.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $561.00

 $561.00

468468
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $617.10 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 July 2022     Due Date: 25 July 2022 
 

469469



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-07-2022 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 August 2021 to 31 August 2021 by 

the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Matthews v Ausnet Electricity Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2009 04788) by Orders of 23 
December 2014. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $655.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $65.50 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $720.50 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

470470
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471471
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472472



 

Page 4 of 6 

 

 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
15-Aug-21 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 

update from the Australian Taxation Office 
ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00 

17-Aug-21 Telephone conference with S Rooke and S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re ongoing discussions 
with the Australian Taxation Office 

ELM 0.20 $720.00 $144.00 

17-Aug-21 Preparing filenote from conference with 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re update from 
discussions with the Australian Taxation Office 
and next steps 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00 

24-Aug-21 Reviewing email from PricewaterhouseCoopers 
re communications with the Australian Taxation 
Office, note and recommended next steps and 
replied re same 

ELM 0.20 $720.00 $144.00 

26-Aug-21 Conference, A Watson and E Mukherji re ongoing 
negotiations with the Australian Taxation Office re 
tax, interest and next steps 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

26-Aug-21 Conference, A Watson and E Mukherji re ongoing 
negotiations with the Australian Taxation Office re 
tax, interest and next steps 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00 

26-Aug-21 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
instructions and next steps 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00 

 0.90  $655.00 

473473
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.10 $79.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 0.80 $576.00 

  0.90 $655.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $655.00 

 $655.00 

474474
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $720.50 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 July 2022     Due Date: 25 July 2022 
 

475475



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-07-2022 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 September 2021 to 30 September 

2021 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $288.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $28.80 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $316.80 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

476476
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477477
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
06-Sep-21 Telephone call to S Reed, 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re update re status of 
ongoing negotiations with the Australian, email to 
S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re same 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

27-Sep-21 Reviewing email from PricewaterhouseCoopers 
re update re tax, reviewing details of scheme tax 
returns and replied re same 

ELM 0.20 $720.00 $144.00

28-Sep-21 Reviewing email from PricewaterhouseCoopers 
re update re tax and email to A Watson re same 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

 0.40  $288.00

479479
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 0.40 $288.00

  0.40 $288.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $288.00

 $288.00

480480
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $316.80 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 July 2022     Due Date: 25 July 2022 
 

481481



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-07-2022 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 21, 380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 October 2021 to 31 October 2021 

by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $576.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $57.60 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $633.60 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

482482
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483483
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484484
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
06-Oct-21 Telephone call to S Reed, 

PricewaterhouseCoopers re update on tax and 
GST 

ELM 0.30 $720.00 $216.00

13-Oct-21 Considering email from PricewaterhouseCoopers 
and replied re same confirming instructions for 
preparation of BAS 

ELM 0.20 $720.00 $144.00

28-Oct-21 Telephone conference to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re outcome of GST 
submission and next steps 

ELM 0.30 $720.00 $216.00

 0.80  $576.00

485485
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 0.80 $576.00

  0.80 $576.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $576.00

 $576.00

486486
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $633.60 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 July 2022     Due Date: 25 July 2022 
 

487487



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-07-2022 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 10, 456 Lonsdale Street 
MELBOURNE VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 November 2021 to 30 November 

2021 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $144.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $22,500.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $2,264.40 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $24,908.40 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 

 

488488
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Page 3 of 7 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
17-Nov-21 Email to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 

update 
ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

29-Nov-21 Telephone call to J White and email to A Watson ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

 0.20  $144.00

491491
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 0.20 $144.00

  0.20 $144.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $144.00

 $144.00

492492
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
30-Nov-2021 PricewaterhouseCoopers - Consulting Fees - PriceWaterhouseCoopers 

- Invoice 41107995 (50%split) 
$22,500.00

 $22,500.00

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $22,500.00

 $22,500.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $24,908.40 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 July 2022     Due Date: 25 July 2022 
 

494494



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-07-2022 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 10, 456 Lonsdale Street 
MELBOURNE VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 December 2021 to 31 December 

2021 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $2,277.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $227.70 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $2,504.70 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
04-Dec-21 Email to A Watson re update on GST and tax ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00

07-Dec-21 Conference, E Mukherji and S Robinson re 
finalisation of outstanding tax issues, costs 
extract and note to J White, costs assessor, and 
next steps re same 

SIR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

07-Dec-21 Reviewing materials re preparation of costs 
extract and note to J White, costs assessor 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

07-Dec-21 Conference, E Mukherji and S Robinson re 
finalisation of outstanding tax issues, costs 
extract and note to J White, costs assessor, and 
next steps re same 

ELM 0.20 $720.00 $144.00

07-Dec-21 Considering outstanding costs in preparation for 
final report 

ELM 0.20 $720.00 $144.00

14-Dec-21 Reviewing costs extract and drafting note to J 
White, Costs Assessor 

SIR 0.80 $440.00 $352.00

15-Dec-21 Reviewing costs extract and note to J White, 
costs assessor 

SIR 0.70 $440.00 $308.00

15-Dec-21 Reviewing settlement scheme re process for 
finalisation of matter and residual funds and 
emails to/from E Mukherji re same 

SIR 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

15-Dec-21 Conference, A Watson, E Mukherji and S 
Robinson re conclusion of administration and 
remaining funds and next steps re preparation of 
report to court on same 

SIR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

15-Dec-21 Conference, E Mukherji and S Robinson re 
conclusion of administration and remaining funds 
and preparation of brief to costs assessor and 
preparation of report to court on same 

SIR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

15-Dec-21 Conference, A Watson, E Mukherji and S 
Robinson re conclusion of administration and 
remaining funds and next steps re preparation of 
report to court on same 

AJW 0.30 $790.00 $237.00

15-Dec-21 Conference, A Watson, E Mukherji and S 
Robinson re conclusion of administration and 
remaining funds and next steps re preparation of 
report to court on same 

ELM 0.30 $720.00 $216.00

15-Dec-21 Conference, E Mukherji and S Robinson re 
conclusion of administration and remaining funds 
and preparation of brief to costs assessor and 
preparation of report to court on same 

ELM 0.20 $720.00 $144.00

20-Dec-21 Reviewing email and documents from E Mukherji 
re handover of outstanding tasks and priorities 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

 4.30  $2,277.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.30 $237.00

 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 1.00 $720.00

 Sharni Robinson $440.00 3.00 $1,320.00

  4.30 $2,277.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $2,277.00

 $2,277.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $2,504.70 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 July 2022     Due Date: 25 July 2022 
 

500500



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-07-2022 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 10, 456 Lonsdale Street 
MELBOURNE VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 January 2022 to 31 January 2022 

by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $1,249.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $124.90 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $1,373.90 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
14-Jan-22 Multiple emails to/from H Soley re group member 

enquiry 
MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00

28-Jan-22 Drafting costs extract and note to J White, costs 
assessor 

SIR 1.70 $440.00 $748.00

31-Jan-22 Preparing brief for J White, costs assessor and 
emails to/from H Soley re same 

SIR 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

31-Jan-22 Reviewing costs extract and drafting note to J 
White, costs assessor and email to M Greaves re 
next steps re same 

SIR 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

 2.80  $1,249.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Megan Greaves $610.00 0.10 $61.00

 Sharni Robinson $440.00 2.70 $1,188.00

  2.80 $1,249.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $1,249.00

 $1,249.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $1,373.90 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 July 2022     Due Date: 25 July 2022 
 

506506



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited
ABN 21 105 657 949
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street
Melbourne VIC 3000
. 
PO Box 523
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne
. 
T : 03 9605 2700
F : 03 9258 9600

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11-07-2022 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 10, 456 Lonsdale Street 
MELBOURNE VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 February 2022 to 28 February 2022 

by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, implementation or 
administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme Court of Victoria in 
the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $6,292.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $0.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $629.20 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $6,921.20 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
01-Feb-22 Conference, M Greaves and S Robinson re 

preparation for brief to J White, costs assessor, 
estimate of future costs and considerations for 
potential further distribution to group members 

SIR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

01-Feb-22 Conference, M Greaves and S Robinson re 
preparation for brief to J White, costs assessor, 
estimate of future costs and considerations for 
potential further distribution to group members 

MYG 0.30 $610.00 $183.00

01-Feb-22 Reviewing materials in preparation for conference 
and drafting filenote from same 

SIR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

02-Feb-22 Reviewing costs extract and drafting note to J 
White, costs assessor 

SIR 0.90 $440.00 $396.00

04-Feb-22 Drafting memorandum re process for completing 
a low-cost distribution 

SIR 1.00 $440.00 $440.00

04-Feb-22 Reviewing costs extract for December 2021 and 
January 2022 and further updating note to J 
White, costs assessor 

SIR 1.30 $440.00 $572.00

07-Feb-22 Considering and calculating future costs and 
potential amounts remaining for further 
distribution 

SIR 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

07-Feb-22 Drafting memorandum re process for potential 
further distribution 

SIR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

08-Feb-22 Drafting estimate of costs, updating note to J 
White, costs assessor re future costs, email to S 
Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re final invoice, 
reviewing note re GST position, email to A 
Watson re settling of confidential note to J White, 
cost assessor and memorandum re process for 
further distribution 

SIR 1.50 $440.00 $660.00

10-Feb-22 Finalising memorandum re process for potential 
low cost distribution, emails to/from A Watson re 
note to J White, costs assessor, and 
memorandum and scheduling meeting for same 

SIR 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

10-Feb-22 Drafting email to J White, costs assessor, re brief 
for costs report 

SIR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

10-Feb-22 Perusing and considering brief to J White, costs 
assessor and memorandum re potential further 
distribution, email to M Greaves re same 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00

14-Feb-22 Collating documents and sending brief to J White, 
costs assessor, 

SIR 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

15-Feb-22 Conference, S Robinson and A Baghdadi, CA 
Project Support, re considerations and steps to 
affect a further distribution 

SIR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

15-Feb-22 Considering steps to affect a further distribution, 
email to A Baghdadi, CA Project support, re 
involvement and drafting filenote re same 

SIR 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

18-Feb-22 Reviewing filenote from S Robinson re estimate 
re future distribution and considering 
requirements re same 

MYG 0.40 $610.00 $244.00

510510
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount

 
18-Feb-22 Conference M Greaves and S Robinson re 

costing considerations for completing a further 
distribution 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

18-Feb-22 Conference, A Watson, T Vecchio, M Greaves 
and S Robinson re considerations for completing 
a further distribution and next steps re same 

SIR 0.40 $440.00 $176.00

18-Feb-22 Conference M Greaves and S Robinson re 
costing considerations for completing a further 
distribution 

MYG 0.10 $610.00 $61.00

18-Feb-22 Conference, A Watson, T Vecchio, M Greaves 
and S Robinson re considerations for completing 
a further distribution and next steps re same 

MYG 0.40 $610.00 $244.00

18-Feb-22 Drafting filenote re CA Project Support 
involvement with steps to further distribution, 
emails to A Watson, T Vecchio and M Greaves re 
same 

SIR 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

18-Feb-22 Reviewing affidavit material and account 
reconciliations to estimate costs for further 
distribution 

SIR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00

18-Feb-22 Conference, A Watson, T Vecchio, M Greaves 
and S Robinson re considerations for completing 
a further distribution and next steps re same 

AJW 0.40 $790.00 $316.00

18-Feb-22 Perusing and considering memorandum re 
further distribution 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00

21-Feb-22 Email to A Watson re process and costs for 
further distribution 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

21-Feb-22 Reviewing tax documents and account 
reconciliations and email to N Callen, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re outstanding tax 
liabilities and invoices 

SIR 0.50 $440.00 $220.00

21-Feb-22 Preparing costs estimate for further distribution, 
email to A Baghdadi, CA Project Support re 
group members statistics for same 

SIR 0.60 $440.00 $264.00

22-Feb-22 Reviewing email from N Callen, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re outstanding tax 
matters and estimate of tax costs 

SIR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

23-Feb-22 Emails from/to N Callen, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re tax liability and 
future costs 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00

24-Feb-22 Reviewing correspondence and materials 
provided to J White, costs assessor and 
attempted call to J White, costs assessor and 
voicemail left re same 

SIR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00

 13.20  $6,292.00
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 0.80 $632.00

 Megan Greaves $610.00 1.20 $732.00

 Sharni Robinson $440.00 11.20 $4,928.00

  13.20 $6,292.00

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $6,292.00

 $6,292.00
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $6,921.20 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 11 July 2022     Due Date: 25 July 2022 
 

513513



  

Maurice Blackburn 
Offices in Victoria, Queensland, New South Wales, Australian Capital Territory, Western Australia, Northern Territory and South Australia 
mauriceblackburn.com.au 

 
. 
Maurice Blackburn Pty Limited 
ABN 21 105 657 949 
. 
Level 21 
380 La Trobe Street 
Melbourne VIC 3000 
. 
PO Box 523 
Melbourne VIC 3001 
DX 466 Melbourne 
. 
T : 03 9605 2700 
F : 03 9258 9600 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
05-04-2023 
Matter Ref 3052534 
Tax Invoice  
 
 
The Scheme Administrator 
Class Actions Dept 
Maurice Blackburn Lawyers 
Level 10, 456 Lonsdale Street 
MELBOURNE VIC 3000 
 
 
 
 
RE: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
TO: Administration costs and disbursements incurred for the period 1 September 2022 to 28 February 

2023 by the Scheme Administrator and Administration Staff in the preparation, testing, 
implementation or administration of the Settlement Distribution Scheme approved by the Supreme 
Court of Victoria in the matter of Rowe v Ausnet Services Pty Ltd & Ors (SCI 2012 04538) by Orders 
of 27 May 2015. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY OF AMOUNT DUE 

 
 
Total Professional Fees $17,168.00 AUD 

Total Disbursements $23,360.00 AUD 

Total GST Applied $4,052.80 AUD 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS DUE $44,580.80 AUD 

 
 
With Compliments 

 
 
 
 
MAURICE BLACKBURN PTY LTD 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
02-Sep-22 Collating PricewaterhouseCoopers invoices and 

other materials for J White, costs assessor and 
emails re same 

SIR 1.10 $440.00 $484.00 

06-Sep-22 Email from J White, costs assessor re further 
materials for costs report, collating materials and 
replied re same 

SIR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

07-Sep-22 Email to S Rooke, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
request for further documents for costs 
assessor's report 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

14-Sep-22 Attempted call and follow up email to 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re documents required 
for costs assessor 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

27-Sep-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re scheme 
closure (costs assessor, affidavits and workflow) 

KA 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

27-Sep-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re scheme 
closure (costs assessor, affidavits and workflow) 

SIR 0.40 $440.00 $176.00 

27-Sep-22 Drafting updated filenote to J White, costs 
assessor re costs of administration 

SIR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

27-Sep-22 Reviewing email from J White, costs assessor re 
various enquiries for finalising report to court; 
drafting response to same 

SIR 0.50 $440.00 $220.00 

29-Sep-22 Drafting filenote to J White, costs assessor re 
detailed estimate of costs for a further distribution 

SIR 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

29-Sep-22 Drafting updated filenote to J White, costs 
assessor re costs of administration 

SIR 1.00 $440.00 $440.00 

30-Sep-22 Email from S Robinson re draft response to costs 
assessor query 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

30-Sep-22 Reviewing and updating confidential filenotes (x2) 
to J White, costs assessor, initial review of 
supporting affidavit and email to S Robinson with 
updates and comments 

KA 0.80 $610.00 $488.00 

03-Oct-22 Reviewing and settling confidential note to J 
White, costs assessor re costs of further 
distribution 

SIR 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

03-Oct-22 Reviewing and finalising confidential note to J 
White, costs assessor; reviewing email from K 
Adey and replied re same 

SIR 0.70 $440.00 $308.00 

04-Oct-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re response 
to J White, costs assessor and response to query 
from Court 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

04-Oct-22 Email from S Robinson re material to costs 
assessor and email from Court re update 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

04-Oct-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re response 
to J White, costs assessor and response to query 
from Court 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

04-Oct-22 Drafting email to J White, costs assessor re 
further details required for costs report; finalising 
documents for same 

SIR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
04-Oct-22 Email from Supreme Court re update; drafting 

reply re same 
SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

07-Oct-22 Drafting amendments to affidavit of A Watson re 
conclusion of settlement administration, including 
review of confidential notes to costs assessor, 
previous correspondence and settlement 
distribution scheme 

KA 1.20 $610.00 $732.00 

07-Oct-22 Email to A Watson re draft affidavit and costs 
assessor report 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

07-Oct-22 Reviewing and amending draft affidavit of A 
Watson; email to K Adey re figures for same 

SIR 1.10 $440.00 $484.00 

07-Oct-22 Email to S Rooke, PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
request for materials for J White, costs assessor, 
re time spent 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

07-Oct-22 Perusing draft affidavit re finalisation of 
distribution 

AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

10-Oct-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re affidavit 
and cost assessor requests 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

10-Oct-22 Reviewing and updating amended affidavit of A 
Watson 

KA 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

10-Oct-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re affidavit 
and cost assessor requests 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

10-Oct-22 Reviewing email from J White, costs assessor, re 
further materials requested for costs assessor's 
report; emails to/from H Soley re same; email to 
S Rooke, PricewaterhouseCoopers re further 
request for details 

SIR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

10-Oct-22 Settling draft affidavit re finalisation of distribution AJW 1.10 $790.00 $869.00 

11-Oct-22 Conferences, K Adey and S Robinson (x 2) re 
affidavits and confidential notes for J White, costs 
assessor 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

11-Oct-22 Reviewing and updating affidavits and 
confidential notes to J White, costs assessor and 
email to A Watson re same 

KA 0.60 $610.00 $366.00 

11-Oct-22 Emails to/from K Adey re updating affidavits and 
confirming calculations; emails from A Watson re 
feedback on same 

SIR 0.60 $440.00 $264.00 

11-Oct-22 Conferences, K Adey and S Robinson (x 2) re 
affidavits and confidential notes for J White, costs 
assessor 

SIR 0.20 $440.00 $88.00 

12-Oct-22 Email to J White, costs assessor, re affidavits, 
confidential notes and PricewaterhouseCoopers' 
invoices 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

12-Oct-22 Email to A Watson and K Nishimura re affidavits 
and update to J White, costs assessor 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

12-Oct-22 Email from K Adey re GST calculations in 
confidential notes to J White, costs assessor; 
email from K Adey re update to John White, costs 
assessor 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

12-Oct-22 Perusing revised proposed affidavit AJW 0.20 $790.00 $158.00 

518518



 

Page 6 of 13 

 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
12-Oct-22 Amending affidavit and confidential note to 

include GST on future costs, recalculate figures 
for settlement and distribution 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

14-Oct-22 Emails to/from PricewaterhouseCoopers with 
invoices for costs assessor, email to J White, 
costs assessor attaching invoices for costs report 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

14-Oct-22 Emails from S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers 
and K Adey re additional materials J White, costs 
assessor's report 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

21-Oct-22 Emails to/from PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
invoices for J White, costs assessor 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

21-Oct-22 Emails to/from S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers 
re delivery of invoices for J White, costs assessor 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

21-Oct-22 Emails S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers and K 
Adey re materials required for costs report 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

24-Oct-22 Emails x 2 from PricewaterhouseCoopers re 
materials for costs assessor, reviewing materials 
and email to J White, costs assessor re same 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

24-Oct-22 Emails from S Rooke, PricewaterhouseCoopers 
and K Adey re costs letter for costs assessor and 
reviewing same 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

27-Oct-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re J White, 
costs assessor's request for 
PricewaterhouseCoopers information 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

27-Oct-22 Reviewing emails and materials from J White, 
costs assessor re additional 
PricewaterhouseCoopers information, telephone 
call to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers, email 
to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re additional 
information 

KA 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

27-Oct-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re J White, 
costs assessor request for 
PricewaterhouseCoopers information 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

27-Oct-22 Reviewing emails and materials from J White, 
costs assessor re additional 
PricewaterhouseCoopers information, telephone 
call to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers, email 
to S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers re additional 
information 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

28-Oct-22 Telephone call to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re additional materials 
for costs assessor 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

02-Nov-22 Reviewing email from J White, costs assessor, re 
additional documents required for costs report 
and correspondence with K Adey re same 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

03-Nov-22 Email from J White, costs assessor re additional 
information for costs assessment 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

03-Nov-22 Reviewing and attending to requests for 
additional information from J White, costs 
assessor 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

519519
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
04-Nov-22 Request from J White, costs assessor - review 

bulk mail out and affidavit materials and 
instructions on next steps, review requested 
material on confidential tax notes and consider 
and prepare note for meeting with A Watson 

KA 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

04-Nov-22 Emails to/from S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers 
re outstanding information for cost assessor 
report 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

04-Nov-22 Conference, A Watson and K Adey re costs 
assessor requests and preparation of annexure 
for affidavits 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

04-Nov-22 Conference, A Watson and K Adey re costs 
assessor requests and preparation of annexure 
for affidavits 

AJW 0.10 $790.00 $79.00 

09-Nov-22 Emails to/from J White, costs assessor re 
additional information for report 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

10-Nov-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re 
additional requests for information from J White, 
costs assessor re costs of potential future 
distribution 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

10-Nov-22 Email to PricewaterhouseCoopers following up 
on request from J White costs assessor for Excel 
spreadsheets. reviewing records from 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re GST advice, email to 
J White, costs assessor re 
PricewaterhouseCoopers invoices 41107995 and 
42053887 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

10-Nov-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re 
additional requests for information from J White, 
costs assessor re costs of potential future 
distribution 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

10-Nov-22 Emails to/from J White, costs assessor re 
updated costs estimate 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

10-Nov-22 Emails to/from J White, costs assessor re email 
to J White re Exhibit AJW-1 and attendances to 
collate material 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

10-Nov-22 Email from J White, costs assessor re estimate 
for second distribution, reviewing and updating 
budget, reviewing and updating calculations in 
Confidential Note to Special Costs Referee and 
draft affidavit of A Watson 

KA 0.80 $610.00 $488.00 

11-Nov-22 Reviewing and amending calculations in note to 
special referee on costs of further distribution and 
affidavit of A Watson in support of application for 
costs 

SIR 0.30 $440.00 $132.00 

11-Nov-22 Finalising amendments to affidavit and Special 
note and email to S Robinson re same 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

11-Nov-22 Telephone call to S Reed, 
PricewaterhouseCoopers re cost assessor 
requests 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
11-Nov-22 Emails to/from S Reed, PricewaterhouseCoopers 

re excel spreadsheets, review spreadsheets, 
finalise and send email to J White, costs 
assessor re PricewaterhouseCoopers invoice 
41107995 and 42053887 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

11-Nov-22 Email from S Robinson re affidavits and note to 
costs assessor, finalise documents and email 
same to J White, costs assessor 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

14-Nov-22 Attendance re matters to be included in Special 
Note on Tax (Annexure to affidavit of A Watson) 

KA 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

15-Nov-22 Conference, K Adey and J Bitzer re Confidential 
Note on Tax 

JB 0.10 $250.00 $25.00 

15-Nov-22 Preparing chronology for Confidential Note on 
Tax, including reviewing source documents (court 
materials, orders and time records) 

JB 1.50 $250.00 $375.00 

15-Nov-22 Conference, K Adey and J Bitzer re Confidential 
Note on Tax 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

15-Nov-22 Email to J Bitzer re instructions re preparing 
chronology for affidavit 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

15-Nov-22 Drafting amendments to Special Note on Tax KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

16-Nov-22 Preparing chronology for Confidential Note on 
Tax, including reviewing source documents (court 
materials, orders and time records) 

JB 0.90 $250.00 $225.00 

16-Nov-22 Further drafting Special Note on Tax, including 
review of previous Maurice Blackburn invoices 
and WIP to determine key activities for inclusion 

KA 0.70 $610.00 $427.00 

17-Nov-22 Preparing chronology for Confidential Note on 
Tax, including reviewing source documents (court 
materials, orders and time records) 

JB 1.00 $250.00 $250.00 

17-Nov-22 Reviewing source materials re GST aspects and 
update confidential note to costs assessor, 
update Note and email to A Watson re next steps 

KA 0.60 $610.00 $366.00 

23-Nov-22 Finalising Confidential Note on Tax and email to 
H Soley with instructions 

KA 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

24-Nov-22 Review multiple emails and messages from H 
Soley re annexures for Confidential Note on Tax, 
review annexures and update confidential note, 
email to H Soley with instructions to finalise 

KA 0.40 $610.00 $244.00 

24-Nov-22 Finalise Confidential Note on Tax and 
attachments and sending same to J White, costs 
assessor 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

05-Dec-22 Email from J White re confidential note on tax, 
review and update note and email J White re 
same 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

05-Dec-22 Email to/from J White re amendments to Special 
Note to Costs Referee 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

14-Dec-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re costs 
assessor request for stack graphs 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

14-Dec-22 Email to/from J White re further information for 
costs report 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

521521



 

Page 9 of 13 

 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
14-Dec-22 Email to S Reed, PwC re request for information 

from costs assessor 
KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

14-Dec-22 Email to/from H Soley requesting information to 
respond to J White's request for information 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

14-Dec-22 Conference, K Adey and S Robinson re costs 
assessor request for stack graphs 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

15-Dec-22 Email from H Soley with PwC information, email 
to J White (costs assessor) re same 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

15-Dec-22 Attendance to collate materials for affidavit and 
instructions to J Bitzer re next steps to finalise 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

15-Dec-22 Email from H Soley re MDI Stack graphs, review 
and reply re same 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

15-Dec-22 Reviewing billing reports April 2019-Feb 2022 to 
prepare Stack Graphs 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

15-Dec-22 Email to J White re Stack Reports KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

15-Dec-22 Reviewing email from H Soley re stacked graph 
data update, then reviewing the issues, and 
updating accordingly 

SNF 0.30 $240.00 $72.00 

19-Dec-22 Email from J White re invoices, liaise H Soley re 
invoices, locate and sending same to J White 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

19-Dec-22 Email from J White 14/12/2022 regarding counsel 
invoices for PwC invoices 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

20-Dec-22 Preparing affidavit for finalisation and collation - 
collecting relevant materials and lenghty email of 
instruction to H Soley 

KA 0.30 $610.00 $183.00 

21-Dec-22 Preparing Annexure to Affidavit of A Watson re 
second distribution and charitable donations. 

JB 0.40 $250.00 $100.00 

21-Dec-22 Email from S Reed, PwC re invoice for costs 
assessment assistance, reply re same and email 
to H Soley to arrange payment 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

22-Dec-22 Attendance on research on charities for affidavit KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

22-Dec-22 Preparing Annexure to Affidavit of A Watson re 
second distribution and charitable donations 

JB 0.90 $250.00 $225.00 

04-Jan-23 Email from J White re additional material for 
Costs Report (Counsel invoices from 2017/18 re 
PwC invoices), instructions to T Fenech to locate 
materials 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

04-Jan-23 Review research note for confidential note on 
donation recipients, review additional materials 
and reports on Australian Red Cross, prepare 
confidential note and affidavit exhibit, email to H 
Soley to prepare affidavit 

KA 0.70 $610.00 $427.00 

09-Jan-23 Emails to/from T Fenech attaching counsel fee 
slips, review invoices to confirm completeness, 
email to J White regarding counsel fee slips and 
changes to affidavit 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

10-Jan-23 Review email and attachments from H Soley - 
affidavits 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

522522
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 Professional Fees 

Date Details Oper Units Rate Amount 

 
11-Jan-23 Email to/from J White re counsel feeslips and 

email to S Reed (PwC) re counsel fee slips and 
requirements, email to H Soley re affidavits to 
confirm changes made 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

11-Jan-23 Email to/from H Soley re Affidavit Exhibits and 
email to PwC seeking transcript 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

11-Jan-23 Email from S Reed with transcript, email to H 
Soley with instructions to update affidavit 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

20-Jan-23 Email to/from S Reed (PwC) re counsel fee slips 
for costs report 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

25-Jan-23 Emails to/from J White re invoices from PwC, 
follow up to PwC 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

27-Jan-23 Emails to/from S Reed (PwC) re requirements for 
costs assessor 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

31-Jan-23 Email to/from S Reed re costs assessor 
information, review and request for information in 
tranches to progress 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

02-Feb-23 Conference, K Adey, E Mukherji and S Robinson 
re steps to finalise administration and reporting to 
court 

SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

02-Feb-23 Conference, K Adey, E Mukherji and S Robinson 
re steps to finalise administration and reporting to 
court 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

02-Feb-23 Conference, K Adey, E Mukherji and S Robinson 
re steps to finalise administration and reporting to 
court 

ELM 0.10 $720.00 $72.00 

13-Feb-23 Email to/from J White and to/from S Reed (PwC) 
re invoices and next steps 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

15-Feb-23 Email to/from S Reed (PwC) with final invoices, 
review, email same to J White 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

23-Feb-23 Telephone calls with J White (x 2) re missing fee 
slips, instructions to T Fenech to contact clerk, 
email to J White with fee sllips 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

24-Feb-23 Email from K Adey re finalisation of costs report SIR 0.10 $440.00 $44.00 

24-Feb-23 Email to/from J White re McInerney invoice, 
emails to/from T Fenech to obtain invoices 

KA 0.10 $610.00 $61.00 

28-Feb-23 Final review of affidavits and attachments, email 
to H Soley with amendments 

KA 0.20 $610.00 $122.00 

 33.40  $17,168.00 

523523
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Professional Fees Summary 

 Rate Units Amount 

 
 Andrew Watson $790.00 1.60 $1,264.00 

 Elizabeth Mukherji $720.00 0.10 $72.00 

 Jacob Bitzer $250.00 4.80 $1,200.00 

 Kim Adey $610.00 16.80 $10,248.00 

 Sharni Robinson $440.00 9.80 $4,312.00 

 Steven Feng $240.00 0.30 $72.00 

  33.40 $17,168.00 

 
 
Professional Fees-Event 
Code Summary 

 Units Amount 

 
 
 
Professional Fees Summary 

 Professional Fees Subject to GST $17,168.00 

 $17,168.00 
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Disbursements 

Date Details Amount 

 
 
Disbursements Subject to GST 
30-Jun-2022 Expert Fees - PricewaterhouseCoopers - invoice 42053887 $15,660.00 

21-Dec-2022 Expert Fees - PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 42112395 $5,700.00 

27-Mar-2023 Expert Fees - PricewaterhouseCoopers - Invoice 43026304 $2,000.00 

 $23,360.00 

 
 
Disbursement Summary 

 Disbursements Subject to GST $23,360.00 

 $23,360.00 
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TERMS OF PAYMENT: Payment to be made within 14 days of the date of the Tax Invoice 
 
 

Methods of Payment 
By Cheque: 
Please make all cheques payable to Maurice Blackburn and send them, together with this letter as Remittance 
Advice, to your nearest office indicating Invoices included in payment  
  
By Direct Debit:  
Payment should be made to ANZ Bank, BSB: 013 006, Account No. 837640245. Please ensure your Client Ref is 
quoted on all communication with the bank and send your Remittance Advice indicating Invoices included in 
payment. 
 
Credit Card by Phone: 
Please call (03) 9605 2700 
 
We thank you in advance for your attention to this detail. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

By Credit Card: 
Please complete the following details and return this form to our office 
 
Circle Card: Visa - Mastercard 
 
Card Number: 

                
 
Exp Date: 

  /   
 
 
Card Holder : _______________________________________ 
 
Signature : _____________________________________ 
 
 
Matter No: 3052534    Regarding: Murrindindi Settlement Admin: General 
 
Invoice Number:      Amount Due: $44,580.80 AUD 
 
Invoice Date: 05 April 2023     Due Date: 19 April 2023 
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PROCESS AND ESTIMATED COSTS OF COMPLETING A FURTHER DISTRIBUTION TO 
GROUP MEMBERS 

This note outlines the steps required to be taken by Maurice Blackburn to complete a further 
distribution to group members of the residual settlement funds that will remain in the settlement 
administration accounts after payment of all costs.  

After consideration of the steps involved, we prepared an estimate of the total costs we expect 
would be incurred in completing a further distribution. 

PROCESS OVERVIEW 
 
1. CALCULATION OF FURTHER DISTRIBUTION AMOUNT 

(a) We propose that all group members receive an equal proportion of the residual 
settlement amount rather than on a pro-rata of loss basis. This will reduce the 
overall costs of the distribution by simplifying the complexity of calculations 
required to distribute on a pro-rata basis. 

(b) We have considered the time of an IT Consultant and Data Administrator to 
assist with preparing the group member data and completing the simplified 
calculations. 

2. COLLECTING GROUP MEMBER BANK DETAILS 

(a) After calculating group members distribution entitlements, we would need to 
contact all group members, advising them of the payment amount and seeking 
bank account details for payment. 

(b) Due to the passage of time since the last group member communication and 
payment, we expect we will need to communicate with group members by a 
combination of email, post and SMS. We also expect a considerable amount of 
time being spent to follow up any undelivered emails or mail. 

(c) We have accounted for the time required by Paralegals to respond to enquiries 
generated by the mail out, including assisting group members in navigating the 
online bank details portal, following up undelivered emails and mail, in addition to 
answering general enquiries. We have also taken into account the time required 
by a Lawyer to draft the correspondence and deal with any escalated and 
complex enquiries. Finally, we have accounted for time required by a Legal 
Assistant to oversee the postal mail out of relevant documents. 

3. PROCESSING PAYMENT 

(a) We have accounted for the time taken by a Lawyer to review and audit bank 
details and create payment schedules for processing. 

4. FOLLOWING UP ON BOUNCED PAYMENTS 

(a) We have accounted for a buffer of 10% to account for the work involved in 
following up bounced and failed payments. 
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ESTIMATE OF COSTS 

5. Our costs estimate has been prepared based on the approved hourly rates.  

KILMORE  

6. Disbursements 

We estimate postage costs of $3,200 (excl GST). This is based on the number of group 
members who require notice via post (808) and a previous quote from Law Image for the 
most recent mail out completed on 13/11/2020. 

7. Professional Fees 

Our estimated for professional fees are $202,529.80 (incl GST). These fees are based 
upon the expectation that we would require 10 weeks to complete the steps outlined in 
this note to complete a redistribution, and that two full time Paralegals would be required 
to service the 5,000 group members in this matter. 

 

Tasks 
Fee earner 
title FTE Allocation Net days 

Chargeable 
hours 
(@6.5) 

Charge rate 
(ex GST) Fees (ex GST) 

1. Calculation 
of distribution 
amounts 
2. Notice to 
group 
members of 
Distribution 
3. Collection 
of Bank 
Details 
4. Audit of 
bank details  
5. Processing 
payments  
6. Ongoing 
GM enquiries  

Principal / SC 
/ Settlement 
Claims 
Manager 
(>15 yrs) 

1.0 2% 1 7 $ 790 $5,530 

Special 
Counsel 0.0 0% 0 0 $ 720 $           - 

Senior 
Associate 0.0 0% 0 0 $ 610 $           - 

Associate 0.0 0% 0 0 $ 540 $           - 

Lawyer 1.0 25% 13 81 $ 440 $35,640 

Trainee 
Lawyer / Law 
Graduate 

0.0 0% 0 0 $ 350 $           - 

Paralegal / 
Law Clerk 2.00 100% 80 520 $ 240 $124,800 

Lit Tech 
Consult / 
Data Analyst / 
Legal 
Engineer 

1.0 1% 1 3 $ 240 $720 

Legal 
Assistant 1.0 1% 1 3 $230 $690 

   94 611 TOTAL $167,380 
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Tasks 
Fee earner 
title FTE Allocation Net days 

Chargeable 
hours 
(@6.5) 

Charge rate 
(ex GST) Fees (ex GST) 

1. Managing 
failed 
payments 
2. Re-
processing 
failed 
payments as 
required  
3. Managing 
unclaimed 
funds  

     

Plus 10% 
buffer for 
additional 
expenses in 
following up 
failed 
payments 

$16,738 

    TOTAL Professional Fees (ex GST) $184,118 

    TOTAL Professional Fees (incl GST) $202,529.80 

8. Total Cost 

Total estimated cost of completing a further distribution in Kilmore, disbursements plus 
professional fees, is $205,729.80 (incl GST). 

MURRINDINDI 

9. Disbursements 

We estimate postage costs of $800.00 (excl GST). This is based on the number of group 
members who require notice via post (184) and a previous quote from Law Image for the 
most recent mail out completed on 13/11/2020. 

10. Professional Fees 

Our estimated for professional fees $127,025.80(incl GST). These fees are based upon 
the expectation that we would require 10 weeks to complete the steps outlined in this 
note to complete a redistribution, and that one full time Paralegal would be required to 
service the 2,000 group members in this matter. 

 

Tasks Fee earner 
title FTE Allocation Net days 

Chargeable 
hours 
(@6.5) 

Charge rate 
(ex GST) 

Fees (ex 
GST) 

1. Calculation 
of distribution 
amounts 
2. Notice to 
group 
members of 
Distribution 
3. Collection 
of Bank 
Details 
4. Audit of 
bank details  
5. Processing 
payments  
6. Ongoing 
GM enquiries  

Principal / SC 
/ Settlement 
Claims 
Manager (>15 
yrs) 

1.0 2% 1 7 $ 790  $5,530 

Special 
Counsel 0.0 0% 0 0 $ 720  $           -    

Senior 
Associate 0.0 0% 0 0 $ 610  $           -    

Associate 0.0 0% 0 0 $ 540  $           -    
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Tasks Fee earner 
title FTE Allocation Net days 

Chargeable 
hours 
(@6.5) 

Charge rate 
(ex GST) 

Fees (ex 
GST) 

 

Lawyer 1.0 25% 13 81 $ 440  $35,640  

Trainee 
Lawyer / Law 
Graduate 

0.0 0% 0 0 $ 350  $           -    

Paralegal / 
Law Clerk 1.0 100% 40 260 $ 240   

 $62,400    

Lit Tech 
Consult / Data 
Analyst / 
Legal 
Engineer 

1.0 1% 1 3 $ 240  $720  

Legal 
Assistant 1.0 1% 1 3 $230 $690 

      54 351  TOTAL   $ 104,980  
1. Managing 
failed 
payments 
2. Re-
processing 
failed 
payments as 
required  
3. Managing 
unclaimed 
funds      

Plus 10% 
buffer for 
additional 
expenses in 
following up 
failed 
payments 

$10,498 

    TOTAL Professional Fees (ex GST) $ 115,478 
    TOTAL Professional Fees (incl GST) $127,025.80 

11. Total Cost 

Total estimated cost of completing a further distribution in Murrindindi, disbursements 
plus professional fees, is $127,825.80(incl GST). 
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The Marysville and Triangle Community Foundation was formed to continue the recovery process
after Australia’s worst natural disaster, the 2009 bushfires.
The establishment of the community foundation has been aided significantly by funds from the
Victorian Bushfire Appeal Fund (VBAF). VBAF raised $401 million, including interest, with about 80%
of this allocated to individuals and families. The remaining funds were assigned directly to
community recovery projects.

In order to allocate the remaining funds, the VBAF established a Community Advisory Committee
made up of representatives of the bushfire affected areas. Community groups and individuals from
the Marysville and Triangle areas were invited to put forward proposals for the use of this money. A
public meeting organized by the Marysville and Triangle Community Advisory Committee
representatives was held in Marysville in July 2011. Community members presented a number of
initiatives, with a large majority supporting the establishment of a community foundation aimed to
provide continued assistance to the rebuilding and recovery.

Since that time, the Marysville and Triangle communities have formed the Marysville and Triangle
Community Foundation which is now a registered community foundation.

The foundation has been granted $1million from the VBAF to provide benefits, not just for Marysville
and surrounding communities, but for the wider Murrindindi Shire area by delivering services, making
grants and undertaking community leadership and partnership activities.

Three inaugural board members commenced the process of establishing the foundation in November
2012. Recruitment for new board members started in January 2013 and an information session was
held in April 2013. The new team of board members met in June and then held a strategic planning
session in July 2013 to develop a strategic approach to its formation, governance fundraising and
granting roles.

The Executive Officer role commenced on 4 February 2014.

The board will look to establish other trusts for the long term benefit of the community.
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Our Impact Areas

As a Community Foundation, we exist to ensure funds received are directed to
local projects that provide tangible benefits to local communities. At Foundation
Murrindindi, we have identified 5 key impact areas to support community led
initiatives. These are the pillars that drive what we do and give us clarity of
purpose in our organsiation.
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Our Impact

For local communities to thrive, they need active, well-resourced
community groups, all working toward a common vision for the
community.

We believe that people living in the
Murrindindi Shire are best-placed to
know what projects will make the
biggest difference in their communities.
That’s why we invite applications from
local community groups. As at 30 June
2021, we have awarded nearly
$750,000 in grants to community groups
across the Murrindindi Shire.

The impact of the funding we allocate to
these community groups goes far
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beyond simply the item or activity funded.

For example, funding solar panels for a community facility actually helps to
enable a sustainable future for a vital community meeting space. A cultural
festival may be a fun event for attendees, but it also helps create positive
connections between local residents – strengthening what’s called the ‘social
fabric’ – in addition to bringing in visitors, which helps strengthen the economy.

Read more about what local groups are achieving with a little help from our
grants in the Project Outcomes section of this site.

You can also read about our overall impact in our Annual Report.
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Growing our community – outdoor
broadcast vehicle (UGFM)

Murrindindi’s local radio station, UGFM, purchased a
Ford transit van to fit out as a mobile studio
(outdoor broadcast vehicle) to support, strengthen
and promote community events and activities
across the Shire.

Acheron Mechanics Institute – upgrade of
facilities

The Foundation supported an important project to
upgrade the only recreational facilities in Acheron.

Continuing our craft journey

Members of the Creative Triangle, formed in the
aftermath of the 2009 bushfires to create a space
where women could gather and connect and share
their recovery journeys, were supported to attend a
workshop to advance their skills.

Category Archives: Project Outcomes
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Flowerdale Recreation Reserve – upgrade
of facilities

Executive Officer, Robyn Hill, attended the opening
of the upgraded facilities at Flowerdale’s Spring
Valley Recreation Reserve on Australia Day.

Get Ready Day! 2019

Get Ready Day! 2019 What an amazing day at our
Get Ready! Event. Huge thanks to our local
emergency services teams, very willing as always to
share their knowledge. We learnt about CPR and
snakebite management, watched the SES
demonstrate their skills at a simulated live car cut
and rescue, learnt from Forest Fire Management […]

Murrindindi Youth (MY) Reflective Garden,
Alexandra Secondary College

Murrindindi Youth (MY) Reflective Garden, Alexandra
Secondary College Alexandra Secondary College’s
new garden is a quiet reflective space where
students can relax and enjoy the natural
environment. Funded through the Foundation’s
Bushfire Recovery Fund, the garden creates a sense
of belonging and connection to the school space.
Two factors that influence resilience are connection
and […]
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Improving mental health – Alexandra
Secondary College

Improving mental health – Alexandra Secondary
College This project supported the students of
Alexandra Secondary School by providing an on site
counsellor. A counsellor worked with students and
their families to improve their mental health and
day-to-day functioning. By helping young people to
develop positive mental health their learning
outcomes and contributions to community capacity
[…]

Community Fitness – Toolangi Castella
district community house

The aim of this project is to increase the fitness
and stamina of the participants in the Toolangi
Castella District Community House fitness group.

Singing for the Soul

Singing for the Soul Dr Jonathon Welch AM, and 60
members of his community choir – ‘THECHO!R’–
visited Alexandra on April 7 2019 to conduct a
singing workshop with local participants, then
participated in a free concert performance in the
afternoon for the general public involving all
members of THECHO!R and all local participants.
Funded […]

Telling our story – Alexandra Football and
Netball Club – production of
communication material

Telling our story – Alexandra Football and Netball
Club Production of communications material
Funding form the Foundation assisted the Alexandra
Football and Netball Club (AFNC) to tell their story,
in order to attract funds to help construct a
multipurpose community facility at the recreation
reserve. The recreation reserve was the main
staging area for fire […]

1  2  Next »
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Rivers and Ranges Community Leadership
Program

Rivers and Ranges Community Leadership Program
The overall aim of the Rivers and Ranges
Community Leadership Program (RRCLP) is to
increase the capacity and resilience of communities
by strengthening local leadership. The funding from
the MTCF provided the assistance to support two
individuals from Murrindindi Shire to attend the
RRCLP program. The program develops community
leadership […]

Girl Link transition program

Girl Link transition program Girlink is a transition
program for Grade 6 girls from the Cathedral
Cluster of primary schools in Alexandra, Marysville,
Buxton and Eildon. The program was a two-day
residential camp facilitated by staff and Year 11
students from the Alexandra Secondary College.
The aim of the camp was to build social bonds […]

Taggerty CFA – A Place to Think and Link

Taggerty CFA – A Place to Think and Link A new
aesthetically pleasing shelter and garden for
Taggerty CFA volunteers and community members
to gather will improve connectedness, health and
wellbeing. CFA members attend various types of
emergency incidents. They can be exposed to
traumatic, sometimes life-threatening events. This
presents an increased potential risk of […]
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2019 -  A YEAR IN REVIEW

As we spiral towards the end of 2019, it’s
timely to reflect on the year that’s been.
 
The year started in the same way that 2018
ended, busy with preparations to
commemorate the tenth anniversary of the
Black Saturday fires. An amazing group of
volunteers were supported by the Foundation
to organise a “Thank you” day in Alexandra.
This event was important to the communities
of the Marysville and Triangle area to
acknowledge the support that was received
from other communities, and to take the
opportunity to show that appreciation, ten
years on.

The commemorative event was held in
Marysville on 7 February; it was carefully
planned based on the feedback received
about how this event should be respectfully
remembered. The commemorative event was
designed so that people could choose how
they would like to be
involved, or not to be if that was the case. It
was an emotional time, and the
commemoration an important milestone.
Surrounding these events was an enormous
amount of background work with the an
enormous amount of background work with
the media, politicians, mental health support
services, state government and other key
stakeholders. The Foundation managed the
grants process around a number of
community projects, and has finally finished
the administration processes around this.

10540540



In March we opened our grant rounds for
2019, and closed them again in November.
Some interesting grants processed through
the year include Signing for the Soul (a
community singing workshop in Alexandra),
Marysville Jazz and Blues Weekend 2019,
community  garden at CH@T (Community Hub
at Taggerty), Marysville Marathon Festival,
and sponsorships for local events.

At the same time, the Foundation
commenced a recruitment process, calling
for Expressions of Interest from people with
specific skill sets. We farewelled long
standing board members Jennifer Wood and
Clive Clayton, and more recent recruit
Howard Paix. Their presence on the Board
and the impact of their work with the
Foundation will leave a lasting legacy. In
October, we welcomed new Board members
David Hall, Charlotte Bisset, Brian Swersky
and Melinda Burgess.

Our work with the Boston Consulting Group
started in August, preparing a brief and
working together to develop the concept of
a renewed strategy for the economic
recovery of the Triangle area. This report
would reflect back on the original report
prepared by Boston Consulting Group in
2009, which was subsequently reviewed in
2011. The Foundation believes it is important
to consider the current economic prosperity
of the Triangle, and to look at strategies to
reinvigorate it. We look forward to the
release of the report in early 2020.

The Foundation worked with local emergency
services to hold a “Get Ready!” day in
Marysville in early November. The concept
was all about enabling accessibility to
information to help prepare for the summer
ahead, from bushfire safety; to managing
heat health, snake bite and how to use a
defibrillator; SES live car cut demonstration
and safety information; Forest Fire
Management information and Murrindindi
Shire Community Safety and Community
Planning display.
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We know that the best way to recover quickly
from an emergency is to be prepared
beforehand. Emergency preparedness
includes accessing the right information so
that you can put together a plan for your
household. A big thank you to the emergency
services groups who contributed to the
success of this day.

We wind up the year looking forward to 2020
and beyond. The Foundation is in a transition
phase, as we move from bushfire recovery to
a broader community development role. Our
future focus will be fundraising so that we
can continue to deliver our vision for a
vibrant, healthy and resilient future for the
communities of Murrindindi Shire.

To find out more about the Marysville and
Triangle Community Foundation, or to make a
donation,contact Executive Officer Robyn Hill
at robyn@marysvilletrianglefoundation.org.au
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2020 -  A YEAR IN REVIEW

What an extraordinary year 2020 has been. 

The year started with the Black Summer
bushfires, that raged across SE Australia. It
was a challenging time for many. Having been
through similar challenges 10 years ago, the
Foundation was able to connect and support
other community foundations that were
directly impacted by these bushfires. 

We were also able to facilitate the donation
of a ride on mower to the community of
Lucyvale in NE Victoria. The town was directly
impacted by the Black Summer bushfires and
put a call out for a ride on mower.  The
Foundation was able to source a used mower
and arrange delivery to Lucyvale. The
community were very grateful for this
generous donation.

In March we launched the Boston Consulting
Group Final Report. The report provides
strategies to create opportunities for
economic development of the Triangle area.
The report is available on the Foundation's
website. We will continue to work on
initiatives identified in the report in 2021.

No sooner had the fire season ended we were
thrown a new challenge of a global corona
virus pandemic. Working from home became
the new normal. The Foundation office closed
in late March and reopened again in late
November when Covid restrictions had eased.

Despite the new covid related challenges the
Foundation adapted and still continued to
deliver it's core work including 2 grant rounds.

13543543



Christmas in Marysville.  Funding new
Christmas decorations to bring festive
joy and promote community spirit in
Marysville.
Purchase of a defibrillator at
Narbethong. This is a asset that is
available to the whole community.
Publication of a Wildflowers of the
roadsides of Marysville booklet. A local
guide to wildflowers that will be
available for purchase from the
information and regional arts centre in
Marysville.
Purchase of an Ipad to enhance
mapping, weather and other fire
information on board the Acheron CFA
Tanker.
Supporting the youth space in
Marysville to finish essential works to
allow the space to open.
Upgrading Christmas decoration in
Buxton.
Creation of a fire-resistant
demonstration garden at Flowerdale
Primary School to educate on fire-wise
landscape design.
Support a two day camp for Grade 6
girls across the Cathedral cluster
(eastern side of Murrindindi Shire) as
part of the transition to secondary
school.
Purchase an automated external
defibrillator and remote access lighting
system for the Thornton CFA tanker. 

Our first grant round opened from March -
May. A second grant round was made
available from Aug - Oct. This was the final
year of grants being made from the
Bushfire Recovery Fund.

Successful grants this year included:

We congratulate all the successful grant
applications and look forward to seeing
the impacts and outcomes of these
funded projects in our community.
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We were fortunate to undertake some
strategic planning once covid restrictions
eased in November. We are at a pivotal
point in the development of the Foundation
and the facilitated strategic planning
session was essential to assist with
clarifying the transition from a fire recover
focus to a broader remit to meet the many
challenges and needs of the communities
across the Murrindindi Shire.  We look
forward to sharing with you in 2021 a new
name and branding to reflect this transition
of the Marysville and Triangle Community
Foundation.

To find out more about the Marysville and
Triangle Community Foundation, or to make a
donation,contact Executive Officer Robyn Hill
at robyn@marysvilletrianglefoundation.org.au

Giving Tuesday is a global day to promote
kindness and generosity in the community. It
happens annually on the first Tuesday in
December. Giving Tuesday encourages
people to show their generosity in a variety
of ways whether it’s helping a neighbour,
advocating for an issue, sharing a skill, or
giving to causes. Every act of generosity and
kindness counts and everyone has something
to give.  Kindness gives everyone the power
to make a positive change within their own
community. To celebrate Giving Tuesday, the
Marysville and Triangle Community
Foundation hosted a pop up stall in the main
street of Alexandra and gave out free water
bottles. It was a wonderful opportunity to talk
about what the Foundation does and also to
encourage everyone to give where and when
they can.

15545545



Our Vision
Thriving, vibrant and connected communities 

within the Shire of Murrindindi.



2021 - A YEAR IN REVIEW

2021 proved again to be a challenging year that required
much compassion and resilience to adapt to changing
circumstances.

This year was significant for the Foundation. After many
months of planning we relaunched the Foundation with a
new name and brand. In July we officially became known
as Foundation Murrindindi reflecting the Foundation’s
new focus on the future for communities of Murrindindi
Shire, beyond the lens of bushfire recovery. 

We also took time to revisit our strategic plan to ensure it
aligned with our new brand vision, mission and long term
goals for the Foundation. In doing this work we were able
to articulate the 5 key impact areas in which we work.
Foundation Murrindindi enables community to respond to
issues that matter most to them in order to build
thriving, vibrant and connected communities across the
Shire of Murrindindi. We support projects and initiatives
in 5 key impact areas; Youth Success, Building
Community Capacity, Community Health & Well-being,
Arts & Culture and Environment & Sustainability. 

When Covid restrictions finally eased in late 2021, we
were able to gather again in person with all staff and
board members to plan our 2022 calendar of projects,
programs and events. We are super excited to be
launching some new initiatives in the new year and have
some other exciting projects in the pipeline. We can't
wait to share these with you in the coming year and look
forward to increasing our impact across the Shire of
Murrindindi.

16546546



Our Impact

Triangle Community Development Fund Grant Program

Christmas in Marysville - upgrade Christmas
Decorations to celebrate a special time of year with
the community and visitors alike.
All abilities ramp - construction a disability ramp and
sliding door access at the Community Hub in Taggerty
to improve access for all community members.
Community Arts Winter Welcome Program - creation
of community mosaic art in the main street of
Marysville. 

Fawcett Muster - Community BBQ and celebration at
Fawcett Hall
Community Christmas Gathering - Christmas lunch on
Christmas Day at Embassy of Ideas in Alexandra
Resident Ipad - Purchase of an Ipad so residents of
Darlingford Nursing Home in Eildon can connect
virtually with their family and friends.
Tuesday Chat - purchase of outdoor table setting and
chairs to increase the functionality of the Tuesday
Chat community morning tea group in Marysville.
Eildon Twilight Market - support musical
entertainment at Christmas twilight market.
Christmas lunch at Flowerdale Community House

In 2021 we conducted 2 grant programs. We congratulate
all of the successful grant applications and look forward
to seeing the impacts and outcomes of these wonderful
funded projects in our community.

The Triangle Community Development Program will
support recovery and community projects in the
Marysville and Triangle region. 

Successful grant highlights include:

The Connecting Communities small grants program 
 supports community led projects and initiatives that help
communities to stay connected during the the pandemic
and beyond by reducing feelings of loneliness and
isolation, fostering community connections, increased
social participation and inclusion and enhances a sense of
belonging.

Successful grant highlights include:

Connecting Communities Small Grant Program

For information about the Foundation, visit our website at:
www://foundationmurrindindi.org.au/

17547547
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FOUNDATION MURRINDINDI LIMITED
Charity is registered. Charity reporting is up to date.

Charity details
Also known as: Marysville and Triangle Community Foundation

ABN: 23160630526

Address: 3/27 Murchison Street

Marysville

VIC, 3779, Australia

Email: info@foundationmurrindindi.org.au

Address For Service email: info@foundationmurrindindi.org.au

Website: foundationmurrindindi.org.au

Charity Size: Information unavailable

Who the charity helps: General community in Australia

Date established: 1 July 2012

Next report due: 31 December 2023

Financial year end: 30/06

Using the information on the Register

Information on the Charity Register has been provided to the ACNC by charities. If information is not shown, this may be because it has not yet been provided. The ACNC

may also approve information be withheld from the Charity Register in certain circumstances. Read more about information on the Charity Register.

People
Responsible people
The role of a 'Responsible Person' is an important one for registered charities. Generally, a charity's Responsible People are its board or committee

members, or trustees.

Documents

Anthony Thompson
Role: Deputy Chairperson

Associated charities

Brian Swersky
Role: Other

Associated charities

Charlotte Bisset
Role: Treasurer

Associated charities

Colin Davies
Role: Other

Associated charities

David Hall
Role: Other

Associated charities

Melinda Burgess
Role: Chairperson

Associated charities

Michael Fleming
Role: Other

Associated charities

Steven Coker
Role: Other

Associated charities
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Annual reporting

Title Due date Date received Download

Annual Information Statement 2024 31 December 2024 Not yet submitted —

Financial Report 2024 31 December 2024 Pending —

Annual Information Statement 2023 31 December 2023 Not yet submitted —

Financial Report 2023 31 December 2023 Pending —

Documents

Title Date Reporting year Download

Governing Document 30 May 2022 — Download

History
The charity's subtype history

Purpose Start date End date

Purposes beneficial to the general public that may reasonably be regarded as

analogous to, or within the spirit of, any of the other charitable purposes

1 July 2021 —

Registration status history

Effective date Status

1 July 2021 Registered

Enforcement action history

Enforcement action refers to the exercise of powers under the ACNC Act.

No enforcement actions.
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ABN last updated: 26 Jul 2022 Record extracted: 28 Apr 2023

ABN details

Entity name: FOUNDATION MURRINDINDI LIMITED

ABN status: Active from 17 Oct 2012

Entity type: Australian Public Company

Goods & Services Tax (GST): Not currently registered for GST

Main business location: VIC 3779

Australian Charities and Not-for-profits Commission (ACNC)

FOUNDATION MURRINDINDI LIMITED is registered with the Australian Charities and Not-for-profits
Commission (ACNC)  as follows:

ACNC registration From

Registered as a charity view ACNC registration 01 Jul 2021

ASIC registration - ACN or ARBN or ARSN or ARFN

160 630 526 View record on the ASIC website 

Charity tax concession status

FOUNDATION MURRINDINDI LIMITED is a Charity endorsed to access the following tax concessions:

Tax concession From

GST Concession 01 Jul 2021

Income Tax Exemption 01 Jul 2021

FBT Rebate 01 Jul 2021

Deductible gift recipient status

Not entitled to receive tax deductible gifts

Disclaimer

The Registrar makes every reasonable effort to maintain current and accurate information on this site.
The Commissioner of Taxation advises that if you use ABN Lookup for information about another entity
for taxation purposes and that information turns out to be incorrect, in certain circumstances you will
be protected from liability. For more information see disclaimer.

Current details for ABN 23 160 630 526
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Warning Statement

If you use ABN Lookup for information about a person or entity that provides financial or investment
products or advice, make sure they have an Australian Financial Services (AFS) licence. You can check
licenced professional registers here.
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